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NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM
FISCAL YEAR 2023-2024
OFFICIAL BID FORM
VENDOR: b
NOTE: BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS BID FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PER
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15 GAL GAL.
{ACH) PAILS No Bid
2 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000 GAL. GAL.
(ACH) BULK No Bid
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION {500 — 5,000 GALLON
Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric | Gal. deliveries)
Acid Preparation
NSF 60/ANSI No Bid
4 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION (500 — 5,000 GALLON
Other Prep Method Gal. deliveries)
Alternative Bid
NSF 60/ANSI No Bid
5 AMMONIA GAS 150 LB. LB.
CYLINDER No Bid
6 AMMONIUM SULFATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
No Bid
7 AMMONIIUM SULFATE 500 - 1,000 GAL,
{40% SOLUTION) Gal. deliveries No Bid
8 ANTHRACITE 60+ L BS. BAGS CUFT.
No Bid
9 AQUEOQUS AMMONIA 1,000 Gal. GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries No Bid
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30 GAL. DRUM GAL
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) No Bid
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11 CALCIQUEST QRTHO 15 GAL. DRUM GAL.
{(PHOSPHORIC ACID) No Bid
12 CALCIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
No Bid
13 CALCIUIM CHLORIDE SUPERSACK DRY LB.
No Bid
14 CALCIHUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/50 — 50 LBS
LBS BAGS No Bid
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE LESS THAN LBS
PALLET - 50 LBS
BAGS No Bid
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 551BS LBS
{Accu-Tab Blue SI by Fillion PAILS
Associates) No Bid
17 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 LBS. LBS.
{Accu-Tab SI by Axiall LLC) PAILS No Bid
18 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery DRY LB.
(40/50 Ib. bags) No Bid
19 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK {B.
No Bid
20 CARBON POWDERED BULK TON
No Bid
21 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK DRY LB.
No Bid
22 CAUSTIC SODA - SMALL BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 500 - 1,000
Gal. deliveries No Bid
23 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001 -5,000
Gal. deliveries No Bid
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION No Bid
25 CAUSTIC SODA - 275 GAL TOTE WET LB.
25 % SOLUTION No Bid
26 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK WET LB.
50% SOLUTION 500~ 1,500
Gal. deliveries
iverie No Bid
27 CAUSTICSODA - LARGE BULK
50% SOLUTION 1,501 - 6,000 WTLB.
Gal. deliveries No Bid
28 CHLORINE- DRY {HTH) 50 LB. PAILS DRY LB.
No Bid
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p/Gal.)

29 CHLORINE 1TON LB.
CYLINDER No Bid
30 CHLORINE 150 LB. LB.
CYLINDER No Rid
31 CITRIC ACID 50% 250 GALTOTE WET LB.
No Bid
32 CITRIC ACID 50% 55 GAL.DRUM WET LB.
No Bid
33 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 50LB DRY LB.
_ BAGS/PALLET No Bid
34a COPPER SULFATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
FINE#30 No Bid
34b COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
No Bid
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY LB.
.S ONLY 32%-38% No Bid
36 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38%
{Alternative Bid) No Bid
37 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK WET LB.
No Bid
38 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
No Bid
39 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% | 270 galton totes WET LB.
No Bid
40 LIME {(HYDRATED) 50 LB BAGS DRY LB,
2 ton min, No Bid
41 LIME SLURRY BULK PER TON
No Bid
42 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
{<15 PPM THC) No Bid
43 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
(<40 PPM THC) No Bid
A4 LIQUID POLYMER 775 GALTOTE |  $15.22/Gal. GAL.
CLARIFLOC NE-2427 ($1.78/Lb. x 8.55 [Lbs./Gal. = $15.2
45 LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS BULK WET LB.
8500 OR EQUAL) No Bid
46 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275 GAL TOTES GAL.
New ltem No Bid
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47 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK CU FT.
No Bid
48 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK CUFT.
' (alternate bid) No Bid
49 METHANOL (100%} 55 GAL DRUM GAL.
No Bid
50 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME BULK GAL.
(1,000 — 3,000)
gallon delivered No Bid
51 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55 GAL DRUM GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified No Bid
52 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 520 LB. DRUM 1B.
No Bid
53 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 4, 1-gallon jugs GAL
per box No Bid
54 MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK GAL.
(300-350 gal} No Bid
55 MURIATIC ACID - 20% 15 GAL. GAL.
CARBOY No Bid
56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME PUMPTED TOTE GAL.
{300-350 gal) No Bid
57 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50 LB PAILS LB.
NEW ITEM (CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL) No Bid
58 ORTHOPHQSPHATE 30 GAL GAL.
(CARUS 4500) DRUMS No Bid
59 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK LB.
(AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) {300-500 GAL) No Bid
60 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON i I.B.
{50%-50% Blend) DRUM No Bid
61 CRTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55 GALLON
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM LB.
(Aquamag or equal) No Bid
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON LB.
{309%-70% BLEND) DRUM No Bid
63 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55 GALLON 1B,
(10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM No Bid
64 POLYPHOSPHATE 340 LBS DRUM LB.
(STERLING CP-33) No Bid
65 PHOSPHATE {LIQUID) 30 GALLON GAL.
(SHANNON SLi 5225 OR CARUS DRUMS
8100) No Bid
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SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOCC-321
67 POLYMER (ANIONIC) 275 GAL. $11.44/Gal GAL
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTE ($1.30/Lb. x 8.8 Ibs./Gal. = $11.44 Gal)
68 POLYMER (CATIONIC) 275GAL. | $15.14/Gal. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTE ($1.75 x 8.65 Lbs./Gal. = $15.14/Gal.)
690 POYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL | $§15.22/Gal. GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTE  {($1.77/Lb. x 8.6 Iibs./Gal. = $15.22/Gal.)
70 POLYMER 55 GAL _ GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM $15.13/Gal.
($1.78/Lb. x 8.5 Iibs./Gal. = $15.13(Gal.)
71 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
75% SOLUTION No Bid
72 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL
{HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) No Bid
73 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275 GALTOTE GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) No Bid
74 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL.
[HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL}
No Bid
75 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE
{HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK GAL.
EQUAL) No Bid
76 SMALL BULK WET LB.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 400 -1,000 gal.
Deliveries No Bid
77 LARGE BULK WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 1,001 -5,000
Gal. Deliveries No Bid
78 BULK
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 800 - 1,500 gal WET LB
-shorter
wheelbase
delivery No Bid
79 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTE WET LB.
No Bid
80 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB,
No Bid
21 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 15 GAL. PAIL WET LB.
No Bid
82 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 LB. DRUM LB.
(U.5. ONLY) No Bid
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83 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330 1.B. DRUM LB.
{U.5. ONLY) No Rid
84 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB. PAILS LB.
{U.S. ONLY) No Bid
85 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 LB. DRUM LB,
{FOREIGN- Alternative Bid) No Bid
86 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330 LB. DRUM LB.
{FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) No Bid
87 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB. PAIS LB
{FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) No Bid
38 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK WET LB.
(AWWA B405 ~ LATEST) No Bid
89 SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK DRY LB,
(AWWA/NSF 60) No Bid
90 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) Full Truckload
Release No Bid
a1 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB,
(WASTEWATER ) Ful Truckioad
Release No Bid
92 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER) Per Pallet No Bid
93 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL+ No Bid
94 SODIUM BISULHTE- MINI-BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION < 800 GAL No Bid
95 SODIUM BISULFTE- 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
38% SOLUTION No Bid
a4 SODIUM 50 1BS BAGS DRY LB.
METABISULFITE (GRANULAR) 2 pallet deliv. No Bid
Q7 SODIUM CARBONATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LS,
SODA ASH- DENSE No Bid
98 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE No Bid
99 SODIUM CARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE No Bid
100 SODIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
No Bid
101 SCDIUM CHLORITE - BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY No Bid
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102 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY No Bid
103 SODIUM CHLORITE ~ 25% BULK WET LB,
FOREIGN (alternate bid) No Bid
104 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid)
No Bid
105 SODIUM CHLORITE — BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for
wastewater use only No Bid
106 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for
wastewater use only No Bid
107 SODIUM CHLORITE — 55 GAL DRUM DRY LB.
{SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID) No Bid
108 SODIUM FLUQRIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 40 BAG
PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS No Bid
109 SODIUM FLUQRIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
U.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50
LB, BAGS
No Bid
110 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG
(Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS No Bid
111 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50
(Alternative Bid) LB. BAGS No Bid
112 SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG PRY LB.
No Bid
113 Sodium Hexametaphosphate 55 GAL DRUM WET LB,
PRISTINE SK-7641 No Bid
114 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5% 250 GALTOTE WET LB.
No Bid
115 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 5 GAL CARBQOYS WET LB,
No Bid
116 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% 300-2,000 Gal. WET LB.
BULK No Bid
117 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% SMALL BULK
400 - 1,000 WET LB.
Gal. deliveries No Bid
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118 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% LARGE BULK
1,001 - 7,000 WET LB.
Gal. deliveries No Bid
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK
119 Certified Refrigerated Storage | (400-5,000 gal. WET LB.
and Delivery {Alternative Bid) deliveries) No Bid
120 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 55 GAL. DRUMS WET LB.
No Bid
121 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE -- 15% 275 GAL. WET.LB,
TOTE No Bid
122 SQDIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER No Bid
123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER No Bid
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 5 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER No Bid
125 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 1 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER No Bid
126 SODIUM PERMANGANATE 55 GAL DRUMS GAL.
No Bid
127 SODIUM SILUCOFLUORIBE 5O LB. BAG DRY LB.
No Bid
128 50DIUM THIOSULFATE (penta- 25 KG BAGS DRY KG.
hydrate) No Bid
129 SULFUR DIOXIDE BULK PER TON
No Bid
130 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275 TOTE PER GAL.
{30%) No Bid
131 ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB,
{V-937 OR EQUAL No Bid
132 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GALTOTE WET. LB.
{v-970 OR EQUAL) No Bid
133 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
{V-970 OR EQUAL) No Bid
134 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB,
No Bid
135 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 50 LB. PAIL DRY LB.
{CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL) No Bid
136 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL. DRUMS GAL.
(SHANNORN SLC 321 OR CARUS
3180) No Bid
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137 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GAL. GAL.
{SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTE
3180) No Bid
138 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 15-GAL PAIL GAL
{(CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL) No Bid

139 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB,
(5L1-932 OR EQUAL) No Bid

140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK ) WET LB.

{V-939 OR EQUAL) No Bid

141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WETLB.
(UPZ-511 OR EQUAL) No Bid

142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB,

(CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL) No Bid

143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(SLI-939 OR EQUAL) No Bid

144 Emergency Pumping and Storage Daily Fee: Chemicals that

Tanker to support temporary on- bulk pumping
site storage for utility that needs and storage
to repair containment vessel. N/A will support:
*145 Polymer Cationic 450 Lb. DRUM $15.14/Gal. GAL.

SNF Polydyne CLARIFLOC C-6227

PROPOSAL FROM:
Polydyne Inc.
1 Chemical Plant Road
Riceboro, GA 31323
Telephone: (800) 848-7659 Opt. 2 email: _ bids@poldyneinc,com

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium (NEMVCC) and our Host Community
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC,

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda: None

Lo AL S -

oyd(gtanley, Sr. Vice-Presid
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To Whom it May Concern:

in accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, ifwe hereby certify
that | am/we are, the only person (s) interested in this proposal as principal{s); that it is made without
collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the following prices.

SIGNATURES
Z'{ L= ya
Aut)(o riz!ﬁg Sighature

Boyd Stanley, Sr, Vice-Presiden
Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

3/20/23
Date

| certify under the penalty of perjury that |, to the best of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns

and paid all state taxes required under faw. ; )
//% é/LMyne Inc.
ﬁnt

| gtanley, Sr. Vice-Presi
<] —

By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable):

-

Mark Schiag, Vice-President
*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this certification clause is signed
by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must make arrangements to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be
assigned to the owner. The owner’s intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or
guarantees as part of the awarding procedure.
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POLYDYNE INC

CERTIFICATE OF RESOLUTIONS

I, Christopher J, Gannon, Secretary of Polydyne Inc., a Delaware corporation (the

“Company”), do hereby certify that at a duly called meeting of the Board of Directors of the
GCompany, held on January 8, 2020, the Board of Directors unanimously approved the following
Resolutions:

RESOLVED, that Boyd Stanley, René Pich, John Pittman, Mark Schiag, Bobby
Wise and Ken Luke be and hereby are authorized, empowered and directed to
bid, in the name of and on behalf of the Corporation, upon such municipal
projects as he may deem appropriate; and further

RESOLVED, that Boyd Stanley, René Pich, John Pittman, Mark Schlag, Bobby
Wise and Ken Luke be and hereby are authorized and empowered to execute
and deliver, in the name of and on behalf of the Corporation, all documents,
instruments, certificate, agreements and papers as he may deem advisable or
necessary or proper to effect the Corporation’s municipal bids or the
transactions contemplated thereby; and further

RESOLVED, that any Officer of the Corporation be and hereby is autharized
and empowered, and to the extent necessary or advisable, directed, to attest
the execution of any document executed pursuant to these resolutions, and to
affix the seal of the Corporation thereto, and to certify under seal to any
municipality the adoption of these resolutions; and further

RESOLVED, that the authorizations granted under these Resolutions shall
continue in full force and effect until successors to the foregoing
representatives of the Corporation shall have been duly appointed or until the
death, resignation or removal of each such representative.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the undersigned has signed this Certificate of Resolutions with

effect this 8" day of January 2020.

P,

: h‘éf‘ J. GanVon, Secretary

I attest the authenticity of this copy of the Resolution of the Board of Directors. This resolution is still valid
and in effect as of date signed.

Mark S'chlag o
Vice President Finance, Assistant-Secretary & T'reasurer
Date: 3/20/2023



Federal Identification No.
State of Incorporation:
Date of Incorporation:

Administrative Offices:

Payment Address:

Polydyne Inc.
General Information

34-1810283

Delaware

August 21, 1995

P.O.

Box 279,

1 Chemical Plant Road
Ricebore, GA 31323

P.O.

Box 404642

Atlanta, GA 30384-4642

Board of Directors

[ John Pittman B
Officers
President T John Pittman ]
Secretary Christopher Gannon
VP-Finance, CFO, Treasurer & Agsistant Secretary Mark Schlag
Senior Vice President Boyd Stanley
Vice President Ken Luke |

*Authorized Signers-Non Officers

rBobby Wise [ Coniroller
Ownership Disclosure
Corporation Percent Ownership Owner |

Polydyne Inc, 100 SNF Holding Company

SNF Holding Company 100 SPCM SA

SPCM SA 100 Mr. René PICH holds
and/or controls 100% of the
shares of SPCM SA, a

company duly organized and
existing under the laws of
France, whose registered
office is in ZAC de Milieux,
Andrézieux, (42163),
FRANCE, registered under
the number 312 327 737 in
the Commercial Registry of
the town of Saint-Etienne
(42000), FRANCE.

Rev. 11/2022
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NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM

FISCAL YEAR 2023-2024

OFFICIAL BID FORM

DATE: March 20, 2023
VENDOR: (PVYS Chemical Solutions, Inc
10800 Harper Avenue, Detroit, Michigan 48213 313-921-120[0
NOTE: BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS BID FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PER
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15 GAL GAL.
{ACH) PAILS No Bid
2 ALUMINUM CHLORQHYDRATE 1,000 GAL. GAL.
(ACH) BULK No Bid
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK No Bid
SOLUTION {500 - 5,000 GALLON
Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric | Gal. deliveries)
Acid Preparation
NSF 60/ANS!
4 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK No Bid
SOLUTION {500 - 5,000 GALLON
COther Prep Method Gal. deliverias}
Alternative Bid
NSF 60/ANSI
5 AMMONIA GAS 150 LB. LB.
CYLINDER No Bid
6 AMMONIUM SULFATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
No Bid
7 AMMONHUM SULFATE 500 -~ 1,000 GAL.
{40% SOLUTION) Gal. deliveries | No Bid
g ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. BAGS CU.FT.
No Bid
9 AQUEQUS AMMONIA 1,000 Gal. GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries No Bid
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30 GAL. DRUM GAL.
{PHOSPHORIC ACID) No Bid
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11 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15 GAL, DRUM GAL.
{PHOSPHORIC ACID) No Bid
12 CALCIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
No Bid
13 CALCIUIM CHLORIDE SUPERSACK DRY LB,
No Bid
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/50 -50 LBS
_ LBS BAGS  |No Bid
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE LESS THAN No Bid LBS
4 PALLET - 50 LBS
BAGS
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 LBS No Bid LBS
{Accu-Tab Blue Si by Fillion PAILS
Associates)
17 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 LBS. LBS.
{Accu-Tab SI by Axiall LLC) PAILS No Bid
18 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery DRY LB,
(40/50 Ib. bags} | No Bid
19 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK LB.
No Bid
20 CARBON FOWDERED BULK TON
No Bid
21 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK ) DRY LB.
_ No Bid
22 CAUSTIC SQDA - SMALL BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 500 - 1,000
Gal. deliveries | No Bid
23 CAUSTIC SODA - LABGE BULK |No Bid WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001 - 5,000
Gal. deliveries
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION No Bid
25 CAUSTIC SODA - 275 GAL. TOTE WET LB.
25 % SOLUTION No Bid
26 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALLBULK | No Bid WET LB,
50% SOLUTION 500 -1,500
Gal. deliveries
27 CAUSTIC 50DA - LARGE BULX No Bid
50% SOLUTION 1,501 ~ 6,000 WTLB.
Gal. deliveries
28 CHLORINE- DRY (HTH) 50 LB, PAILS DRY LB.
No Bid
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24 CHLORINE 1TON LB.
CYLINDER No Bid
30 CHLORINE 150 LB. LB.
CYLINDER No Bid
31 CITRIC ACID 50% 250 GALTOTE WET LB.
No Bid
32 CITRIC ACID 50% 55 GAL.DRUM WET LB.
No Bid
33 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 50 LB DRY LB.
BAGS/PALLET [No Bid
343 COPPER SULFATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
FINE # 30 No Bid
34b COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
No Bid
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 32%-38% No Bid
36 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK No Bid DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38%
{Alternative Bid)
37 HYDROFLUGSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK WET LB.
No Bid
38 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
No Bid
39 HYDROFLUGQSILICIC ACID- 24% 270 gallon totes WET LB.
No Bid
40 LIME (HYDRATED} 50 LB BAGS DRY LB.
2 ton min. No Bid
41 LIME SLURRY BULK PER TON
No Bid
42 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
(<15 PPM THC} {No Bid
43 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
{<40 PPM THC} |No Bid
44 LIQUID POLYMER 275 GALTOTE GAL.
No Bid
45 LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE {CARUS BULK WET LB.
8500 OR EQUAL} No Bid
46 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275 GAL TOTES GAL
New ltem No Bid
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47 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK CUFT.
No Bid
48 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK CU FT.
{alternate bid} No Bid
49 METHANOL (100%) 55 GAL DRUM GAL.
No Bid
50 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME BULK GAL.
{1,000 - 3,000) )
gallon delivered | No Bid
51 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55 GAL DRUM GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified No Bid
52 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 520 LB. DRUM LB.
No Bid
53 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 4, 1-gallon jugs GAL
per box No Bid
54 MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK GAL.
(300-350 gal} | No Bid
55 MURIATIC ACID - 20% 15 GAL. GAL,
CARBOY No Bid
56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME PUMPTED TOTE GAL.
{300-350 gal} | No Bid
57 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE S50 LB PAILS LB.
NEW ITEM (CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL) No Bid
58 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL GAL.
{CARUS 4500) DRUMS No Bid
59 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK LB.
{AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) {300-500 GAL) |No Bid
60 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON LB.
{50%-50% Blend) DRUM No Bid
61 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55 GALLON
{50%-50% Blend) DRUM . LB.
{Aquamag or equal) No Bid
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON LB.
{30%-70% BLEND) DRUM No Bid
63 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55 GALLON LB.
{10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM No Bid
64 POLYPHOSPHATE 340 LBS DRUM LB.
{STERLING CP-33) No Bid
65 PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) 30 GALLON GAL.
{SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS DRUMS .
$100) No Bid
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66 POLYMER {MANNICH) BULK LB.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 No Bid
67 POLYMER (ANIONIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1520 TOTE No Bid
68 POLYMER (CATICNIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTE No Bid
69 POYMER {CATIONIC} 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTE No Bid
70 POLYMER 55 GAL GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM )
No Bid
71 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
75% SOLUTION No Bid
72 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) No Bid
73 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275 GAL TOTE GAL
{HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) No Bid
74 POLYALUMINUM CHLO_R!DE BULK No Bid GAL.
(HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL)
75 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE No Bid
(HOLLAND PCH 182 CR BULK GAL
EQUAL)
76 SMALLBULK | No Bid WET LB,
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 400 ~1,000 gal.
Deliveries
77 LARGE BULK No Bid WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE —45% 1,001 - 5,000
Gal. Deliveries
78 BULK No Bid
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE -45% 800 — 1,500 gal WETLB
- shorter
wheelbase
delivery
79 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTE WET LB.
No Bid
20 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
No Bid
21 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 15 GAL. PAIL WET LB.
No Bid
82 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 LB. DRUM LB,
(U.S. ONLY) |No Bid

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages { F¥ 2023-2024)

5 of 10 pages




83 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330 LB. DRUM LB.
{L1.5. ONLY) No Bid
84 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB, PAILS LB.
{U.S. ONLY) No Bid
85 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55LB. BRUM LB.
{FOREIGN- Alternative Bid) No Bid
86 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330 LB. DRUM LB.
{FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) No Bid
]7 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 51B. PAILS LB.
{FOREIGN - Alternative Bid} No Bid
88 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK WETLB.
(AWWA B405 - LATEST) No Bid
89 SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
{AWWA/NSF 60) No Bid
90 SODIUM BICARBONATE 501BS.BAG | Ng Bid DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60} Full Truckload
Release
91 SODIUM BICARBONATE 501BS.BAG | Ng Bid DRY LB.
{WASTEWATER ) Full Truckload
Release
g2 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB,
(WASTEWATER) Per Pallet No Bid
93 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL+ $0.1985
94 SODIUM BISULFITE- MINI-BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION <800GAL |No Bid
95 S0DIUM BISULFITE- 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
38% SOLUTION No Bid
96 S0DIUM 50 LBS BAGS DRY iB.
METABISULFITE (GRANULAR) 2 pallet defliv. {No Bid
97 SODIUM CARBONATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE No Bid
98 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE No Bid
Q9 SODIUM CARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE No Bid
100 SODIUM CHLORIDE 501B. BAG DRY LB.
No Bid
101 SODIUM CHLORITE - BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S, ONLY No Bid
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102 SODIUM CHLORI_TE- 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION - U.S. ONLY No Bid
103 SODIUM CHLORITE —~ 25% BULK WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) No Bid
104 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid)
No Bid
105 SODIUM CHLORITE ~ BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for .
wastewater use only No Bid
106 SODIUM CHELORITE- 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for )
wastewater use only No Bid
107 SODIUM CHLORITE — 55 GAL. DRUM DRY LB.
(SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID) No Bid
108 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL | No Bid DRYLB.
U.S. ONLY 40 BAG
PALLETS OF 50
, LB. BAGS
109 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL40BAG |No Bid DRY LB.
U.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50
|B. BAGS
110 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL | No Bid DRY LB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG
{Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS
111 SCDIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG No Bid DRY LB.
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50
{Afternative Bid) LB. BAGS
112 | SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE | 50LB. BAG DRY L.
No Bid
113 Sodium Hexametaphosphate 55 GAL DRUM WET LB,
PRISTINE 5K-7641 No Bid
114 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5% 250 GAL TOTE WET LB,
No Bid
115 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 5 GAL CARBOYS WET LB.
No Bid
116 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 300-2,000 Gal. WET LB.
BULK No Bid
117 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% SMALLBULK | No Bid
400 - 1,000 WET LB.
Gal. deliveries
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118 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% LARGE BULK
1,001 -7,000 . WET LB.
Gal. deliveries No Bid
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK
118 | certified Refrigerated Storage | {400-5,000 gal. , WET LB.
and Delivery (Alternative Bid) deliveries) No Bid
120 SODIUM HYPOQCHLORITE- 15% 55 GAL. DRUMS WET LB,
, No Bid
121 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% 275 GAL. WET.LB.
TOTE No Bid
122 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER | No Rid
123 SODIUM HYPQCHLORITE- 15% 15 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER  {No Bid
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 5 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER | No Bid 7
125 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 1 GAL. WET LB,
CONTAINER | No Bid
126 SODIUM PERMANGANATE 55 GAL DRUMS GAL.
No Bid
127 SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE 50LB. BAG DRY L8.
No Bid
128 SODIUM THIOSULFATE {penta- 25 KG BAGS DRY XG.
hydrate) No Bid
129 SULFUR DIOXIDE BULK PER TON
_ No Bid
130 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275 TOTE PER GAL.
(30%} No Bid
131 ZINC HEXAMETAPHQSPHATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
{V-937 OR EQUAL No Bid
132 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GAL TOTE WET. LB.
{V-970 OR EQUAL) No Bid
133 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
{V-970 OR EQUAL} No Bid
134 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
No Bid
135 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE SO LB. PAIL DRY LB,
{CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL) No Bid
136 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL. DRUMS GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS
3180) No Bid
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137 ZINC QRTHOPHOQSPHATE 275 GAL No Bid GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTE
3180}
138 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 15-GAL PAIL GAL
{CARUS 3180 OR £EQUAL) No Bid
139 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
{SLI-932 OR EQUAL) No Bid
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
{V-939 OR EQUAL} No Bid
141 ZINC ORTHOPHQSPHATE BULK WET LB.
{UPZ-511 OR EQUAL) No Bid
142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
{CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL) No Bid
143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB,
{5L1-939 OR EQUAL) No¢ Bid
144 | Emergency Pumping and Storage Daily Fee: No Bid Chemicals that
Tanker to support temporary on- bulk pumping
site storage for utility that needs and storage
to repair containment vessel. will support:
PROPOSAL FROM:

PVS Chemical Solutions, Inc

10900 Harper Avenue

Detroit, M| 48213

Telephone: 313-921-1200 email: _ bids@pvschemicals.com

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understoad
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium {NEMVCC) and our Host Community
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda:  None

Signature: IAA*J{M

Milisav M. Bulatovic, Treasurer
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To Whom it May Concern;:

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, I/we hereby certify
that I am/we are, the only person (s) interested in this proposal as principal(s); that it is made without
coliusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the following prices.

SIGNATURES

- Author;ang Signatuy

‘Matthew Nowaczok, Assistant Secretary
Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

03/20/2023
Date

I certify under the penalty of perjury that |, to the best of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns
and paid ail state taxes required under law.

*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name {Mandatory): PVS Chemical Solutions, Inc

By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable):

Milidav M. Bulatovic, Treasurer
*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this certification clause is signed
by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their seaied
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must make arrangements to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be
assigned to the owner. The owner's intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or
guarantees as part of the awarding procedure.
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—

NORT@EAST/MFRRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM

FISCAL YEAR 2023-2024 ]
OFFICIAL BID FORM |
DATE: | 3/21/2023 @
VENDOR: | Roberts Chemical Company, Inc.
| | J
NOTE: BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS BID FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PER
NO. &
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15 GAL GAL.
{ACH) PAILS i
2 1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000 GAL. | GAL.
(ACH) BULK :
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION {500 ~5,000 ! GALLON
Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Suifuric | Gal. deliveries)
Acid Preparation
NSF 60/ANSI
4 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION (500 - 5,000 GALLON
Other Prep Method Gal. deliveries) |
Alternative Bid !
R ~ NSF 60/ANSI L B
5 AMMONIA GAS 150 L8B. : LB,
CYLINDER
6 AMMONIUM SULFATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
7 AMMONIIUM SULFATE 500 — 1,000 GAL. ]
{40% SOLUTION) Gal. deliveries '
8 ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. BAGS CU.FT.
9 AQUEQUS AMMONIA 1,000 Gal. ] GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME {29%) deliveries
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30 GAL. DRUM GAL
(PHOSPHORIC ACID}
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11 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15 GAL. DRUM | GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) ; |
12 CALCIUM CHLORIDE 501B.BAG | DRY LB.
$040 V
13 CALCIUIM CHLORIDE SUPERSACK DRYLB. |
|
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/S0 — 50 LBS :
LBS BAGS :
15 |  CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE LESS THAN LBS
PALLET - 50 LBS ;
BAGS
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 LBS LBS ,
{Accu-Tab Blue SI by Fillion PAILS
Associates)
17 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 LBS. L8S.
(Accu-Tab SI by Axiall LLC) PAILS
18 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery DRY LB.
{40/50 Ib. bags)
19 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK LB.
20 CARBON POWDERED BULK TON
21 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK DRYLB.
B 22 CAUSTIC SODA - smaLLBuk | WETLB.
25% SOLUTION 500 — 1,000 |
Gal. deliveries
23 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK WETLB. |
25% SOLUTION 1,001 - 5,000
Gal. deliveries o
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION
25 CAUSTIC SODA - 275 GAL. TOTE WETLB.
25 % SOLUTION j
26 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK WETLB. ¢
50% SOLUTION 500 —~ 1,500
Gal. deliveries |
27 CAUSTIC SODA — LARGE BULK
50% SOLUTION 1,501 - 6,000 WT LB.
Gal. deliveries
28 CHLORINE- DRY {HTH) 50 LB. PAILS DRY LB.
i‘
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29 CHLORINE 1 TON LB. é
CYLINDER 5
10 CHLORINE 150 L8, LB. |
CYLINDER 1
3 1 1 - CITRIC ACID 50% 250 GAL TOTE - WETLB.
32 CITRIC ACID 50% 55 GAL.DRUM WETLB. |
3
33 CITRICACIDS0% POWDER | SOLB | DRY LB.
BAGS/PALLET
343 COPPER SULFATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
FINE # 30
34b COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
x
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK | DRY LB.
U.5. ONLY 32%-38%
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK | DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38%
(Alternative Bid}
37 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK WET LB.
38 HYDROFLUOSILICICACID- 24% | 55 GAL. DRUM | WETLB.
39 RYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% | 270 gallon totes WET LB.
40 LIME (HYDRATED) 50 LB BAGS DRY LB.
2 ton min.
41 LIME SLURRY BULK | PER TON
42 LIGUID OXYGEN BULK 5 GAL |
(<15 PPM THC) :
43 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
{<40 PPM THC) i
A4 LIQUID POLYMER 275 GAL TOTE GAL.
45 LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS BULK WETLB.
8500 OR EQUAL) |
46 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275 GAL TOTES GAL. |
New Item :
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47 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK CUFT.
48 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK CU FT.
{alternate bid)
49 METHANOL {100%) 55 GAL DRUM GAL.
$5.00 v
50 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME BULK GAL.
{1,000 — 3,000)
galion delivered
51 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55 GAL DRUM GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified i
52 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 520 LB. DRUM LB.
53 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 4, 1-gallon jugs | GAL
per box j
| 54 MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK GAL.
: {300-350 gal)
55 MURIATIC ACID — 20% 15 GAL. GAL.
CARBOY
56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME PUMPTED TOTE | GAL.
{300-350 gal}
57 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50 LB PAILS i 18.
NEW [TEM {CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL) ;
58 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL GAL.
(CARUS 4500) DRUMS
59 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK LB.
(AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) {300-500 GAL)
60 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON LB.
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM
61 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55 GALLON
{50%-50% Blend) DRUM LB.
{Aquamag or equal)
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON LB. :
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM :
63 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55 GALLON LB.
{10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM ;
64 POLYPHOSPHATE 340 LBS DRUM LB. _
(STERLING CP-33) ;
65 PHOSPHATE (LIQUID} 30 GALLON GAL
{(SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS DRUMS
8100)
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66 POLYMER {MANNICH} BULK LB. i
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 !
67 POLYMER (ANIONIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTE
68 POLYMER {CATIONIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTE
69 POYMER {CATIONIC} 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTE
70 POLYMER 55GAL | TTeAl
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM
71 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15 GAL. DRUM WET L8,
75% SOLUTION $2.25
72 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL} :
73 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275 GAL TOTE GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL}
74 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL.
{HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL)
75 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE o
{HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK GAL.
EQUAL)
76 SMALL BULK WET LB,
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% | 400 -1,000 gal.
Deliveries :
77 LARGE BULK WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE -45% | 1,001 - 5,000
Gal. Deliveries
78 BULK
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE -45% | 800 - 1,500 gal WET LB
- shorter
wheelbase !
delivery ]
79 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTE WET LB.
80 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% | 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
g1 | poassium HYDROXIDE~45% | 15GAL PAIL | WET LB.
82 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 LB. DRUM LB.
{U.S. ONLY}
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83 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330 LB. DRUM | LB.
{U.5. ONLY)
84 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB. PAILS LB.
{U.S. ONLY) ‘ 5
85 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 LB. DRUM | LB. :
{(FOREIGN- Alternative Bid)
36 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330 LB. DRUM LB.
{(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid)
87 1 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 1B. PAILS LB.
{FOREIGN - Alternative Bid)
S8 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK WET LB.
(AWWA B405 — LATEST) 1
89 SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK DRYLB.
(AWWA/NSF 60)
90 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) Full Truckload
Release
91 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER ) full Truckioad
Release
92 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY {B. -‘
{WASTEWATER} Per Pallet i
93 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL+
04 SODIUM BISULFITE- MINI-BULK WETLB. |
38% SOLUTION < 800 GAL a
95 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
38% SOLUTION
96 SODIUM 50 LBS BAGS " DRYLB.
METABISULFITE {GRANULAR] 2 pallet deliv.
g7 SODIUM CARBONATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE $0.45 v
98 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS i DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE f
99 SODIUM CARBONATE BULK DRY LB,
SODA ASH- DENSE
100 SODIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG DRYLB.
$045
101 SODIJM CHLORITE - BULK WET LB. ‘
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY
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102 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM WETLB.
25% SOLUTION - U.5. ONLY
103 SODIUM CHLORITE — 25% BULK WET LB.
FOREIGN ({alternate bid)
{04 | SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55 GAL DRUM WETLB.
FOREIGN {alternate bid)
105 SODIUM CHLORITE BULK WET LB,
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for !
wastewater use only 3
106 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for
wastewater use only
107 SODIUM CHLORITE - 55 GAL. DRUM DRY 1.B.
{SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID)
108 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
L.S. ONLY 40 BAG
PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS
109 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB. g
U.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50 !
LB. BAGS |
110 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL | DRYLB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG
(Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS
111 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50
{Alternative Bid) LB. BAGS
11 2 SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
113 Sodium Hexametaphosphate 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
PRISTINE SK-7641
11 4 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5% 250 GAL TOTE v WET LB.
$0.175
115 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 5 GAL CARBOYS WETLB. k
$0.89
116 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% 300-2,000 Gal. ! WET LB. :
BULK $0.257 g
117 | SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-15% { SMALLBULK ) {
400-1,000 | o0 ocs S wems. |
Gal. deliveries :
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118 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% LARGE BULK |
1,001-7,000 | WET LB. i
Gal. deliveries
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK
119 | certified Refrigerated Storage | (400-5,000 gal. | WET LB.
and Delivery {Alternative Bid) deliveries)
120 SODIJM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% | 55 GAL. DRUMS WET LB.
$0.348
121 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% 275 GAL. WET.LB.
TOTE $0. 348
122 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER
123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER 1 $0.45
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 5 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER  |$0.89
125 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 1 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER
126 SODHJM PERMANGANATE 55 GAL DRUMS GAL.
|
127 SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE 50LB.BAG DRY LB,
128 SODIUM THIOSULFATE {penta- 25 KG BAGS DRY KG.
hydrate)
129 SULFUR DIOXIDE BULK PER TON
130 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275 TOTE PER GAL.
{30%)
131 ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
{v-937 OR EQUAL z ;
132 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GALTOTE : WET.1B. |
{V-970 OR EQUAL} | '
133 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB. 3
(V-970 OR EQUAL) 1
134 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB. :
135 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 501B. PAIL DRYLB. |
{CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL) ; !
136 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL. DRUMS | GAL. §
{SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS
3180}
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137 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GAL GAL.
{SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTE
3180}
138 ZINC ORTHCOPHOSPHATE 15-GAL PAIL GAL
(CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL)

139 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.

(SLI-932 OR EQUAL)
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB,

{v-939 OR EQUAL)

141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK ‘ WET LB,

{UPZ-511 OR £QUAL) |
142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WETLB.

{CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL)

143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.

{SLI-939 OR EQUAL) ‘
144 Emergency Pumping and Storage |  Daily Fee: Chemicals that

Tanker to support temporary on- bulk pumping
site storage for utility that needs and storage
to repair containment vessel. will support:
PROPOSAL FROM:
Roberts Chemical Company, inc.
330 B Victor Rd
Attleboro, MA 02703
Telephone: 508-408-0220 email |h0ffman@r0bertscnem.c0m

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium (NEMVCC) and our Host Community
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda:

Signature: ‘%’D /M/%
] = 7
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To Whom it May Concern:

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, l/we hereby certify
that | am/we are, the only person {s) interested in this proposal as principal{s); that it is made without
collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the following prices.

SIGNATURES

Aep //44

Au t‘honzmg S:éﬁ-n{ure

Aamad Chaudhrey, President
Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

March 21, 2023
Date

f certify under the penalty of perjury that |, to the best of my knowledge, have filed ali state tax returns
and paid ail state taxes required under law.

- o7
*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name {Mandatory): #p W/
4 { L L)/' /

By: Corporate Officer {(Mandatory, if Applicable}: _Aamad Chaudhrey, President

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this certification clause is signed
by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must make arrangements to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be
assigned to the owner. The owner’s intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or
guarantees as part of the awarding procedure.
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