DATE:

VENDOR: | Holland Company. inc. -

FISCAL YEAR 2023- 202&

 OFFICIAL BID FORM

_March 21,2023

|

Dong

NOTE: | ) Bfffp?iic:ﬁs MUST BE PER UNiT SPECIFIED ON_TTiTS BID FORM o
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PER
| ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15 GAL GAL
i {ACH) PAILS
) ~ ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE | 1,000 GAL, GAL,
{ACH) BULK $6.04
L3  ALUMINUM SULFATE-50% |  Buk | ]
; SOLUTION {500 — 5,000 69 GALLON
Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric i Gal. deliveries) $1 .
Acid Preparation
. NSEGO/ANSI .
4 ~ ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION {500 ~ 5,000 $1.89 GALLON
Other Prep Method Gal. deliveries) ’
Alternative Bid
S . NSF6O/ANSI S . N
5  AMMONIA GAS 150 LB. LB,
CYUINDER
6 AMMONIUM SULFATE | 50LB.BAG | | DRYLB.
7 | AMMONIIUM SULFATE 500-1,000 © GAL
{4096 SOLUTFON) Gal. deliveries
g ANTHRACITE | 60+LBS. BAGS O CUFT.
9 o ' AQUEOUS AMMONIA 1,000 Gal. GAL.
~ MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30 GAL. DRUM GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID)

|
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' CALCIQUEST ORTHO

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages { FY 2023-2024)

11 | 15 GAL. DRUM GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) -
12 'CALCIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
13 CALCIUIM CHLORIDE | SUPERsack | DRYLB.
14 | CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE | PALLET/SO-50 { ) s
LBS BAGS
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE | LESS THAN LBS
PALLET - 50 LBS
B SV - . e e e . BAGS - -
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 LBS LBS
{Accu-Tab Blue 51 by Fillion PAILS
IO Associates) o B
17 'CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 18S. LBS.
{Accu-Tab S1 by Axiall L1C) PAILS
18 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery DRY LB
(40/50 Ib. bags)
19 " CARBON DIOXIDE BULK LB,
20 ' CARBON POWDERED |  BULK - TON
YR " CARBON POWDERED "SUPERSACK | 'DRYLB.
22 CAUSTIC SODA - " SMALLBULK WET LB.
\ 25% SOLUTION 500 — 1,000
E . | caldeliveries § |
23 1 'CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK WET LB,
% 25% SOLUTION 1,001~ 5,000
| . ...} caldeliveries .
24 | CAUSTIC SODA - 55 GAL. DRUM WET LS.
25% SOLUTION
25 CAUSTIC SODA- 275 GAL. TOTE WETLB.
25 % SOLUTION
26 CAUSTICSODA- T SMALLBULK N WETLB.
50% SOLUTION 500 - 1,500
Gal. deliveries
27 CAUSTIC SODA ~ LARGE BULK |
50% SOLUTION 1,501 - 6,000 WT LB
e _ Gal. deliveries | e
28 CHLORINE- DRY (HTH) 50 LB, PAILS DRY LB.
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" CHLORINE

29 ~1TON .. 1
CYLINDER
30 | CHLORINE 150 LB. LB.
CYLINDER
31 | CITRICACID50% 250 GALTOTE | WET LB.
"33 | CITRICACID 50% | sseaLorum | | weTis.
33 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 508 DRY L.
BAGS/PALLET
34a " COPPER SULFATE 50LB.BAG | DRY LB.
FINE # 30
34b COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB,
35 | FERRICCHLORIDE- |  BUIK - TDRYLB. |
U.S. ONLY 32%-38%
36 " FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38%
S (Alternative Bid) - N R
37 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK WET LB.
33 | HYDROFLUOSILICICACID- 24% | 55 GAL. DRUM WETLB.
39 | HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID-24% | 270 galion totes | weTs,
A0 LIME (HYDRATED}  SOLBBAGS | DRY LB,
2 tan min.
a1 " UME SLURRY © BULK PERTON
4 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK ) GAL
| (<15 PPM THC)
43 LIQUID OXYGEN 1 BUK GAL.
{<40 PPM THC)
A4 LIQUID POLYMER 275 GALTOTE | o GAL
A5 | LQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS | BULK "1 weTts.
8500 OR EQUAL)
46 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE | 275 GALTOTES |  GAL
Newhem | = — e -
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a7 | ™A NGANESE GREENSAND T BULK CUFT.
a8 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS sulk U T T ur
{alternate bid) L
49 " METHANOL (100%) 55 GAL DRUM GAL.
50 | MURIATICACID-20° BAUME | BULK T GAL
(1,000 — 3,000)
. gallon delivered ;
51 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55 GAL DRUM GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified
57 | MURIATICACID-20°BAUME | 52018.DRUM LB.
; 53 " MURIATIC ACEBQ_iﬁ:brﬂﬂﬁﬁ_ | '4, 1«gaHon jugs GAL
per box
54 MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK GAL.
{300-350 gal)
55 MURIATICACID-20% |  1SGAL GAL.
_ CARBOY
"Tgg | MURIATICACID-20° BAUME | PUMPTED TOTE GAL
(300-350 gal)
57 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE | 50LBPAILS 1B.
NEwW ITEM (CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL)
58 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL GAL.
(CARUS 4500} DRUMS
59 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE |  BULK LB.
(AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) {300-500 GAL)
60 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE | 30 GALLON LB.
{50%-50% Blend) DRUM
61 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55 GALLON
{50%-50% Blend) DRUM L8.
(Aquamagorequal) | 4 R
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON 1.}
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM
63 | ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55 GALLON LB.
(10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM |
64 | POLYPHOSPHATE 330LBSDRUM | LB.
i {STERLING CP-33)
65 PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) | 30 GALLON GAL.
(SHANNON SLi 5225 OR CARUS DRUMS
8100) .
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72

71

" POLYMER (MANNICH)

73

74

78

50

81

79 |

{U.S. ONLY)
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BULK LB.
 SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 L
POLYMER {ANIONIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 ok ||
"~ POLYMER (CATIONIC) | 275 GAL GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTE _
" POYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL GAL.
_ SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTE
o "POLYMER T sseal | GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM
~ PHOSPHORIC ACID 15 GAL. DRUM | WET LB
75% SOLUTION
POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE " BULK $3 56 GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL)
POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE | 275 GALTOTE $5. 62 GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL}
" POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL
{HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL) $3 50
 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE T T
{(HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK $3 40 GAL.
. EQUAL) — o
SMALL BULK WET L8.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% | 400 -1,000 gal,
o 7 Deiwenes N
" LARGE BULK WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE ~45% | 1,001 - 5,000
_ Gal. Deliveries i}
BULK
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE -45% | 800 — 1,500 gal WET LB
- shorter
wheelbase
e delivery | )
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTE WET LB.
 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% | 55 GAL.DRUM | T weTe. |
" POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% | 15 GAL.PAIL | T weTe.,
POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE | 55 LB. DRUM LB.
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POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE

3301B.DRUM |

(U.S. ONLY)
84 | POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB. PAILS LB.
(U.5. ONLY}
Q5 | POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE | 5518.DRUM 8.
(FOREIGN- Alternative Bid)
86 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE | 330 L. DRUM LB.
{FOREIGN - Alternative Bid)
87 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB. PAILS B
{FOREIGN - Alternative Bid)
88 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK WETLB.
(AWWA B405 — LATEST) $0.46
89 SODIUM BICARBONATE | BULK DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 50}
90 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS, BAG DRY LB.
{AWWA/NSF 60) Fuli Truckload
e .| Relesse
91 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER ) Full Truckload
e .| Release - I
97 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER) Per Pallet
93 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL+ $0.30
Y] SODIUM BISULFITE- | MINI-BULK WET LB,
38% SOLUTION < 800 GAL
95 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55 GAL DRUM | ~ WETLS.
38% SOLUTION
96 7 soplum 50LBSBAGS |  DRY LS.
METABISULFITE (GRANULAR) | 2 pallet deliv.
Y SODIUM CARBONATE 50 LB, BAG ) DRY LB.
! SODA ASH- DENSE
98 SODIUM CARBONATE | SUPERSACKS | DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE
99 SODIUM CARBONATE " BULK o | DRYLB.
SODA ASH- DENSE
100 SODIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG DRY L8.
101 |  SCDIUMCHLORTE- Uk | TTWETLB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S, ONLY
NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages { FY 2023-2024} 6 of 10 pages




103
104

o |

105
106

109

110 |

111 |

112

114

113

115
116 | SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5%

WETLB.

'SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15%

300-2,000 Gal.
BULK
SMALL BULK
400 — 1,000
Gal. deliveries

NEMVCC Official Bid Farm and Signature Pages { FY 2023-2024)

SODIUM CHLORITE- | 55 GALDRUM |
25% SOLUTION - US. ONLY
SODIUM CHLORITE — 25% BULK
FOREIGN {alternate bid)
SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55 GAL DRUM
FGREIGN {alternate hid)
TSODIUM CHLORITE— “BULK
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for
__ wastewateruseonly | ]
SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for
wastewateruseonly L 1
SODIUM CHLORITE - 55 GAL. DRUM
 (SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID) -
SODIUM FLUORIDE “TLESS THAN FULL
U.S. ONLY 40 BAG
PALLETS OF 50
) e i LB.BAGS
SODIUM FLUORIDE TFULL40BAG
U.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS
SODIUM FLUORIDE | LESS THAN FULL |
FOREIGN 40 BAG
{Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50
T mems m—————— —aee _— . LB BAGS
SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50
({Alternative Bid) LB. BAGS
SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG
sodium Hexametaphosphate S5 GALDRUM |
PRISTINE SK-7641
" SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5% | 250 GALTOTE |
' SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 5 GAL CARBOYS

" DRY LB.
" DRY LB.

DRY LB.

" DRY1B.
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" SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE ~ 15%

118 LARGE BULK
1,001 - 7,000 WET LB.
| Galdeliveries .
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK
119 Certified Refrigerated Storage {400-5,000 gal. WET LB
'} andDelivery (Alternative Bid) |  deliveries) S B
120 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% | 55 GAL. DRUMS WET LB
121 "1 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% |  275GAL. | WET.LB.
TOTE
" 122 | SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30 GAL. WET LB
CONTAINER -
123 | SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15 GAL WET LB.
CONTAINER
124 | SODIUMHYPOCHLORITE-15% |  5GAL WETLB.
a _CONTAINER
125 | sopum HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 1GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER
126 SODIUM PERMANGANATE 55 GAL DRUMS GAL.
127 | SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE | SOLB.BAG | i "DRYLB.
128 | SODIUM THIOSULFATE (penta- 25 KG BAGS T DRY KG.
hydrate)
129 " 'SULFURDIOXIDE - BULK ' PERTON
130 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275TOTE | PERGAL
S (30%)} R R
131 ~ ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
_ (V937 O0REQUAL I AR N
132 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GALTOTE WET. LB.
ol Ivo700REQUALG e T
133 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
o . [v-870 OR EQUAL) SO L
134 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
135 7ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE | s5SoLB.PAIL | T DRYLE.
| [CARUS3050OREQUAL) o I D
136 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL. DRUMS GAL,
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS
3180) I 1 o

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages { FY 2023-2024)
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ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE

| 137 275 GAL. GAL.
' (SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTE
- 3180) I
138 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 15-GAL PAIL GAL
T (CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL) e

139 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.

) (SLi-932 OR EQUAL) L _ B

140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB,

o ) (V-939 OR EQUAL) L
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(UPZ-511 CREQUAL) ) ,
142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
{CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL)
143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET L8.
{SLI-939 OR EQUAL}

144 Emergency Pumping and Storage Daily Fee: Chemicals that
Tanker to support temporary on- butk pumping
site storage for utility that needs and storage

to repair containment vesset. | will support
PROPOSAL FROM:
Holland Company. Inc.
153 Howland Ave. _
_Adams, MA 01220-1199
Telephone: _ 413-743-1292  email: heoffice@hollandcompany.com

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium {NEMVCC) and our Host Community
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC,

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda: __NNONe

Signature:

A8y, Matthew B Holland
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To Whom it May Concern:

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, |/we hereby certify
that | am/we are, the only person (s} interested in this proposal as principal(s); that it is made without
collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, thatan examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the following prices,

SIGNATURES

.

_Matthew B Holland, Manager .

Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

March 21,2023 . =

Date

| certify under the penalty of perjury that |, to the best of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns
and paid all state taxes required under law.

*signature of Individuat or Corporate Name (Mandatory): Holland Company,.Inc..

e
By: Corporate Officer (Mandatary, if Applicabie}:%é %{_@MMBWHQHQ nd

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this certification clause is signed
by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES
All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the

warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must make arrangements to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be
assigned to the owner. The owner’s Intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or
guarantees as part of the awarding procedure.
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Hol]land COMPANY INC.

153 HOWLAND AVENUE
ADAMS, MA 01220-1199
{TEL.) 413 742-1292
{FAX) 413 743-1298

CORPORATE RESOLUTION

Date March 21, 2023

At a Meeting of the Directors of Holland Compaugy, Inc.

duly called and held at Adams, Massachusetts
onthe _11th day of April, 2019

at which a quorum was present and acting, it was

VOTED: That Matthew B, Holland

the Manager of this Corporation, is hereby authorized and

empowered to make, enter into, sign, seal and deliver in its name and behalf, all

BIDS and CONTRACTS.

I do hereby certify that the above is a true and correct copy of the record, that said
Vote has not been amended or repealed, and is in full force and effects as of this date, and

that Matthew B. Holland is the duly elected __Manager

of this Corporation.

Attest:

(X5 Jdein/

Themas J./Holland, President

(Corporate Seal)



Do

NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM |

FISCAL YEAR 2023-2024
OFFICIAL BID FORM
DATE:  |y7.mar-2023
VENDOR: | rusrmational Dioxcide inc
NOTE: BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS 81D FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PER
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15 GAL GAL.
{ACH) PAILS “No Bid"
2 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000 GAL. GAL.
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION {500 - 5,000 GALLON
Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric | Gal. deliveries)
Acid Preparation
NSF 50/ANS) " '
4 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION {500 - 5,000 GALLON
Other Prep Method Gal. deliveries)
Alternative Bld
NSF 60/ANSI “No Bid"
5 AMMONIA GAS 150 LB. LB.
CYLINDER “No Bid"
6 AMMONIUM SULFATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
e “No Bid”
7 AMMONIIUM SULFATE 500 - 1,000 GAL.
(40% SOLUTION) Gal. deliveries |y, ig®
8 ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. BAGS CU.FT.
L] m-
g9 AQUEOUS AMMONIA 1,000 Gal. GAL
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries "No Bid"
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30 GAL. DRUM GAL.
{PHOSPHORIC ACID) *No Bid"

NEMVCC Official 8id Form and Signature Pages (FY 2023-2024)
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11 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15 GAL. DRUM GAL.
{PHOSPHORIC ACID) "o Bid®
12 CALCIUM CHLORIDE S0 LB. BAG DRY LB,
"No Bigd"
13 CALCOUIM CHLORIDE SUPERSACK DRY LB.
“No Bid"
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/S0 ~50 LBS
LBS BAGS “No Bid”
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE LESS THAN LBS
PALLET - 50 LBS
BAGS "No Bid"
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE S5LBs5 LB5
(Accu-Tab Blue S by Fillion PAILS
Assggiates) "No Bid"
17 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 {BS. LBS.
{Accu-Tab 51 by Axiall LLC) PAILS "No Bid"
18 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery DRY L8,
{40/50 Ib. bags) | o Big”
19 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK LB.
"No Bid"
20 CARBON POWDERED BULK TON
“"No Bid”
21 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK DRY LB.
“No B
22 CAUSTYC SODA - SMALL BULK WET LB,
25% SOLUTION 500 - 1,000
Gal. deliveries |"No Big"
23 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001 - 5,000
Gal. deliveries |“No Bid"
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB
25% SOLUTION "No Bid®
25 CAUSTIC SODA - 275 GAL. TOTE WET LB.
25 % SOLUTION “No Bid*
26 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK WET L8,
50% SOLUTION 500 - 1,500
Gal. deliveries
"No a'!d!
27 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK
50% SOLUTION 1,501 -6,000 WT LB.
Gal. deliveries |“Ng Big"
28 CHLORINE- DRY (HTH) SO LB. PARRS DRY LB.
“No Big”
NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2023-2024) 2 of 10 pages




29 CHLORINE 1TON LB,
CYLINDER No Big"
30 CHLORINE 150 LB. LB.
CYLINDER Ilm BHII
31 CITRIC ACID 50% 250 GALTOTE WET LB.
"No Bid"
32 CITRIC ACID 50% 55 GAL.DRUM WET LB.
"No Bid”
3 3 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 50 LB DRY LB.
BAGS/PALLET “No Bid”
34a COPPER SULFATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LE.
FINE # 30 “Ng Bid"
34b COPPER SULFATE - LARGE S0 LB. BAG DRY LB.
“No Bld"
3 5 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK ORY LB.
U-S- ONLY 32%‘38% .NO Bidﬂ
36 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY.18.
FOREIGN: 32%-38%
(Alternative Bid) "No Bid"
37 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK WET LB.
"No Bid"
38 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB,
“No Bid"
39 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 270 gallon totes WET LB.
“No Bid"
40 LHVE (HYDRATED) 50 LB BAGS DRY LB.
2 ton min. “No Bid"
a1 LIME SLURRY BULK PER TON
"No 8id"
42 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL
43 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL
(<40 PPM THO) | myo pigr
A4 LIQUID POLYMER 275 GALTOTE GAL.
"No Bid"
AS LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS BULK WET LB.
8500 OR EQUAL) “No Bid”
46 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275 GAL TOTES o GAL.
New ltem "Mo Bid"

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pag
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66 POLYMER {MANNICH) BULK LB.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 “No Bid"
67 POLYMER [ANJONIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTE "No Bid"
68 POLYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTE “No Bid"
69 POYMER {CATIONIC) 275 GAL, GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTE “No Bid"
70 POLYMER 95 GAL GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM
“No Bid"
71 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
75% SOLUTION “No Bid"
72 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) "No Bid"
73 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275 GALTOTE GAL
{HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) “No Bid"
74 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL.
(HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL)
“No Bid"
75 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE
{HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK GAL.
EQUAL) "No Bid"
76 SMALL BULK WET LB.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 400 -1,000 gal.
Deliveries “No Bid"
77 LARGE BULK WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE —~ 45% 1,001 - 5,000
Gal. Deliveries | "No Bid”
78 BULK
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 800 — 1,500 gal WET LB
- shorter
wheelbase
delivery "No Bid"
79 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTE WET LB,
“Ng Bid"
80 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
"No Bid”
81 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE ~— 45% 15 GAL. PAIL WET LB.
"No Bid"
12 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 LB. DRUM LB.
{U.S. ONLY) "No Bid"
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83 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330 LB. DRUM LB.
{U.5. ONLY) *No Bid"
24 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE S LB. PAILS LB,
(U.5. ONLY) “No Bid"
85 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 LB. DRUM LB.
(FOREIGN- Alternative Bid) *No Bid"
86 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330 LB8. DRUM LB.
(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) "N Bid"
87 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB. PAILS t8.
{FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) *No Bid"
83 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 28% BULK WET LB.
(AWWA B3OS — LATEST) "No Bid"
89 SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
(AWWA/SNSF 60) *No Bid"
90 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LB5. BAG DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60} Ful! Fruckload
Release "No Bid"
91 SODIUM BICARBONATE S0 LBS. BAG DRY 18.
{WASTEWATER ) Fult Truckload
Release "No Bid"
92 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
{WASTEWATER) Per Pallet "No Bid"
93 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK WET L8.
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL+  |™No Bid"
94 SODIUM BISULFITE- MINI-BULK WET LB.
3B% SCLUTION < 800 GAL “No Bid"
95 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
8% SOLUTION "No Bid"
96 50DIUM 50 LBS BAGS DRY LB.
METASBISULFITE (GRANULAR) 2 pallet deliv.  {"No Bid"
97 SODIUM CARBONATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB,
SODA ASH- DENSE "No Bid"
08 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE “No Bid"
99 SODIUM CARBONATE BULK DRY 1 8.
SODA ASH- DENSE "No Bid"
100 SODIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
"No Bid”
101 SODIUM CHLORITE ~ BULK / WET LB,
25% SOLUTION — LS. ONLY $0.731/b
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102 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION -~ U.S, ONLY $0.931/b
103 SCDIUM CHLORITE — 25% BULK WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) "No Bid"
104 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55 GAL DRUM WET LB,
FOREIGN (alternate bid)
"No Bid"
105 SODIUM CHLORITE - BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for
wastewater use only *No Bid"
106 SOCIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION - nan-AWWA for
wastewater use only “No Bid"
107 SODIUM CHLORITE - 55 GAL. DRUM DRY LB.
{SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID) "No Bid"
108 SODIUM FLUDRIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 40 BAG
PALLETS OF SG
LB. BAGS “No Bid"
109 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
U.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS
“No Bid”
110 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB,
FOREIGN 40 BAG
{Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS "No Bid"
111 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50
(Alternative Bid) LB. BAGS "No Bid"
112 SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
"No Bid"
113 Sodium Hexametaphosphate S5 GAL DRUM WET LB.
PRISTINE SK-7541 "No Bid"
114 SODIUM HYPGCHLORITE-5% 250 GAL TOTE WET LB.
"No Bid™
115 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 5 GAL CARBOYS WET LB.
"No Big"
116 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 300-2,000 Gal. WET L8,
BULK "No Bid"
117 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE ~ 15% SMALL BULK
400 - 1,000 WET LB.
Gal. deliveries | "No Bid"
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118 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% LARGE BULK
1,001 - 7,000 WET LB.
Gal. deliveries | “No Bid”
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 155 BULK
119 | (certified Refrigerated Storage | (400-5,000 gal. WET L8.
and Delivery {Alternative Bid} deliveries)  |"NoBid'
120 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 55 GAL. DRUMS WET LB.
"No Bid"
121 $ODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% 275 GAL. WET.LB.
TOTE "No Bid"
122 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER “No Bid"
123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER | "No Bid*
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% S GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER | "No Bid"
125 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 1 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER | "No Bid"
12 B S0DIUM PERMANGANATE 55 GAL DRUMS GAL.
"No Bid”
127 SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE SO LB. BAG DRY LB.
"No Bid"
128 SODIUM THIOSULFATE (penta- 25 KG BAGS DRY KG.
hydrate) "No Bld"
129 SULFUR DIOXIDE BULK PER TON
"No Bid"
130 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275 TOTE PER GAL.
(30%) ‘No Bid"
131 ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG DRY 18.
{v-937 OR EQUAL "No Bid"
132 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GALTOTE WET. LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL} "No Bid”
133 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
{V-970 OR EQUAL) "No Bid"
134 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
*No Bid”
135 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE S0 LB. PAIL DRY LB.
{CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL) "No Bid"
136 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL. DRUMS GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS
3180) "Na B
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137 ZINC ORTHOPHOSFHATE 275 GAL. GAL.
{SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTE
3180) “No Bid"
138 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 15-GAL PAIL GAL
{CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL) *No Bid"
139 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
{$L1-932 OR EQUAL} “No Bid"
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 8ULK WET LB.
(V-939 OR EQUAL) “No Bid"
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
{UPZ-511 OR EQUAL) “No Bid"
142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL) “No Bid"
143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET L8.
(SLI-939 OR EQUAL}) “No Bid"

144 Emergency Pumping and Storage Daily Fee: Chemicals that
Tanker to support temporary on- bulk pumping
site storage for utility that needs and storage

to repair containment vessel. “No Bid" wl!l support:
PROPOSAL FROM:

Internaticnal Diexcide Inc

40 Whitecap Drive

North Kingstown, Rl 02852

Telephone: ~ 401-285-3623 email: thomas.dwyer@ercoworidwide com

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium (NEMVCC) and our Host Community
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda: Not Applicable

)
Signature: , Ne ~ Mk ,l.*} LA

Ak Wi p onctusn -
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To Whom it May Concern:

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, |/we hereby certify
that | am/we are, the only person {s) interested in this proposal as principal(s); that it is made without
collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the following prices.

SIGNATURES

L § .
ﬂ“-- S ‘K.\‘J\Jv,i\,

Authorizing SignatureT

Thomas Dwyer. €102 Business Director
Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

17-Mar-2023 &l‘ , \/\J . ) C : I 2
Date Heest . M7& m
| certify under t st of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns

and paid all state taxes required under law.

*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name (Mandatory): _'ntemational Dioxcide inc.

By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable): Thomas Dwyer

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this certification clause is signed
by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES
All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.
The bidder must make arrangements to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be

assigned to the owner. The owner’s intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or
guarantees as part of the awarding procedure.
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Dot

NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM
FISCAL YEAR 2023-2024
OFFICIAL BID FORM
DATE: March 17, 2023
VENDOR: | JC! Jones Chemicals, Inc
| x |
NOTE: BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS BID FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PER
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15 GAL GAL.
{ACH) PAILS
2 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000 GAL. GAL.
{ACH) BULK e e
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION {500 - 5,000 _ GALLON
Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric Gal. deliveries}
Acid Preparaticn
NSF 60/ANSI
4 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION {500 - 5,000 GALLON
Other Prep Method Gal. deliveries)
Alternative Bid
NSF 60/ANSI
5 AMMONIA GAS 150 LB. LB.
CYLINDER —
6 AMMONIUM SULFATE 501B. BAG DRY LB.
7 AMMONIIUM SULFATE 500 —1,000 GAL.
(40% SOLUTION) Gal. deliveries
] ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. BAGS | CU.FT.
e AQUEOUS AMMONIA 1,000 Gal. GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries e
10 CALCIQUEST CRTHO 3Q GAL. DRUM GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID}
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11 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15 GAL. DRUM GAL.
{PHOSPHORIC ACID) )
12 CALCIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
13 CALCIUIM CHLORIDE SUPERSACK DRY LB.
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/50 - 50 LBS
LBS BAGS
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE |.ESS THAN LBS
PALLET-50LBS | =
BAGS
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55LBS LBS
{Accu-Tab Blue 51 by Fillion PAILS T
Associates)
17 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 LBS. . R N LBS,
{Accu-Tab St by Axiall L) PAILS
18 CALCIUM NITRATE Perton delivery | o DRY LB.
{40/50 1b. bags)
19 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK 1B.
20 CARBON POWDERED BULK TON
21 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK DRY LB.
22 CAUSTIC SCDA - SMALL BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 500 - 1,000 e e et
Gal. deliveries
23 CAUSTIC SCDA - LARGE BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001-5,000 | oo
Gal. deliveries
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION -
- 25 CAUSTIC SODA - 275 GAL. TOTE WET LB.
25 % SOLUTION A
26 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK WET LB.
50% SCLUTION 500 — 1,500
Gal. deliveries
27 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK
50% SOLUTION 1,501-6,000 | ———————r WTLB.
Gal. deliveries
28 CHLORINE- DRY (HTH) 50 LB. PAILS DRY LB.
_
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[ 29 CHLORINE 1 TON R LB.
cunoer | $1.70
30 CHLORINE 150 LB. . « LB.
CYLINDER $2.70
31 CITRIC ACID 50% 250 GAL TOTE WET LB.
32 CITRIC ACID 50% 55 GAL.DRUM WET LB.
33 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 50 LB DRY LB.
BAGS/PALLET | —
343 COPPER SULFATE S0 LB. BAG DRY LB.
EINE # 30 EE——
34b COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY LB,
US. ONLY 32%-38% )
36 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38% —————
{Alternative Bid}
37 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK . . WET LB.
38 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% | 55GAL.DRUM | WET LB.
39 YDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% | 270 gallon totes | . WET LB.
40 LIME (HYDRATED) 50 LB BAGS DRY LB.
2 ton min. —
41 LIME SLURRY BULK L PER TON
42 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
i (<1% PPM THC)
43 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
«GOPPMTHC) | —
44 LIQUID POLYMER 275 GALTOTE GAL.
45 LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS BULK WET LB.
B500 OR EQUAL} e
46 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275 GAL TOTES GAL.
New [tem -
*See attached bid note # 1
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47 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK CU FT.
48 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK I CU FT.
{alternate bid)
49 METHANOL {100%) 55 GAL DRUM GAL.
50 MURIATIC ACID-20" BAUME BULK GAL.
{1,000 - 3,000} | ~====————""""
gallon delivered
51 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME | 55GAL DRUM GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified
52 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 520 LB. DRUM LB.
53 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 4, 1-gafion jugs GAL
per box —
54 MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK GAL
(300-350gal) |
55 MURIATIC ACID — 20% 15 GAL. GAL.
CARBOY .
56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME PUMPTED TOTE GAL.
(300-350galy | T
57 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50 LB PAILS LB.
NEW TTEM {CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL} -
58 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL e B GAL.
(CARUS 4500} DRUMS
59 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK LB.
(AQUAMAG OR EQUAL} (300-S00GAL) |~~~
60 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON LB.
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM T
61 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55 GALLON
{50%-50% Blend) DRUM LB,
{Aquamag or equal)
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON LB.
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM T
63 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55 GALLON LB.
{10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM T
64 POLYPHOSPHATE 340 LBS DRUM LB.
(STERLING CP-33} T
65 PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) 30 GALLON GAL.
(SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS DRUMS A
2100}
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&6 POLYMER {MANNICH) BULK LB.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC c-321
67 POLYMER [ANIONIC) 275 GAL, GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTE
68 POLYMER {CATIONIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTE
69 POYMER [CATIONIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTE -
70 PCLYMER 55 GAL GAL
SNE POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM sumnmmmmmmem——
71 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15 GAL. DRUM . WET LB.
75% SOLUTION
72 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL
{HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) ,
73 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275 GALTOTE o GAL
{HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL}
74 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL
{HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL) [ —
75 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE
{HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK e GAL.
EQUAL)
76 SMALL BULK WET LB.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE-45% 400 —1,000 gal. —
Deliveries
77 LARGE BULK WET LB
POTASSILUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 1,001 - 5,000
Gal. Deliveries
78 BULK
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 800-1,500gal | .. WET LB
- shorter
wheelbase
delivery
79 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTE WET LB.
80 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
81 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 15 GAL. PAIL WET LB.
82 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE | S55LB.DRUM | . LB.
(U.S. ONLY)
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83 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330 LB.DRUM | ___ - LB,
{U.S. ONLY)
Q4 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE S LB. PAILS LB.
{U.5. ONLY) -
85 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 LB. DRUM LB.
{FOREIGN- Alternative Bid) "
86 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330 LB. DRUM LB.
{FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) mem——T
87 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB. PAILS LB,
(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) -
a8 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK . WET LB.
(AWWA B405 — LATEST)
89 SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
(AWWASNSF £0) - -
an SOMMUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) Full Truckload { —————
Release
91 SODIUM BiCARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
{WASTEWATER } Full Truckload
Release
92 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY 18B.
(WASTEWATER) Per Paliet
93 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK i WET LB.
38% SOLUTION Looo A | $0.2029
94 SODIUM BISULFITE- MINI-BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION < 800 GAL T
95 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55 GAL. DRUM Ak WET LB.
38% SOLUTION $0.3291
96 SODIUM 50 LBS BAGS DRY LB.
METABISULFITE (GRANULAR) 2 pallet deliv.
a7 SODHJM CARBONATE 50 LB, BAG DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE
98 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS . DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE
99 SODIUM CARBONATE BULK - DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE
100 SODIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG o DRY LB.
101 SODIUM CHLORITE — BULK WET LB.
25% SQLUTION — U.5. ONLY
** See attached bid note # 2
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[ 102 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY
103 SODIUM CHLORITE — 25% BULK WETLB. .
FOREIGN ({alternate bid) -
104 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
FOREIGN {alternate bid) e
105 SODIUM CHLORITE - BULK WET LB.
75% SOLUTION ~ non-AWWA for U ——
wastewater use only
106 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for PSR
wastewater use only
107 SODIUM CHLORITE 55 GAL. DRUM DRY LB.
(SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID} _'
108 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
.S, ONLY 40 BAG —
PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS
109 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
.5 ONLY PALLETS OF 50 | —emmme—eee—
LB. BAGS
110 S0DIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG )
(Alternative Bid} PALLETS OF 50
' LB. BAGS
111 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
FOREIGN PALLETSOFS50 | — "
{Alternative Bid) LB. BAGS
112 SODILUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
113 sadium Hexametaphosphate 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
PRISTINE SK-7641 - _
11 4 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-S5% 250 GAL TOTE WET LB,
115 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 5 GAL CARBOYS WET LB,
116 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-12.5% | 300-2,000 Gal. WET LB.
BULK
117 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE —15% | SMALL BULK
400 =1,000 | ———mm——mr— WET LB.
Gal. deliveries
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I 118 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% LARGE BULK
1,001 - 7,000 i e e WET LB.
Gal. deliveries
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK _
119 | cenified Refrigerated Storage | {400-5,000 gal. — WET LB.
and Dellvery {Alternative Bid) deliveries)
120 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 55 GAL DRUMS WET LB.
121 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% 275 GAL. WET.LB.
TOTE e
122 50DIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30 GAL WET LB.
CONTAINER -
173 | SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 5 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER
125 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 1 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER
126 SODIUM PERMANGANATE 55 GAL DRUMS GAL.
127 SODIUM SILICCFLUQRIDE 50 LB. BAG o DRY LB.
128 SODIUM THIOSULFATE (penta- 25 KG BAGS DRY KG.
hydrate)
129 SULFUR DIOXIDE BULK — | PerTON
130 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275 TOTE PER GAL.
(30%])
131 ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE S0LB.BAG | e DRY LB.
{V-937 OR EQUAL
13 2 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GALTOTE WET. LB.
{v-970 OR EQUAL)
13 3 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK . WET LB.
{V-970 OR EQUAL)
134 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55 GAL. DRUM — WET LB,
135 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE soLB.PAIL | DRY LB.
{CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL)
136 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL. DRUMS GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS e
| 3130)
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r 137 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GAL. ' GAL.
{SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTE —
3180}
138 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 15-GAL PAIL R GAL
(CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL}
139 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(sL1-932 OR EQUAL) -
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
{v-939 OR EQUAL)
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK i WET LB.
{UPZ-511 OR EQUAL) ‘
142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK B WET LB.
{CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL)
143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK _ ) WET LB.
{511-939 OR EQUAL)

144 Emergency Pumping and Storage Daily Fee: Chemicals that
Tanker to support temporary on- _ bulk pumping
site storage for utility that needs and storage

to repair containment vessel. | will support:
PROPOSAL FROM:

Jcl Jones Chemicals, Inc

40 Railroad Ave

Memimack, NH 03054

Telephone: 603-424-7212 email: _mermimack@jcichem.com

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack valley Chemical Consortium {NEMVCC} and our Host Community
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shali be
daemed in the best interest of NEMVCC.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda:

Signature: / 4/ Aw/ é\ /

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Sighature Pages { FY 2023-2024} g of 10 pages



To Whom 1t May Concern:

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, |/we hereby certify
that | am/we are, the only person (s) interested in this proposal as principal(s); that it is made without
collusion with any person, firm, or eorporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the foliowing prices.

SIGNATURES

/ In / &\_/
At{thjf(z"ing Signature
Jesdlca Gagnon Office Manager

Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

03/17/2023
Date

| certify under the penalty of perjury that |, to the best of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns
and paid all state taxes required under law.

*signature of Individual or Corporate Name (Mandatory): JCl Jones Chemicals, inc \ ‘/\

Jessica Gagnon

By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable): AVM Z..__

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will ndt be granted unless this certification clause is signed
by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must make arrangements t¢ assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be
assigned to the owner. The owner's intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or
guarantees as part of the awarding procedure.
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ICI

JonesChemicals fnc.

*Bid Note # 1 (Items 29 & 30):

Price is subject to change after 12/31/23 upon 30 days written notice.

#**Bid Note # 2 (Items 93 & 95):

Price is subject to change after 09/30/23 upon 30 days written notice.

Corporate Offices « 1765 Ringling Blvd. » Sarasota, Florida 34236 » felephone: $41.330.1537 » facstmmile: 041 380.9657 « 300.477.1078
Rranch Locations » Warwick, NY  Caledonia, NY'» Barberton, OH » Riverview, Ml « Merrimack, NH ¢ Charlotte, NC
Jacksorwville, FL « Beecht Grove, TN « Milford, VA » Tacoma, WA » Torranwe, CA
www jcichemicals.com
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Jares Chericals Inc.

BID ADDENDUM

The chlorine Producers have declared Force Majeure a combined eleven times since 2021. Chiorine
supply remains on strict allocation. in September 2022, all chlorine shipments in the nation were
halted for a week, and were behind schedule for several more, due to the threat of a rail strike.

JCI has no control over raw material supply or its transportation, and we must ensure that we are
not penalized should we be rendered unable to deliver by any disrupting event beyond our control.

Therefore, JCI must respectfully insist on including the following Force Majeure clause, or.one of
your choosing thatis approved by [Cl, as a term of our bid and any related contract that may be
issued.

FORCE MAJEURE: JCI jones Chemicals shall not be responsible for damages or delays
caused by Force Majeure nor other events beyond its control and which could not
reasonably have been anticipated or prevented. For purposes of this Agreement,
Force Majeure includes, but is not limited to, adverse weather conditions, floods,
epidemics, war, riot, strikes, lockouts, and other industrial disturbances; unknown
site conditions, accidents, sabotage, fire, and acts of God.

Please note that Force Majeure is of no relation to pricing- it is supply related only. JCI's pricing and
price terms will always remain as-bid regardless of Force Majeure status.

Cerporte Offices » 1765 Ringling Blvd. « Sagasota, Florida 34236 » telephone: 941.330.1537 + Facsirnile: 941 3309657 = 8004771078
Branch Locations » Warwick, MY « Caledonia, NY ¢ Barberton, OH » Riverview, M » Merrimack, NH » Charfotte, NC
Jacksonville, FL ¢ Beech Grove, IN « Milford, VA » Tacoma, WA » Torrance, CA
www jeichemicals.comn



Im Chemicals Inc.

Jcl Jones Chemicals, Inc.
Consent to Shareholder Action

January 10, 2023

1, the undersigned shareholder, heing the holder of all shares of stock of the above company
now outstanding, hereby resclve as follows:

1. Jessica Gagnon, Office Manager
2. Kevin Ballantine, Branch Manager

n bids, contracts and other documents pertaining

are hereby authorized to submit and sig
ities and other for the sale of company products.

thereto of this Corporation, to municipa

Jeffrey W. Jones, C.EO. & President

Attest:

Sm*mﬁ\emo

summer Mello, National Sales Coordinator

Corporate Ofices » 1765 Ringling Bivd » Sarasota, Florida 34236 « telephone: 941 3301537 » facsimile: 941.330.9657 » 800.477.1078
Branch Locations » Warwick, NY » Caledonia, NY e Barberton, OH » Riverview, Ml « Merrimack, NH  Charlotte, NC
Jacksonville, FL « Beech Grove, IN » Milford, V4 » Tacoma, WA e Torrance, CA
www.jeichemicals.com
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Payment Instructions: ACH and Wire

BANK: ' Bank OZK
8300 Douglas Ave- Suite 810
Dallas, TX 75225
Ray Dunavant: (214) 750-4800

BENEFICIARY: JCl Jones Chemicals inc
ACCOUNT #: 2804444623
ACCOUNTTYPE:  Checking

ACH ROUTING #: 082907273

WIRE ROUTING #: 082907273

Please email payment remittance advice to ar@jcichem.com.

Should you have any questions please coniact our Accounts Receivable department using
the email address above.

Thank you!

JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc

Corporate Offices 1765 Ringling Bivd. » Saxasota, Florida 34736 « felephone: 941.330.1537 o fucsimile: 941.330.8657 « 800.477.1078
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Jacksorwville, FL « Beech Grove, I » Milford, VA « Tacoma, WA s Torrance, CA
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