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NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM
FISCAL YEAR 2023-2024
OFFICIAL BID FORM
i
DATE: 3/20/2023
VENDOR: Fillion Assaciates, Inc.
PO Box 14518, East Providence, Ri 02914
(401) 438-6566
NOTE: BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS BID FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PER
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15 GAL No Bid GAL.
(ACH) PAILS 0 ol
2 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000 GAL. No Bid GAL.
(ACH) BULK o Bl
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION (500 -5,000 ] GALLON
Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric | Gal. deliveries) No Bid
Acid Preparation
NSF 60/ANSI
4 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION {500 -5,000 GALLON
Other Prep Method Gal. deliveries) No Bid
Alternative Bid
NSF 60/ANSI
5 AMMONIA GAS 150 LB. . LB.
CYLINDER No Bid
6 AMMONIUM SULFATE 50 LB. BAG No Bid DRY LB.
0 Bl
7 AMMONIIUM SULFATE 500 - 1,000 ) GAL.
(40% SOLUTION) Gal. deliveries No Bid
8 ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. BAGS No Bid CU.FT.
O Bi
9 AQUEOUS AMMONIA 1,000 Gal. No Bid GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries o Bl
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30 GAL. DRUM . GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) No Bid
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11 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15 GAL. DRUM No Bid GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) o ol
12 CALCIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG ) DRY LB.
No Bid
CALCIUIM CHLORIDE SUPERSACK , DRY LB.
13 No Bid
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/50 ~ 50 Bid LBS
LBS BAGS No Bi
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE ! LESS THAN 1.BS
PALLET - 50 LBS No Bid
BAGS
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 LBS $2.55 LBS
(Accu-Tab Blue Sl by Fillion PAILS T
Associates) 60 LB Pails
17 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 LBS. i LBS.
(Accu-Tab S! by Axiall LLC) PAILS No Bid
18 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery NG Bid DRY LB.
(40/50 Ib. bags) oLl
CARBON DIOXIDE BULK . LB.
19 No Bid
CARBON POWDERED BULK ] TON
20 No Bid
271 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK No Bid DRY LB.
22 CAUSTIC SODA - SMALL BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 500 - 1,000 No Bid
Gal. deliveries
23 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001 - 5,000 No Bid
Gal. deliveries
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 55 GAL. DRUM _ WET LB.
25% SOLUTION No Bid
.25 CAUSTIC SODA - 275 GAL. TOTE No Bid WET LB.
| 25 % SOLUTION
P 26 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK WET LB.
50% SOLUTION 500 - 1,500 No Bid
Gal. deliveries
27 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK
50% SOLUTION 1,501 — 6,000 No Bid WT LB,
Gal. deliveries
28 CHLORINE- DRY (HTH) 50 LB. PAILS _ DRY LB.
No Bid
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29 CHLORINE 1TON ) LB.
CYLINDER No Bid
30 CHLORINE 150 LB. ] LB.
CYLINDER No Bid
CITRIC ACID 50% 250 GAL TOTE ] WET LB.
31 No Bid
32 CITRIC ACID 50% 55 GAL.DRUM No Bid WET LB.
33 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 50LB No Bid DRY LB.
BAGS/PALLET o bl
COPPER SULFATE 50 LB. BAG i DRY LB.
344 FINE # 30 No Bid
COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50 LB. BAG ) DRY LB,
34b No Bid
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK ) DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 32%-38% No Bid
36 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38% No Bid
(Alternative Bid)
37 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK _ WET LB.
No Bid
38 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID-24% | 55 GAL. DRUM ) WET LB,
No Bid
HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% | 270 gallon totes . WET LB.
39 g No Bid
40 LIME (HYDRATED) 50 LB BAGS _ DRY LB.
2 ton min. No Bid
LIME SLURRY BULK ] PER TON
41 No Bid
42 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK ] GAL.
(<15 PPM THC) No Bid
43 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK . GAL.
(<40 PPM THC) No Bid
LIQUID POLYMER 275 GAL TOTE ; GAL.
44 Q 2 GALTO No Bid
45 LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS BULK No Bid WET LB.
8500 OR EQUAL)
MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275 GAL TOTES ) GAL.
46 No Bid
New Kem
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T 47 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK _ CU FT.
No Bid
48 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK No Bid CUFT.
{alternate bid) 0 Bl
49 METHANOL (100%) 55 GAL DRUM _ GAL.
No Bid
50 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME BULK GAL.
(1,000 — 3,000) No Bid
galton delivered
51 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55 GAL DRUM Bid GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified No Bi
MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 520 LB, DRUM _ LB.
52 No Bid
53 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME | 4, 1-gallon jugs . GAL
per box No Bid
54 MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK _ GAL.
(300-350 gal) No Bid
55 MURIATIC ACID - 20% 15 GAL. _ GAL.
CARBQY No Bid
56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME | PUMPTED TOTE _ GAL.
{300-350 gal) No Bid
57 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50 LB PAILS . LB,
NEW ITEM (CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL) No Bid
58 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL _ GAL.
(CARUS 4500) DRUMS No Bid
59 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK Bid LB.
(AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) (300-500 GAL) No Bi
60 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON No Bid B.
{50%-50% Blend) DRUM 0 ol
61 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55 GALLON
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM No Bid LB.
{Aquamag or equal)
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON _ LB.
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM No Bid
ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55 GALLON . LB.
63 o/ 0015, No Bid
(10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM
64 POLYPHOSPHATE 340 LBS DRUM _ LB.
(STERLING CP-33) No Bid
65 PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) 30 GALLON _ GAL.
(SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS DRUMS No Bid
8100)
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66 POLYMER (MANNICH) BULK _ LB. i
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 No Bid
67 POLYMER {ANIONIC) 275 GAL, _ GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTE No Bid
68 POLYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL. _ GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTE No Bid
69 POYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL. ] GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTE No Bid
70 POLYMER 55 GAL GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM No Bid
71 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15 GAL. DRUM , WET LB.
75% SOLUTION No Bid
72 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK _ GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) No Bid
73 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275 GAL TOTE ‘ GAL
{HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) No Bid
74 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL.
(HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL) No Bid
75 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE ‘
(HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK No Bid GAL.
EQUAL)
76 SMALL BULK WET LB.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 400 -1,000 gal. No Bid
Deliveries
77 LARGE BULK WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 1,001 - 5,000 No Bid '
Gal. Deliveries
78 BULK
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE -45% | 800 - 1,500 gal WET LB
- shorter No Bid
wheelbase
delivery
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTE . WET LB.
/9 ’ No Bid
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 55 GAL. DRUM ] WET LB.
80 i No Bid
81 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 15 GAL. PAIL _ WET LB.
No Bid
82 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 LB. DRUM No Bid LB.
] {U.S. ONLY) 0 bl
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83 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE | 330 LB. DRUM , 8. |
(U.S. ONLY) No Bid
84 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB. PAILS _ LB.
(U.S. ONLY) No Bid
85 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 LB. DRUM No Bid LB.
(FOREIGN- Alternative Bid) 0 b
36 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE | 330 LB. DRUM _ LB.
(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) No Bid
87 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB. PAILS No Bid LB.
(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) ool
a8 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK No Bid WET LB.
(AWWA B405 — LATEST) o bl
89 SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK . DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) No Bid
30 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG _ DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) Full Truckioad No Bid
Release
91 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER ) Full Truckload No Bid
Release
92 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG No Bid DRY LB,
(WASTEWATER) Per Pallet O bl
93 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK No Bid WET LB.
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL+
94 SODIUM BISULFITE- MINI-BULK No Bid WET LB.
38% SOLUTION < 800 GAL c o
95 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55 GAL. DRUM _ WET LB.
38% SOLUTION No Bid
96 SODIUM 50 LBS BAGS No Bid DRY LB,
METABISULFITE (GRANULAR) 2 pallet deliv, 0 bl
97 SODIUM CARBONATE 50 LB. BAG _ DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE No Bid
98 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS No Bid DRY LB,
SODA ASH -DENSE 0 bi
99 SODIUM CARBONATE BULK No Bid DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE 0Bl
100 SODIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG ] DRY LB,
No Bid
101 SODIUM CHLORITE — BULK _ WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY No Bid
NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2023-2024) 6 of 10 pages




102 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM ) WETLB. |
25% SOLUTION - U.S. ONLY No Bid
103 SODIUM CHLORITE - 25% BULK id WET LB.
FOREIGN {afternate bid) No Bi
104 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) No Bid
105 SODIUM CHLORITE — BULK _ WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for No Bid
wastewater use only
106 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA far No Bid
wastewater use only
107 SODIUM CHLORITE - 55 GAL. DRUM X DRY LB.
(SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID) No Bid
108 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 40 BAG No Bid
PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS
109 SODIUM FLUQRIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
U.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50 .
o Bid
LB. BAGS No B
110 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG _
{Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50 No Bid
LB. BAGS
111 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50 No Bid
(Alternative Bid) LB. BAGS
112 SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG ] DRY LB.
No Bid
Sodium Hexametaphosphate | 55 GAL DRUM . WET LB,
113 pnash No Bid
PRISTINE SK-7641
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5% 250 GAL TOTE , WET LB.
114 No Bid
115 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 5 GAL CARBOYS ] WET LB.
No Bid
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 300-2,000 Gal. . WET LB.
116 No Bid
BULK
117 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% SMALL BULK
400 - 1,000 No Bid WET LB.
| Gal. deliveries
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118 | SOBIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% LARGE BULK
1,001 ~7,000 No Bid WET LB,
Gal. deliveries
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK .
119 Certified Refrigerated Storage (400-5,000 gal. No Bid WET LB,
and Delivery (Alternative Bid) deliveries)
SOPIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 55 GAL. DRUMS . WET LB.
120 ’ No Bid
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% 275 GAL. . WET.LB.
121 No Bid
TOTE
122 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30 GAL. ) WET LB.
CONTAINER No Bid
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15 GAL. ) WET LB.
123 ’ No Bid
CONTAINER
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 5 GAL. . WET LB.
124 i CONTAINER No Bid
125 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 1 GAL. ) WET LB.
CONTAINER No Bid
SODIUM PERMANGANATE 55 GAL DRUM . GAL.
126 D ERMANG L S No Bid
SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE 50 LB. BAG . DRY LB,
127 No Bid
SCDIUM THIOSULFATE (penta- 25 KG BAGS X DRY KG.
128 No Bid
hydrate)
F BUL . PER TON
129 SULFUR DIOXIDE K No Bid 0
SULP - : -
130 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275 TOTE No Bid PER GAL
{30%)
INC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG . DRY LB,
131 | NCHEXAMETAPHOS : No Bid
{V-937 OR EQUAL
ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GALTOTE . ET. LB,
132 ORTHOPHOSPHA © No Bid WET- L8
{(V-970 OR EQUAL)
ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK . WET LB.
133 No Bid
(V-970 OR EQUAL)
ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55 GAL. DRUM . WET LB.
134 No Bid
135 ZINC ORTHOPHOQSPHATE 50 LB. PAIL No Bid DRY LB,
(CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL)
136 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL. DRUMS GAL.
{SHANNON 5LC 321 OR CARUS No Bid
3180)
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137 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GAL. [ GAL. K
{SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTE No Bid
3180)
15-GAL PAIL GAL
138 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE .
(CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL) No Bid
ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK N WET LB.
139 (5L1-932 OR EQUAL] No Bid
' BULK . WET LB.
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE
(V-939 OR EQUAL) No Bid
WET LB.
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK .
{UPZ-511 OR EQUAL) No Bid
BULK WET LB.
14 ZINC ORTHOPHQSPHATE )
2 {CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL) No Bid
. ETLB.
143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK No Bid w
{SL1-839 OR EQUAL)

144 Emergency Pumping and Storage Daily Fee: Chemicals that
Tanker to support temporary on- Bid bulk pumping
site storage for utility that needs No Bi and storage

L to repair containment vessel. j will support:
PROPOSAL FROM:

Fillion Associates, Inc.

PO Box 14518

East Providence, Rl 02914

Telephone: (401) 438-6566 email;  tanya@fillionassociates.com

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium {(NEMVCC) and our Host Community
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda: N/A
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To Whom it May Concern:

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, 1/we hereby certify
that 1 am/we are, the only person (s} interested in this proposal as principal(s); that it is made without
collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the following prices.

SIGNATU ,-,
s T

Authorizing Signature

Ruth Bowser, President
Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

3/20/2023
Date

| certify under the penaity of perjury that |, to the best of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns
and paid all state taxes required under law,

*Signature of Individual or Carporate Name {Mand _Fillion @PC@E}' Inc.

By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable):

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this certification clause is signed
by the applicant,

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES
All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the

warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must make arrangements to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be
assigned to the owner. The owner
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OFFICIAL BID FORM

 NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM
FISCAL YEAR 2023-2024

| i B P
o4 [03-1]-Z0 T ; |
M a2 o < S S - |
- SN SURUE S ]
venoor | (- AC. (il _CotPoration” ]
1 i 1 o ]
810 PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS B1D FORM
CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNITRID PER
1 ALUMINUN CHLOROHYDRATE 15GaL | T T gan T
P {ACH) PAILS No RxD 3
Ty ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000 GAL. GAL,
- (ACH) BULK MO oD
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE  50% BULK T T
| SOLUTION {500 ~ 5,000 GALLON
. Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric | Gal. deliveries)
i Acid Preparation N O BI:D }
. o NSEEO/ANSI o . ;
4 ALUMINUM SULEATE - 50% BULK
) SOLUTION {500 - 5,000 GALLON
i Other Prep Method Gal. defiveries) @ .40
Alternative Bid
e} . NSF GO/ANSI
5 AMMONIA GAS 150 LB, 8.
[f cvunoen | AJO o
e ;
6 AMMONIUM SULFATE 50 LB. 8AG ﬁ DRY LB,
i 7 AMMONHLUM SULFATE 500 - 1,600 GAL.
: 140% SOLUTION) Gal. delivenes | MO B0
o 8 ANTHRACITE B0+ L BS. BAGS ND CUFT.
i m D
9 AQUEOUS AMMONIA 1,000 Gal, GAL.
l’ MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) detiveries | ND) T
[ CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30 GAL DRUM GAL.
[ {PHOSPHORIC ACID) NO 33D
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™ T CALCIQUEST ORTHO

11 15 GAL DRUM | éaL
[PROSPHORIC ACID) N QT
13 "TCALCIUMCHIORIDE | SOLB. BAG ,.N R Y AT
13 | CAIGUIMCHLORIDE | SUPERSACK By e
R No 3o
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/SO - 50 L85
wswes | g BT
15 TCALTIUM HYPOCHLORITE LESS THAN T
PALLET - 50 LBS
16 CALCIUM HYPGCHLORITE 55 LBS 185
{Accu-Tab Blue 5 by Fillion PAILS
i Associates) _Ajm_ ]
17 CALCIUN HYPOCHLORITE 55 LES. 185.
{Accu-Tab S) by Axiall LLC) PAILS .Mﬂ m
18 | CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery | ‘ DRY L.
{40/50 1b. bags) _pjo &:D
" 19 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK ; LB,
T ) ol |
20 CARBON POWDERED BULK TON
1 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK Ny DRY LB
a2 T CAUSTIC SODA - " SMALL BULK - WET B
25% SOLUTION 500 — 1,000
Gal. debveries |[NO BID B o
23 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK W1 B
25% SOLUTION 1,001 — 5,000
R cal. gelveies WO 3CO |
24 CAUSTIC SODA - | 55GAL DRUM WET 1B.
25% SOLUTION N B 0
26 1T TTTCAUSTICS0DA - 275 GAL. TOTE TWET LB,
25 % SO,
S U= % SOLUTION ND ﬁn S !
26 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK Wit LB
50% SOLUTION 500 - 1,500
Gal. deliveries NO m
e T s | GRGERIR J | -
50% SOLUTION 1,501 ~ 6,000 WT LB
b Gl deiveries (INO QL0+
28 CHLORINE- DRY {HTH} 50 LB, PAILS DRY 18, |
i po Ol
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D9 | CHIORINE T 1ToM T e, T
[ CYLINDER N A RED
g " CHIORINE 15018 La.
i CYUINDER 0 1D
31 1 omRcatiDow T 0 GaLTort CWETLE ]
3 CITRIC ACID 50% 55 GAL.DRUM weria,
A 0 B30
33 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 5018 DRY LB.
BAGS/PALET | MO 2T
" '34a | COPPER SULFATE SOLB.BAG | DRY 1B, |
FINE # 30 AND D
T3ap COPPERSULFATE LARGE | SOLB.BAG | T ToRyis. T
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BUILK ! DRY L8
U.5. ONLY 32%-38% +N D @D_
36 FERRIC CHLORIDE - Y o “pRY.E.
FOREIGN: 32%- 38% :
_ {Ahernative Bid) 1 aAlo 1IN ;
37 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK WET LS.
Y HYDROFLUQSILICIC ACID- 24% | 55 GAL. DRUM 5 WET LB,
[ 39 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ATID- 24% | 270 gation totes \ o " WET LB,
o . o &5
40 LIME (HYDRATED) 5000 BAGS DRY L.
L 2tormin.  [AJ0) &I@
i 41 LIME SLURRY BULK ’\) _..,0 PER TON
P o e v e e P TR e 1 £ e e e e 1 0 %L P |
42 LIGND OXYSEN BULK GAL.
tasermtie) INO RTO
43 | LGUID OXYGEN BULK | R T
t<opemTHO INO 00
44 TTLIOUID POLYMER 275 GAL TOTE - Y
S &0
45 | LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE {CARUS BULK WETLB
| 8500 OR EQUAL) IND Mﬂ
b ] N
T 1: MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275 GAL TOTES T
_Mewitem | e NO BP0
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" 47 | MANGANESEGREENSAND | BULK 3 = eUFT.
S o &3
48 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK CUF.
b fotematetid) NO B30 |
49 METHANOL (100%) 55 GAL GRUM GAL.
S , 1v0 ¥T0
50 MURIATIC AC(D-20° BAGME BULK GAL.
{1,000 - 3,000}
S salondelvered JJO BED |
.51 MURIATIC ACID-20" BALME 55 GAL DRUM GAL. !
; SNHIBITED - NSF Certified NO TP
- P S Lib.t e
[ 52 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME | 520 LB. DRUM NO LB,
- 53 | MURIATICACID- 20° BAUME | 4, 1-gallon jugs | . .. .. GAL j
L perbor - O IO |
54 MURRATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK Ceal T
... 4 wBosogh NO PO |
55 MURIATIC ACID - 20% 15 GAL. GAL.
CARBOY i ¥t
56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME PUMPTED TOTE GAL
-1 oo3soga) ([NQ BTO |
57 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50 LB PAILS L8,
| ew e (CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL) NO 210
58 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL " GAL,
(CARUS 4500) DRUMS o 10
59 | ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK BT
[ADUAMAG OR EQUAL) poosoocay (N0 B30
60 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON i6.
o (%S0 Blena om  NOGID |
61 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE S5GALLON
{50%-50% Blend) DRUM 1B,
T fAguamag or equai} e ND {510
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON L6,
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM N 310 |
63 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE S5 GALLON L8,
{10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND orum (A (33D
64 POLYPHOSPHATE 340 LBS DRUM L8,
{STERLING CP-33} NO BTV
. B5 | PHOSPHATE {LiGUID] 30GALION | GAL.
{SHANNON SUI 5225 OR CARUS oRUMS \jn Gf{) '
S N BlOO) . R A " ,J e
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g | PoLymERiMaNRICH) BULK 7
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 i
67 POLYMER (aMIONIC) T 275 GAL GAL. '
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1930 TOTE
68 POLYMER {CATIONIC) 275 GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTE D &0
69 POYMER (CATIONIC) T 275 GAL GAL
SNF POYDYNE NE 1322 TOTE &0
70 POLYMER 55 GAL GAL
SNF POLYOYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM
MO 10
71 ~ PHOSPHORIC ACID 15 GAL, DRUM T U weTe
_ 75% SOLUTION | ) 0 31O ;
72 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL ‘
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUUAL) a1 O SIP
R S . ol N —
73 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275 GAL TOTE GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 120 or EQUAL
L erequay | IND (55D
74 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL.
, ;
7 {HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUIAL} ;
L 75 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE |
(HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BLILK GAL
o gauay L 0 1Y
76 SMALL BULK WET LB.
POTASSILUM HYDROXIDE- 45% | A00 -1,000 gal.
. L Deliveries
77 LARGE BULK WET 18
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% | 1,001 - 5,000
Jros ot s o 6 4w e amem— — GaL De“ve’!es
78 BULK
! POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% | 800~ 1,500 ga! W78
- shorter
wheelbase
S B svey NOBSD |
79 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% TOTE » WET LB,
[ R Mo T
30 POTASS|UM HYDROXIDE- 45% | 55 GAL. DRUM WET LA,
S S NO BTD
81 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% | 15 GAL, PAIL WET LE.
82 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 (8. DRUM LB.
(0.5, ONLY} N %}D

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages { FY 2023-2024)
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‘g3 | POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE | 2301B.0RuM | (8.
{US. ONLY) NO &0
[ 84 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 8. PALS 1
L {U.S. ONLY} No &0 -
85 POTASHUM PERMANGANATE | 55 LB. DRUM LB, 1
{FOREIGN. Alternative Bid) § B30 !
oo e ” ST B, o —
86 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE  § 330 LB. GRUM LB,
(FOREIGN - Aternative Bid) o B8O .
87 | POTASSUM PERMANGANATE LB. PAILS ~ 1 BT
[FOREIGN - Alternative Bit) M0 1))
88 | SODIUM ALUMINATE: 38% Buik | WETLE, |
{AWWA BAC5 — LATEST) NO KD
" 89 SODIUM B'CARBONATE BULK o DRY LB,
AWWA/NSF 50} ) 8 K0 -
90 SODIUM BICARBONATE 5DLBS. BAG L bAY LB,
[AWWAINSF 60} Full Truckioad
g1 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 B3, BAG DRY LB,
: {WASTEWATER ) Full Truckioad
o o Reiease f) 0 m
92 SODILUM BICARBONATE 50 1BS. BAG DRY 8.
{WASTEWATER) Per Pallet A} OCTD
93 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK WETLE
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL+ 0 &LO i
94 SODIUM BISULFITE- MIN--BLIK WET1B. |
38% SOLUTION <800 GAL 0 630 i
g5 " SODIUM BISULFITE- 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB,
38% SOLLTION NO TO
a6 | SODIUM S0 LBS BAGS DRY LB,
METABISULFITE (GRANULAR} | 2 pallet deliv. | Ny (5T
97 SODIUM CARBONATE 50 LB. BAG DRY (8, |
SODA ASH- DENSE 0 31O
ag SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS DRY1B,
SODA ASH  DENSE 0 3D
99 SODIUM CAREONATE BULK DRY LB,
SODA ASH- DENSE NH (1D
100 SODIUM CHLORIDE S0 LB. BAG | DRY LB,
ND BT0
T SODIUM CHLORITE - BUIK T weTie,
101 :
25% SOLUTION ~ U.S. ONLY nNO @O :

NEMVYCC Dfficial Bid Form and Signature Pages { FY 2022-2024)
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118 | SODIUMHYPOCHLORITE - 15% | LARGE BULK
1,001 7,000 WET LB.
j Gal deliverles J\} D v
i j
! SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% BULK
| 119 | Certified Refrigarated Storage | (400-5,000 gal. WET L8
L - f..ndDelvery (Atemativepid) | deiveriess WO QXD
{120 SODHUM HYPOCHLORITE. 15% | 55 GAL DRUMS WET L.
: NO GxY
i.,yv s vmosacn o e LR p—
i 121 1 SODWM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% 275 GAL. | WETAB.
U122 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE. 15% 30 GAL. WET(B.
‘ CONTAINER ;
A " No@SD |
T 123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15 GAL. wertp,
| CONTANER g BID
F..‘. e - - e S PN SR
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE . 15% 5 GAl. WET LB,
CONTANER | Aly INEO
125 | SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% "1GAL T T wET s,
CONTAINER
b NO BT
126 SODIUM PERMANGANATE 55 GAL DRUMS GAL
o o __INO B1D
127 S0DIUN SILICOF LUORIDE 5015, 3AC DAY LB,
128 SODIUIM THIOSULFATE fpenia. s¥GBAGS | DRY KG,
hydrate) NO Bi\o
129 SULFUR DIOXIDE BULK "PERTON
L . NO BTD
130 THIOSULPHATE - CALEILM 275 TOTE PER GAL,
- A30%) o NO BT
131 ZNE HERAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB, BAG ORY LB,
| wo37OREQUAL oo |
132 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GAL TOTE WET. 8.
Tl _Mwewortauay ¢ Np B0 .
133 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB,
L i __twor00REQUAL] o 3o |
134 ZINC GRTHOPHOSPHATE S5 GAL DRUM WET LB,
135 ZINC ORTHOPHGSPHATE 50 8. PARL DAY LB,
T (CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL) ‘ ND D30 o
136 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL. DRUMS GAL.
j {SHANNON 5LC 321 OR CARUS |
S SR T do sy |
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137 7INC ORTHOPHOSPHATE | 275 GAL. E GAL B
{SHANNON 5LC 321 OR CARUS TOTE
. 138 'ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE | 15-GAL PAIL GaL
; {CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL}Y | No MD
i -
139 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB,
e (SL1-932 OR EQUAL) NO 1O
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB,
| {v-939 OR FQUAL) A NO G
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET L.
r ol wPrs110REQUAY NOBTD |
! 142 " ZNC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB,
‘ [CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL) MO B0
143 ZINE ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB,
' {511-930 OR EQUAL) N ¥TD
; y | Emergency Pumping and Storage | Dally Fee: | Chemicals that
144
i Tanker to suppart temporary on- bulk pumping
i site storage for utllity that needs and stosage
l  torepair cotainment vessel. rJ 0 6’}9 will suppart:

PROPOSAL FROM: G A'C/ C\'z\ em‘l Cgvk CO{‘FO‘\CCH on
34 Kidder Print Roud

Telephone: 26_] 5({% dﬁﬁ email: eOhQ,mbefs Cﬂmelﬂu(al LOvIn

to furnish various bid products in accordince with specifications attached, it being furthér understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Vailey Chemical Consortium (NEMVCC) and our Host Community
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids In whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it sha | be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of thetollow mg Addem:la

-
Signature: /
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"o Wham 't May Concern:

in accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Va'ley Chemical Consortium invibng
proposals for furn shing Chemicals in confarmity wh the attached specifications, I/we hereby certify
that | am/we are, the on y person (s) interested in this proposal as principal(s); that 1t is made without
collus on with any person, firm, or corporat on, that an examination has been made of the specificatvons;
and thal the equipment/materials w Il be delivered within the time specified, at the following pr ces.

ﬁwmﬂ%£:i;'22zzzgzzi:“\\

Print Name ag/Title of Authonizing Signature

S~(7-23

Uate

t certify under the penaity of perjury that i, to the best of my knowledge, have fled al state tax returns
and paid atl state taxes required under law.

*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name (Mandatory):
By: Corporate Qfficer (Mandatory, if Appl cable):
*&ppraval of a contract ar other agreement w | not be granted unless this certification clause is signed
by the appl'cant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES
All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantess must inciude with their sealed
proposa a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as wel as a copy of the
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.
The bidder must make arrangements to assure the cwner that the warranties or guarantees can be

assigrred to the owner. The owner's intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or
puarantees as part of the awarding procedure,
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. Ghemical Corporation

AFFIDAVIT

STATE OF MAINE

COUNTY OF WALDO

Craig Martin, being first duly sworn, deposes and says that
the Aluminum Sulfate & Aqua Aide Crystal produced by GAC CHEMICAL
CORPORATION does hereby comply with all applicable requirements of ANSI / NSF

and AWWA standards.

Vice President of Sales & Marketin

TITLE

Subscribed and sworn to before me this 17™ day of March 2023.
A o
iy

NOTARY

A,

EM'LY § CHAMBERS

e
) Notay Pub! ¢c-Msine
4 » My Commission Expires
Augusi1 08 2027




Ao
—

NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM

FISCAL YEAR 2023-2024

OFFICIAL 8D FORM

' DATE:

Harees

“VENDOR:

\d

NOTE B PRICES MUST BF PER URIT SPECIFIED ON THIS B0 FORI
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNITBID | PER
...... No. . - - - P
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15 GAL GAL
- (AcH) PAILS No Bid
9 | ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000 GAL. GAL.
{ACH) BULK No Bid
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK '
SOLUTION {500 - 5,000 GALLON
Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric ;| Gal. deliveries) f
Acid Preparation
NSF 60/ANSI e No Bid
4 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION {500 - 5,000 GALLON
Other Prep Method i Gal. deliveries) :
Alternative Bid ]
- . NsFeO/ANSI . NoBd ;. o
% 5 AMMONIA GAS 1501B. LB. ;
; CYLINDER . l
; : ... No Bid S ——
B AMMONIUM SULFATE 50LB.BAG | DRY L8. |
L - - No Bid .
7 AMMONIIUM SULFATE 500 - 1,000 GAL.
E (40% SOLUTION) Gal. deliveries No Bid
8 ANTHRACITE 504 LBS. BAGS CUFT. |
. - _No Bid . i
g AQUEOUS AMMONIA 1,000 Gal. | GAL,
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries | o @id |
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30 GAL. DRUM TGAL.
{(PHOSPHORIC ACID} No Bid |
NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2023-2024) 1 of 10 pages



11 CALCIQUESTORTHO ' 15 GAL DRUM GAL.
{PHOSPHORIC ACID) No Bid
12 " CALCIUM CHLORIDE S0LB. BAG b DRYLB.
o B o - $0.4800/1b.
13 CALCIUIM CHLORIDE SUPERSACK DRY LB.
o o No Bid
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE | PALLET/50 50 LBS
| LBSBAGS No Bid
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE | LESS THAN o LBS
PALLET - 50 LBS
S _ . BAGS | NoBid .
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 LBS LBS
{Accu-Tab Blue S} by Fillion PAILS
Associates) ~ S No Bid
17 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 LBS. LBS.
{Accu-Tab 5t by Axiall LLC) PAILS No. Bid
NTE;_ T T CALCIUM NITRATE Perton delivery { /, DRY LB.
. . (40/50 Ib. bags) | g0 5450/, B
19 CARBON DIOXIDE ' BULK : LB.
e — _No Bid
20 CARBON POWDERED BULK TON
o . NoBid .
21 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK DRYLB. |
b o , . No Bid .
Y CAUSTIC SODA - SMALL BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 500 — 1,000
— . . Gal, deliveries No Bid I
a3 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK  WETLB.
| 25% SOLUTION 1,001 - 5,000 ;
& q_@!. delivefies_ No Bid o
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 55 GAL. DRUM | WETLB.
925 CAUSTIC SODA - - 275GAL.TOTE | ' W LB.
25 % SOLUTION | $0.1820/b.%/
26 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK WET LB.
50% SOLUTION 500 — 1,500
Gal. deliveries No Bid
97 CAUSTIC SODA — LARGE BULK
50% SOLUTION 1,501 - 6,000 ., WTLE.
( _ Gal.‘rd_eliveries No Bid -
28 CHLORINE- DRY {HTH) . SOLB.PAILS B DRY LB.
- | | $3.9800/Ib.**
NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages { FY 2023-2024) 2 of 10 pages
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ng [ CHLORINE 1TON ! T ) |
: 30 CHLORINE 150 LB. LB.
| o .| CyLnDER NoBid .} .
3 1 | CITRIC ACID 50% 250 GAL TOTE* /1/ WET LB.
; H v
R N . | $1.3080/b. -
' 3 2 CITRIC ACID 50% i 55 GAL.DRUM \/ WET LB.
. | . i $1.3280/Ib. o
33 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 50 (B _ DRYLB. .
(W i
e BAGS/PALLET | 34 8820/1b. |
343 COPPER SULFATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB,
\’.
e\ FNE®30 | $2.1150/b. o
34b COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50 LB. BAG .. DRYLB.
e ' s2:5800, ] o
[ 3 5 ; FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY LB. !
L | Us.ONLY 32%-38% . _|__NoBid

35 I FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY.LB.
: FOREIGN: 32%-38% ‘ -
_— . _{(Alternative Bid) oo NoBd | _
} 37 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24%, BULK ; WET LB. .

_ | . NoBid _ | §

38 1 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 55 GAL. DRUM V’/ WET LB.
i N R . 50.5146/b. .
i 39 ‘ HYDROFLUQSILICIC ACID- 249% 270 gallon totes L . 4 WET LB.
— - . $0.6400/Ib.

40 LIME (HYDRATED) 50 LB BAGS ‘v/ DRY LB.
T S : _tonmin. | eno780Mb. |
: 41 : LIME SLURRY i BULK ) PER TON f
N o | NoBid
’ 42 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
S [ <ISPPMTHO) | NoBd ]

43 LIGUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
e (<40PPMTHC) | NoBid | L
r 44 LIQUID POLYMER 275 GALTOTE GAL.
L N NoBid | ]

45 J‘ LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE {CARUS BULX WET LB. -

. 8500 OR EQUAL) No Bid - ]

46 i‘ MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 1 275 GALTOTES GAL.

_New Item | ’ i _NoBid |
*275 gl. tote
NEMVCC Official 8id Form and Signature Pages { FY 2023-2024) 3 of 10 pages



47 |  MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK L CUFT.
] o | NoBid w
48 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK CUFT. |
{alternate bid) No Bid
49 ~ METHANOL (100%) 55 GAL DRUM | y GAL. |
I R , - $5.8000/g1.

50 | MURIATICACID-20° BAUME | BULK GAL. i

i © (1,000 - 3,000) Nl
N oo . Balion defivered - $3 3800/g). ——_
51 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55 GAL DRUM s GAL
INHIBITED - NSF Certified $6.5950/gl.

57 'MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME | 5201B.DRUM | - 1B
3 e - " B $0.3600/Ib. * | R

53 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME | 4, 1-gailon jugs . | GAL

1o » ___perbox NoBid |

54 MURIATIC ACID - 15% | TOTE BULK - GAL
: . .. [300350gal | g3 7080/g1. | )
Y- MURIATIC ACID — 20% 15 GAL. GAL.
L . . | CARBOY No Bid |
" 56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME | PUMPTED TOTE Wi GAL.

| o _,..[800350gal) | g3 4100791, | ]

57 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50 L8 PAILS Vi LB. ‘
| wewmem  (CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL)* $2.7860/b. |
' 5g | ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL T GAL
. ! (CARUS 4500) DRUMS 515.4200/ci
59 | ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK o LB
_ {AQUAMAG OR EQUAL} {300-500 GAL) No Bid
60 |  ORTHOPOLYPHOSPHATE™ | ~30GALLON A L8. ‘

W : H
|61 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE ** 55GALLON |
: (50%-50% Blend) DRUM . LB. |
S {Aquamag or equal) . .| $1.4800/b. ., _ ;
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON | 4 LB.
; (30%-70% BLEND) *** DRUM | $1.5800/b. |
. 63 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE ' S5GALLON | 8.
(10%-90% ORTHO/POLYBLEND | DRUM | o Bid

64 ~ POLYPHOSPHATE | 3401BSDRUM | T A
. (seRuNGCP33) | | NoBid | |
65 i PHOSPHATE {LIQUID) 30 GALLON | /4/ GAL.

[ (SHANNON SL15225 OR CARUS | DRUMS ,‘ )
L ' 8100) L . $16.9300/g1. |
*Aquacros HC-3815

*Aguacros HC-2050 i
NEﬂWCC Ofﬁtl:ial 8?3 Form and Signature Pages { FY 2023-2024)
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66 | POLYMER (MANNICH) CBULK LB.
| SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 No Bid
67 | POLYMER (ANIONIC} 275 GAL. GAL. !
i f SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 : TOTE No Bid
68 POLYMER {CATIONIC) | 275GAL. GAL.
| . SNFPOLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTE No Bid |
- 69 | POYMER (CATIONIC) | 275GAL GAL. F
I SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTE No Bid
70 POLYMER ' 55GAL GAL ‘
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM
o S ... NoBid | _
71 PHOSPHORIC ACID | 15 GAL. DRUM . WETLS.
! i 75% SOLUTION J No Bid j
7 | POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE | BULK | GAL
5 {(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) ' NoBd .
73 . POLYALUMINUM CH(ORIDE | 275 GALTOTE ; ' ; GAL
_‘ {HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL} No Bid ‘
72 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK |  GAL
{HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL)
75 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE i i
(HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK = GAL. &
. .. EQual) . 4*_@3;@ e o]
76 SMALL BULK | | WETLB.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% = 400-1,000 gal. |
S .. Deliveries . Nopig |
77 { LARGE BULK WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE ~45% | 1,001 - 5,000
. .. Gal. Deliveries No Bid o
78 BULK ‘ i
| POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE -45% | 800 — 1,500 gaf | | WETLB
’ - shorter |
wheelbase
. - _ delivery No Bid
79 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTE | WET LB.
i |
§ _ . . - ‘M$Q5890ﬂbuj, .
80 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE-45% | 55 GAL DRUM / WET LB.
e . L 061000,
81 | POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE—45% 15 GAL PAIL WET LB.
S S : . 1. 50.7820/1b. |, o
82 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 LB. DRUM . / LB,

{U.S. ONLY)

I . $4.1000/1b,

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages { FY 2023-2024)
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83 | POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE | 330 LB. DRUM | \E/
|
| _(US.ONLY) . 840100V
84 | POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5LB.PAILS ! LB.
(U-S. onLY) ___No Bid
|85 | POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE | 55 LB. DRUM | / T3 ;
| E (FOREIGN- Alternative Bid) $4.1000/b"" | !
| 86 | POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE | 33018.DRUM LB,
I (fPﬁEIGN - AF’ternativePid) ; | _$4.0100/Ib. ]
87 | POTASSIUMPERMANGANATE .  51B.PAILS LB.
‘ ~ {FOREIGN - Alternative Bid} | No Bid
| 88 | SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK WETLB. |
‘= . (AWWA B40S ~ LATEST) No Bid |
89 ' SODIUM BICARBONATE | BULK | DRYLB.
_ i {AWWA/NSF 60) : No Bid .
90 .  SODIUMBICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRYLB.
; : {AWWA/NSF 60) Full Truckload
I . Release No Bid
91 |  SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB,
(WASTEWATER } Full Truckioad 1 _
;__m o o ‘ Release '___No Bid E o
92 ] SODIUM BICARBONATE | 50LBS. BAG '/ DRYLSB.
; (WASTEWATER} Per Pallet $0 5890.!!!3\/

93 | SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK ! T WETB. |
L | 38% SOLUTION L000GALY NoBig |/ |
94 | SODIUM BISULF{TE- MINI-BULK . )(f WET LB,

38% SOLUTION <sooGAL | $0.3120/ 'b "'l
" g5 | SODIUM BISULFITE- '55GAL.DRUM ' /S WETB. |
38% SOLUTION i $0.31 20Hb. !
96 | SODIUM S0LBSBAGS | .~ DRYB.
| METABISULFITE (GRANULAR) 2palletdeliv. | on gangpn
97 SODIUM CARBONATE S50LB.BAG ° ./ DRVLB.
1 SODA ASH- DENSE $0.3875/lb. |
o8 | SODIUM CARBONATE  SUPER SACKS | ’ DRY LB,
; SODA ASH -DENSE | No Bid
99 SODIUM CARBONATE TBUK T DRY(B. |
1 |
- ; SODAASH-DENSE | .ﬁ__j__,go,aosanb,_. | ]
100 | SODIUM CHLORIDE | S0LB.BAG | | DRvws. |
L N o . NoBid .
101 SODIUM CHLORITE- | BULK | T wETs, ]
- | 25%SOLUTION-US.ONLY | o " No Bid 1 ]
*Sodlum Bisulfite mml-bulk to be done as a tote pump off.
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102 SODIUM CHLORITE- [” 55 GAL DRUM f WET LB.
.. 25%SOLUTION-US.ONLY __NoBid | .
103 | SODIUMCHLORITE-25% | BULK i - weT |
_ |  FOREIGN (alternate bid) ; _ NoBid ] ]
104 |  SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55 GALDRUM | . WETLB. |
: ; FOREIGN (aiternate bid) , _' !
P e .0 NoBd [ L
| 105 SODIUM CHLORITE — BULK : | weETLB. |
| 25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for | ’ ;
é 106 ! * SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GALDRUM | | WETLB.
;’ - 25% SOLUTION - non-AWWA for | ' ) ; :
L— . wastewater use only ) | NO Bid ! o
' 107 SODIUM CHLORITE — 55 GAL. DRUM ( r DRY LB. '
| {SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID) ! | Nogid ]: |
7108 7 sobium FiuoRiDE - LESS THAN FULL | . DRYLB. |
| | U.S. ONLY ' ADBAG | ;
| | | PALLETS 0F 50 | | E
SR o | _ LB.BAGS No Bid | ‘ _1
109 | SODIUM FLUORIDE " FULL40 BAG ' DRYIB. |
U.S ONLY . PALLETS OF 50 | .
f ; LB. BAGS | ' j
R L - . _i_ NoBid ‘ . |
110 SODIUM FLUORIDE ' LESS THAN FULL | DRY LB F
FOREIGN i 40 BAG ; e
J (Alternative Bid) | PALLETS OF 50 | \j
e J' B . S LB.BAGS | $1.6680/Ib. J
111 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG ! | DRYLB
;‘ : FOREIGN | PALLETS OF 50 i \/
4 (AMternative Bid) | 1B.BAGS | 81, 2960/b. |
112 | SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE | | 501B.BAG l ' DRYLB '
[ . e _NoBid |
113 | Sodium Hexametaphosphate | 55 GAL DRUM | f [ WET LB |
| PRISTINE SK-7641 f | No Bid |
114 | SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 5% | 250 GALTOTE o CWeTwe,
i i N | Nosig BN |
115 ' SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-12.5% | 5 GAL CARBOYS ‘ | WETLB, |
S _— ... NoBid J
| 116 | SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE. 12.5% ’ 300-2,000 Gal. | WET LB |
| ! | BUK | o )
- 117 | SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% ' SMALLBULK | I
| i 400 — 1,000 ] WET LB
. L i _ Gal. deliveries | No Bid | )
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. 118 | SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% | LARGEBULK ! :
: ‘ | 1,001 7,000 WET LB,
i |_Gal. deliveries . No Bid j
{
| SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% | BULK |
119 ' certified Refrigerated Storage . (400-5,000 gal, | WETLB. |
. ....|__and Delivery (Alternative Bid) | _deliveries) ! _NoBid . o
120 ' SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% | 55 GAL DRUMS | \// WETLB. |
_ . | s02080i. Y] o
121 | SODIUMMHYPOCHLORITE-15% | 275 GAL ‘ AVET.LB. |
| ! TOTE |
S B o . $0.2980/1b. o
122 SODIUM HYPGCHLORITE- 15% | 30GAL _ / WETIB. |
| CONTAINER | 51y 3480/ib. ]
| 123 ' SODIUM RYPOCHLORITE. 15% | 15GAL WETLB.
! | _| _CONTAINER | g5 aganp.
: 124 [ SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% J 5 GAL. WETLB.
! ! CONTAINER No Bid i
125 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 1GAL . WETLB ﬂ
i J CONTAINER No Bid - :
i é GAL.
126 ’ SODIUM PERMANGANATE 55 GAL DRUMS | \/ P
S - o ; $14.6800/0L" 0
127 SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE | 50 LB. BAG DRY(B.
e ‘ . No Bid .
128 | SODIUM THIOSULFATE (penta- 25 KG BAGS "~ DRYKG
? hydrate) f ‘ $4.9280/kg. |
129 T SULFUR DIOXIDE | BUK P PERTON
PR . N F No Bid S !
130 |  THIOSULPHATE - CALCIUM . 25TOTE PER GAL.
T . (30%) oL _NoBd .
131 ZINCHEXAMETAPHOSPHATE |~ 501B. BAG ", DRYLB.
o {v-9370R EQUAL ' .1 $3.0450/b, \,l/
132 |  ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE™ f 275 GAL TOTE \/WET B,
’ _ ; {v- -970 OR EQUAL) o N . $1.5400Mp. "
. 133~ ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE f BULK WET LB,
- P (V-970 OR EQUAL) | _ NoBid o
134 | ZINCORTHOPHOSPHATE | 55GAL. DRUM | WETLB.
f J . . : ... NoBid o _
. 135 ~ ZINCORTHOPHOSPHATE | 50(B.PAIL " DRY LB,
i | (CARUS3050 OREQUAL) | I $2.6800/bY] ]
' 136 | ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL. DRUMS o ~ GAL.
{SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS : !
. 3. L | %198540
*Carus 3350
**Carus 3180
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137 |  ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275GAL. | ‘/V GAL
| (SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS ! TOTE i ! !
IR 3180) a ! $19.3400/g1. | y
138 | ZINCORTHOPHOSPHATE | 15-GALPAIL | GAL
.. (cARUS 3130 OR EQUAL) . NoBid
| 139 |  ZINCORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK . WETLB.
P (SL1-932 OR EQUAL) ! NoBid ] - i
f 140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK F WET LB r
,,,,, 4 (vo390REQUA) NoBid | |
. 141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE ' BULK j‘ WET LB. !
z ' {UPZ-511 OR EQUAL) " No Bid | :
1 42 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB. !
] (CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL) No Bid i
143 |  ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK - WET s
{SLI-939 OR EQUAL} ; No Bid |
- 144 | Emergency Pumping and Storage | Daily Fee: : ' ' Chemicals that
| . Tanker to support temporary on- | : bulk pumping :
; . site storage for utility that needs and storage
‘ J to repair containment vessel, ‘; No Bid | will support:
PROPOSAL FROM:
Harcros Chemicals Inc.
8 Capitol Street
Nashua, NH 03063
Telephone: 603-880-0535 email: NashuaCS@harcros.com

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium {NEMVCC) and our Host Community
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda:  N/A

. /
Signature: _ {/ W . ?ﬁh'
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To Whom it May Concern:

in accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, I/we hereby certify
that | am/we are, the only person {s) interested in this proposal as principai(s); that it is made without
collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the following prices.

SIGNATURES P S

/T ~ —_—
S
‘-_J:) /

Authorizing Signature

Candice L ecourt. Regional Manager
Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

_March 222023
Date

| certify under the penaity of perjury that |, to the best of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns
and paid all state taxes required under law.

*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name (Mandatory): Harcros Chemicals inc. ya
: 7 —
By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable): / o/ W ’\—f"‘\_;/f

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this certification clause is signed
by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must make arrangements to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be

assigned to the owner. The owner’s intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or
guarantees as part of the awarding procedure.
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HARCROS

Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium
117 Kings Factory Road

PO Box 1525

Charlestown. RI 02813

To Whom It May Concern:

Please be advised that Candice Lecourt is hereby appointed, constituted and designated as
agent and attorney-in-fact of the Corporation with fulfl power and authority to act on

bonds, sureties, contracts and acts and to recejve and receipt thereof all purchase orders
pertaining to the Bid for the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium.

Sincerely,

A

Mark Loethen
Vice President and CFQ

Employee
5200 Speaker Road | Kansas City, KS 66106 | {913) 321.3131 | www.harcros.com



UNANIMOUS WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF
HARCROS CHEMICALS INC,

05/21/2012

Themdasigned,beingauofthedirectorsomemsChﬂnicalshm.,aKansas
Corporation (the “Corporation™), unanimously adopted at a duly called and held meeting of the
BomdofDimctorsatwhichaquommwaspresentandacﬁngthmughom:

RESOLVEDthatcachofthepmons be, and he hereby is, elected to the offices set opposite his
name, to serve at the pleasure of the board of directors until the next annual election of officers
by the board of directors or until his successor shall have been elected and qualified:

NAME OFFICE

Kevin G. Mirner President and Chief Executive Officer

Mark A, Loethen Vice President and Chief Financial Officer, Treasurer
Peter P. Radford Vice President Manufacturing, Secretary

Peter J. Savage Chairman

Y RN

Peter J. Savage, Chairman Kevin @. Mimer




