NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM FISCAL YEAR 2019-2020

OFFICIAL BID FORM ver. I - (revised May 13, 2019).

	OFFICIAL BID FORM ve	r. I – (revised	May 13, 20:	19).
DATE:	5/22/19			
VENDOR:	Aurgas USA LLC			
NOTE:	BID PRICES MUST BE	PER UNIT SPECIFI	LED ON THIS BID FO)RM
ITEM NO.	CHEMICAL	UNIT TYPE	UNIT BID	PER
1	ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE (ACH)	1,000 GAL. BULK		GAL.
2	ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% SOLUTION Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric Acid Preparation NSF 60/ANSI	BULK (1,000 – 5,000 gallon deliveries)		GALLON
3	ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% SOLUTION Other Prep Method Alternative Bid NSF 60/ANSI	BULK (1,000 – 5,000 gallon deliveries)		GALLON
4	AMMONIA GAS	150 LB. CYLINDER		LB.
5	AMMONIUM SULFATE	50 LB. BAG	***************************************	DRY LB.
6	AMMONIIUM SULFATE (40% SOLUTION)	GAL.		GAL.
7	ANTHRACITE	60 <u>+</u> LBS. BAGS	1	CU.FT.
8	AQUEOUS AMMONIA MUST BE 26° BAUMÉ (29%)	GAL.		GAL.
9	CALCIQUEST ORTHO (PHOSPHORIC ACID)	30 GAL. DRUM	And the first of the consequence	GAL.
10	CALCIQUEST ORTHO (PHOSPHORIC ACID)	15 GAL. DRUM		GAL.
11	CALCIUM CHLORIDE	50 LB. BAG		DRY LB.

12	CALCIUIM CHLORIDE	SUPERSACK		DRY LB.
13	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE	PALLET/50 – 50 LBS BAGS		LBS
14	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE	LESS THAN PALLET - 50 LBS BAGS		LBS
15	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE (Accu-Tab Blue SI by Fillion Associates)	55 LBS PAILS		LBS
16	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE (Accu-Tab SI by Axiall LLC)	55 LBS. PAILS		LBS.
17	CALCIUM NITRATE	50 LB. BAG		DRY LB.
18	CARBON DIOXIDE	BULK	.175	LB.
19	CARBON DIOXIDE	50 LBS BOTTLES	. 48	LB.
20	CARBON POWDERED	BULK		TON
21	CARBON POWDERED	SUPERSACK		DRY LB.
22	CAUSTIC SODA- 25% SOLUTION	BULK (500 – 5,000 gallon deliveries)		WET LB.
23	CAUSTIC SODA- 25% SOLUTION	55 GAL. DRUM		WET LB.
24	CAUSTIC SODA - 25 % SOLUTION	275 GAL. TOTE		WET LB.
25	CAUSTIC SODA- 50% SOLUTION	BULK (500 – 5,000 gallon deliveries)		WET LB.
26	CAUSTIC SODA- 50% SOLUTION	275 GAL. TOTE		WET. LB.
27	CHLORINE- DRY (HTH)	50 LB. PAILS		DRY LB.
28	CHLORINE	1 TON CYLINDER		LB.
29	CHLORINE	150 LB. CYLINDER		LB.

30	CITRIC ACID 50%	250 GAL TOTE		WET LB.
31	CITRIC ACID 50%	55 GAL.DRUM		WET LB.
32	CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER	50 LB BAGS/PALLET		DRY LB.
33	COPPER SULFATE	50 LB. BAG		DRY LB.
34	FERRIC CHLORIDE - U.S. ONLY 32%-38%	BULK		DRY LB.
35	FERRIC CHLORIDE - U.S. ONLY 32%-38%	55 GAL. DRUM		DRY LB.
36	FERRIC CHLORIDE - FOREIGN: 32%-38% (alternative bid)	BULK		DRY.LB.
37	FERRIC CHLORIDE- FOREIGN: 32% - 38% (alternative bid)	55 GAL.DRUM		DRY.LB.
38	HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24%	BULK		WET LB.
39	HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24%	55 GAL. DRUM		WET LB.
40	HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24%	270 gallon totes		WET LB.
41	LIME (HYDRATED)	50 LB BAGS		DRY LB.
42	LIQUID OXYGEN	BULK	. 4175	GAL.
43	LIQUID POLYMER	275 GAL TOTE		GAL.
44	LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS 8500 OR EQUAL)	BULK		WET LB.
45	MANGANESE GREENSAND	BULK		CU FT.
46	MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS (alternate bid)	BULK		CU FT.
47	METHANOL (100%)	55 GAL DRUM		GAL.
48	MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUMÉ	BULK (1,000 – 3,000) gallon delivered		GAL.
49	MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUMÉ INHIBITED - NSF Certified	55 GAL DRUM		GAL.

PROPOSAL FROM:	Argas - John	P. Brower
	1 Plank Rd.	
	Billerica MA.	
Telephone: 974 409 to furnish understood that the Town researd/or on the basis of the agg	in accordance verves the right to make an av	il: John 310 were Argas. com with specifications attached, it being further ward on the basis of quotations received for any which quotations received.
The Bidder acknowledges re	ceipt of the following Adden	da:
Kahl	ceipt of the following Adden	ionliesidant
Signature:	- Julib-life	
Sir:		
proposals for furnishing Chethat I am/we are, the only p collusion with any person, fi	emicals in conformity with erson (s) interested in this p rm, or corporation, that an ex	errimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting the attached specifications, I/we hereby certify proposal as principal(s); that it is made without camination has been made of the specifications; the time specified, at the following prices.
SIGNATURES		
(If an Individual)		
Date, 2018		
Signature of Bidder:		(SEAL)
	(Owner and Proprietor)	
Business Name D/B/A:		
Business Address: (if a co-partnership)		
Date, 2018		

Official Bid Form and Signature Pages (Fiscal Year 2019-2020)

Page 8 of 10.

(SEAL	·
(SEAI	-)
all Members of Firm Resian President Ai	ra as Northeast
1 Waterford C	7 06385
8	
s L Northeast-Regio	
dent or Authorized Agent*	
duly signed by proper author	ority, to be attached hereto.
perjury that I, to the best of red under law.	my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns
Corporate Name (Mandatory):
datory, if Applicable):	While 2 les
ther agreement will not be	granted unless this certification clause is signed
	dent or Authorized Agent* (Water and Long to Compare Name (Mandatory latory, if Applicable):

SECRETARY'S CERTIFICATE

AIRGAS USA, LLC

The undersigned, Lola Lin, hereby certifies the following:

- 1. The undersigned is the duly appointed Secretary of Airgas USA, LLC, a Delaware limited liability company (the "Company").
- 2. I hereby certify that Kahlub Kenyon is a Regional President of the Company and he is authorized to act as a legal representative of the Company in executing the Proposal to furnish Chemicals to Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium as dated May 15, 2019.

The undersigned has executed this certificate as an officer of the Company this 22nd day of May, 2019.

Lola Lin

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must make arrangements to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be assigned to the owner. The owner's intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or guarantees as part of the awarding procedure.



Airgas USA, LLC

Northeast Bulk Division 130 Cross Road Waterford, CT 06385 860-444-3021 Airgas.com

May 20, 2019

Northeast / Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium Groton Water Department 173 Main Street – Town Hall, Groton, MA 01450

Ref: Bid FY 2019-2020

"Airgas' bid is expressly subject to the following condition: This is a bid of commercial terms only. Airgas does not agree to buyer's proposed contract terms and conditions. If Airgas is the successful bidder, Airgas will attempt, within 30 days thereafter, to negotiate mutually acceptable contract terms and conditions with buyer. If those negotiations are successful, then Airgas and buyer will sign a contract containing the agreed-to terms and conditions. If the negotiations are not successful, Airgas and buyer will not be obligated to deal with each other with respect to the subject matter of this bid request."

Sincerely,

The of Aulie

Thomas J Archie, Vice President

Bulk/On-site Sales and Operations,

Northeast Region I Airgas, an Air Liquide company 130 Cross Road I Waterford, CT 06385

NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM **FISCAL YEAR 2019-2020** OFFICIAL BID FORM - (revised April 25, 2019). DATE: May **VENDOR:** BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS BID FORM NOTE: **UNIT BID** PER **ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE** NO. GAL. ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000 GAL. 1 No Bid BULK (ACH) BULK **ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50%** 2 (1,000 - 5,000)**GALLON** SOLUTION No Bid Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric gallon **Acid Preparation** deliveries) NSF 60/ANSI BULK **ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50%** 3 **GALLON** SOLUTION (1,000 - 5,000)Other Prep Method gallon No Bid deliveries) Alternative Bid NSF 60/ANSI **AMMONIA GAS** 150 LB. LB. 4 No Bid CYLINDER AMMONIUM SULFATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB. \$0.499 5 GAL. GAL. AMMONIIUM SULFATE 6 NoBid (40% SOLUTION) 60+ LBS. BAGS CU.FT. ANTHRACITE 7 No Bid GAL. GAL. AQUEOUS AMMONIA No Bid 8 MUST BE 26° BAUMÉ (29%) CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30 GAL, DRUM GAL. NoBid 9 (PHOSPHORIC ACID) 15 GAL. DRUM NoBid GAL. CALCIQUEST ORTHO 10 (PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRY LB. CALCIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG \$0.305 11

12	CALCIUIM CHLORIDE	SUPERSACK	NoBid	DRY LB.
13	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE	PALLET/50 – 50 LBS BAGS	NoBid	LBS
14	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE	LESS THAN PALLET - 50 LBS BAGS	No Bid	LBS
15	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE (Accu-Tab Blue SI by Fillion Associates)	55 LBS PAILS	Nobid	LBS
16	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE (Accu-Tab SI by Axiall LLC)	55 LBS. PAILS	NoBid	LBS.
17	CALCIUM NITRATE	50 LB. BAG	NoBid	DRY LB.
18	CARBON DIOXIDE	BULK	NoBid	LB.
19	CARBON DIOXIDE	50 LBS BOTTLES	NoBid	LB.
20	CARBON POWDERED	BULK	NoBid	TON
21	CARBON POWDERED	SUPERSACK	\$1.25	DRY LB.
22	CAUSTIC SODA- 25% SOLUTION	BULK (500 – 5,000 gallon deliveries)	NoBid	WET LB.
23	CAUSTIC SODA- 25% SOLUTION	55 GAL. DRUM	No Bid	WET LB.
24	CAUSTIC SODA - 25 % SOLUTION	275 GAL. TOTE	NOBid	WET LB.
25	CAUSTIC SODA- 50% SOLUTION	BULK (500 – 5,000 gallon deliveries)	NoBid	WET LB.
26	CAUSTIC SODA- 50% SOLUTION	275 GAL. TOTE	NoBid	WET. LB.
27	CHLORINE- DRY (HTH)	50 LB. PAILS	No Bid	DRY LB.
28	CHLORINE	1 TON CYLINDER	NoBid	LB.
29	CHLORINE	150 LB. CYLINDER	No Bid	LB.

30	CITRIC ACID 50%	250 GAL TOTE	\$0.529	WET LB.
31	CITRIC ACID 50%	55 GAL.DRUM	\$0.65	WET LB.
32	CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER	50 LB BAGS/PALLET	\$0.8375	DRY LB.
33	COPPER SULFATE	50 LB. BAG	NoBid	DRY LB.
34	FERRIC CHLORIDE - U.S. ONLY 32%-38%	BULK	NoBid	DRY LB.
35	FERRIC CHLORIDE - U.S. ONLY 32%-38%	55 GAL. DRUM	NoBid	DRY LB.
36	FERRIC CHLORIDE - FOREIGN: 32%-38% (alternative bid)	BULK	NoBid	DRY.LB.
37	FERRIC CHLORIDE- FOREIGN: 32% - 38% (alternative bid)	55 GAL.DRUM	NoBid	DRY.LB.
38	HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24%	BULK	NoBid	WET LB.
39	HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24%	55 GAL. DRUM	\$0.349	WET LB.
40	HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24%	270 gallon totes	No Bid	WET LB.
41	LIME (HYDRATED)	50 LB BAGS	NoBid	DRY LB.
42	LIQUID OXYGEN	BULK	No Bid	GAL.
43	LIQUID POLYMER	275 GAL TOTE	NoBid	GAL.
44	LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS 8500 OR EQUAL)	BULK	No Bid	WET LB.
45	MANGANESE GREENSAND	BULK	Nobid	CU FT.
46	MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS (alternate bid)	BULK	No Bid	CU FT.
47	METHANOL (100%)	55 GAL DRUM	\$3,80	GAL.
48	MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUMÉ	BULK (1,000 – 3,000) gallon delivered	No Bid No Bid	GAL.
49	MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUMÉ INHIBITED - NSF Certified	55 GAL DRUM	NoBid	GAL.

50	MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUMÉ	520 LB. DRUM	NoBil	LB.
51	MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUMÉ	4, 1-gallon jugs per box	NoBid	GAL
52	MURIATIC ACID- 10° BAUMÉ	BULK (1,000 to 3,000 gallon deliveries)	NoBid	GAL.
53	MURIATIC ACID - 15%	TOTE BULK (300-350 gal)	No Bid	GAL.
54	MURIATIC ACID – 20%	45 GAL CARBOYS	NoBid	GAL.
55	MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUMÉ	PUMPTED TOTE (300-350 gal)	NoBid	GAL.
56	ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE (AQUAMAG OR EQUAL)	BULK (300-500 GAL)	NoBid	LB.
57	ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE (50%-50% Blend)	30 GALLON DRUM	NoBia	LB.
58	ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE (30%-70% BLEND)	30 GALLON DRUM	NoBid	LB.
59	PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) (SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS 8100)	30 GALLON DRUMS	NoBil	GAL.
60	PHOSPHORIC ACID 75% SOLUTION	15 GAL. DRUM	\$0.65	WET LB.
61	POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE (HOLLAND PC-H180 or EQUAL)	BULK	No Bid	GAL
62	POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE (HOLLAND PC-H180 or EQUAL)	275 GAL TOTE	MBid	GAL
63	POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE (HOLLAND EPIC-WW58 or EQUAL)	BULK	NoBid	GAL.
64	POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE (HOLLAND PCH-182 OR EQUAL)	BULK	MoBid	GAL.
65	POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45%	BULK (400–5,000 gal. Deliveries)	No Bid	WET LB.
66	POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45%	TOTE	NoBid	WET LB.
67	POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45%	55 GAL. DRUM	No Bid	WET LB.
68	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE (U.S. ONLY)	55 LB. DRUM	No Bid	LB.

CO	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE	330 LB. DRUM		LB.
69	(U.S. ONLY)		NoBid	
70	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE (U.S. ONLY)	5 LB. PAILS	NoBia	LB.
71	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE (FOREIGN- Alternative Bid)	55 LB. DRUM	\$1.85	LB.
72	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE (FOREIGN - Alternative Bid)	330 LB. DRUM	NoBid	LB.
73	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE (FOREIGN - Alternative Bid)	5 LB. PAILS	NoBid	LB.
74	SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% (AWWA B405 – LATEST)	BULK	No Bid	WET LB.
75	SODIUM BICARBONATE (AWWA/NSF 60)	BULK	NoBid	DRY LB.
76	SODIUM BICARBONATE (AWWA/NSF 60)	50 LBS. BAG Full Truckload Release	No Bid	DRY LB.
77	SODIUM BICARBONATE (WASTEWATER)	50 LBS. BAG Full Truckload Release	NoBid	DRY LB.
78	SODIUM BICARBONATE (WASTEWATER)	50 LBS. BAG Per Pallet	\$0,38	DRY LB.
79	SODIUM BISULFITE- 38% SOLUTION	BULK 1,000 GAL+	NoBid	WET LB.
80	SODIUM BISULFITE- 38% SOLUTION	MINI-BULK ≤ 800 GAL	NoBid	WET LB.
81	SODIUM BISULFITE- 38% SOLUTION	55 GAL. DRUM	NoBid	WET LB.
82	SODIUM METABISULFITE (GRANULAR)	50 LBS BAGS	\$0,459	DRY LB.
83	SODIUM CARBONATE SODA ASH- DENSE	50 LB. BAG	\$0.34	DRY LB.
84	SODIUM CARBONATE SODA ASH -DENSE	SUPER SACKS	NoBid	DRY LB.
85	SODIUM CARBONATE SODA ASH- DENSE	BULK	NoBial	DRY LB.
86	SODIUM CHLORIDE	50 LB. BAG	\$0,24	DRY LB.
87	SODIUM CHLORITE – 25% SOLUTION – U.S. ONLY	BULK	NoBid	WET LB.
88	SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% SOLUTION – U.S. ONLY	55 GAL DRUM	NO Bid	WET LB.

200	CODULA CIU ODITE 250/	BUUK		METID
89	SODIUM CHLORITE – 25% FOREIGN (alternate bid)	BULK	No Bid	WET LB.
90	SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% FOREIGN (alternate bid)	55 GAL DRUM	No Bid	WET LB.
91	SODIUM CHLORITE – 25% SOLUTION – non-AWWA for wastewater use only	BULK	Nosid	WET LB.
92	SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% SOLUTION – non-AWWA for wastewater use only	55 GAL DRUM	No Bia	WET LB.
93	SODIUM CHLORITE – (SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID)	55 GAL. DRUM	NOBIL	DRY LB.
95	SODIUM FLUORIDE U.S. ONLY	LESS THAN FULL 40 BAG PALLETS OF 50 LB. BAGS	NoBid	DRY LB.
96	SODIUM FLUORIDE U.S ONLY	FULL 40 BAG PALLETS OF 50 LB. BAGS	NOB: 2	DRY LB.
97	SODIUM FLUORIDE FOREIGN (alternative bid)	LESS THAN FULL 40 BAG PALLETS OF 50 LB. BAGS	No Bid	DRY LB.
98	SODIUM FLUORIDE FOREIGN (alternative bid)	FULL 40 BAG PALLETS OF 50 LB. BAGS	NoBid	DRY LB.
99	SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE	50 LB. BAG	\$1,75	DRY LB.
100	Sodium Hexametaphosphate PRISTINE SK-7641	55 GAL DRUM	No Bid	WET LB.
101	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5%	250 GAL TOTE	No Bid	WET LB.
102	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5%	5 GAL CARBOYS	NoBid	WET LB.
103	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5%	500-2,000 gal. BULK	MoBid	WET LB.
104	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	BULK (400-5,000 gal. deliveries)	No Bid No Bid	WET LB.
105	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% Certified Refrigerated Storage and Delivery (Alternative Bid)	BULK (400-5,000 gal. deliveries)	No Bid	WET LB.

106	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	55 GAL. DRUMS	NoBid	WET LB.
107	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	30 GAL. CONTAINER	NOBIZ	WET LB.
108	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	15 GAL. CONTAINER	NO BIZ	WET LB.
109	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	5 GAL. CONTAINER	No Bid	WET LB.
110	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	1 GAL. CONTAINER	NoBid	WET LB.
111	SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE	50 LB. BAG	NoBid	DRY LB.
112	SODIUM THIOSULFATE (penta- hydrate)	25 KG BAGS	NoBid	DRY KG.
113	ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE (V-937 OR EQUAL)	50 LB. BAG	Mobid	DRY LB.
114	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (V-970 OR EQUAL)	BULK	No Bid	WET LB.
115	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE	55 GAL. DRUM	NoBid	WET LB.
116	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL)	50 LB. PAIL	Nobid	DRY LB.
117	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS 3180)	30 GAL. DRUMS	NoBia	GAL.
118	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS 3180)	275 GAL. TOTE	NOBIL	GAL.
119	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (SLI-932 OR EQUAL)	BULK	MoBid	WET LB.
120	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (V-939 OR EQUAL)	BULK	No Bid	WET LB.
121	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (UPZ-511 OR EQUAL)	BULK	MoBid	WET LB.
122	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (SLI-939 OR EQUAL)	BULK	MoBid MoBid	WET LB.
123	Emergency Pumping and Storage Tanker to support temporary on- site storage for utility that needs to repair containment vessel.	Daily Fee:	NoBid	Chemicals that bulk pumping and storage will support:

PROPOSAL FROM:	Λ	
-	Astro Cher	nicalosluc.
_	126 Mem	orial Dine
-	Springfie	ld, MA 01104
Telephone: 413-726. to furnish water-water was understood that the Town restand/or on the basis of the agg	the Chemicalin accordance we serves the right to make an av	il: <u>kelly</u> eddy <u>astrochemicals</u> . com with specifications attached, it being further ward on the basis of quotations received for any which quotations received.
The Bidder acknowledges re	ceipt of the following Adden	da:
Signature:	Cha (na	Sorn not needed
Sir:		
proposals for furnishing Che that I am/we are, the only p collusion with any person, fir	emicals in conformity with terson (s) interested in this prm, or corporation, that an ex	errimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting the attached specifications, I/we hereby certify roposal as principal(s); that it is made without tamination has been made of the specifications; the time specified, at the following prices.
(I f an Individua l)		
Date May 22, 2018		
Signature of Bidder:	(O 1D ')	(SEAL)
	(Owner and Proprietor)	
Business Name D/B/A:		
Business Address: (if a co-partnership)		
Date, 2018		

Firm Name: AStro Chemicals, Inc. (SEA)	
By: (SEA)	_)
Business Address:	
Names and Addresses of all Members of Firm (if a corporation) (histopher J. Diamond St. Jeffrey M. Diamond William P. Cunningham, Jr. Leith A. Cunningran	Adam L. Diamond Christopher J. Diamond, II. Kair Diamond
Date May 22 , 2018	All addresses can be provided as needed per contract tinks
Corporate Name: Astro Chemicals, Inc.	
By: President or Authorized Agent*	
Business Address: * Statement of authorization, duly signed by proper authorization.	
Attest:	
I certify under the penalty of perjury that I, to the best of and paid all state taxes required under law.	my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns
*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name (Mandatory)	: Astro Chemicals, Inc.
By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable):	
*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be § by the applicant.	granted unless this certification clause is signed

NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM FISCAL YEAR 2019-2020

	OFFICIAL BID FORM vei	r. I – (revised	l May 13, 20:	19).
DATE: 5	ATLANTIC COAST PO 6207 Bee Cave Suite 18 Austin, Texas	es Road 80		
VENDOR:	Phone: (512) 73	32-0007		
NOTE:	BID PRICES MUST BE	PER UNIT SPECIFI	ED ON THIS BID FO	ORM
ITEM NO.	CHEMICAL	UNIT TYPE	<u>UNIT BID</u>	PER
1	ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE (ACH)	1,000 GAL. BULK		GAL.
2	ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% SOLUTION Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric Acid Preparation NSF 60/ANSI	BULK (1,000 – 5,000 gallon deliveries)		GALLON
3	ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% SOLUTION Other Prep Method Alternative Bid NSF 60/ANSI	BULK (1,000 – 5,000 gallon deliveries)		GALLON
4	AMMONIA GAS	150 LB. CYLINDER		LB.
5	AMMONIUM SULFATE	50 LB. BAG		DRY LB.
6	AMMONIIUM SULFATE (40% SOLUTION)	GAL.		GAL.
7	ANTHRACITE	60 <u>+</u> LBS. BAGS		CU.FT.
8	AQUEOUS AMMONIA MUST BE 26° BAUMÉ (29%)	GAL.		GAL.
9	CALCIQUEST ORTHO (PHOSPHORIC ACID)	30 GAL. DRUM		GAL.
10	CALCIQUEST ORTHO (PHOSPHORIC ACID)	15 GAL. DRUM		GAL.

50 LB. BAG

CALCIUM CHLORIDE

11

DRY LB.

12	CALCIUIM CHLORIDE	SUPERSACK	DRY LB.
13	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE	PALLET/50 – 50 LBS BAGS	LBS
14	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE	LESS THAN PALLET - 50 LBS BAGS	LBS
15	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE (Accu-Tab Blue SI by Fillion Associates)	55 LBS PAILS	LBS
16	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE (Accu-Tab SI by Axiall LLC)	55 LB\$. PAIL\$	LBS.
17	CALCIUM NITRATE	50 LB. BAG	DRY LB.
18	CARBON DIOXIDE	BULK	LB.
19	CARBON DIOXIDE	50 LBS BOTTLES	LB.
20	CARBON POWDERED	BULK	TON
21	CARBON POWDERED	SUPERSACK	DRY LB.
22	CAUSTIC SODA- 25% SOLUTION	BULK (500 – 5,000 gallon deliveries)	WET LB.
23	CAUSTIC SODA- 25% SOLUTION	55 GAL. DRUM	WET LB.
24	CAUSTIC SODA - 25 % SOLUTION	275 GAL. TOTE	WET LB.
25	CAUSTIC SODA- 50% SOLUTION	BULK (500 – 5,000 gallon deliveries)	WET LB.
26	CAUSTIC SODA- 50% SOLUTION	275 GAL. TOTE	WET. LB.
27	CHLORINE- DRY (HTH)	50 LB. PAILS	DRY LB.
28	CHLORINE	1 TON CYLINDER	LB.
29	CHLORINE	150 LB. CYLINDER	LB.

30	CITRIC ACID 50%	250 GAL TOTE		WET LB.
31	CITRIC ACID 50%	55 GAL.DRUM		WET LB.
32	CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER	50 LB BAGS/PALLET		DRY LB.
33	COPPER SULFATE	50 LB. BAG		DRY LB.
34	FERRIC CHLORIDE - U.S. ONLY 32%-38%	BULK		DRY LB.
35	FERRIC CHLORIDE - U.S. ONLY 32%-38%	55 GAL. DRUM		DRY LB.
36	FERRIC CHLORIDE - FOREIGN: 32%-38% (alternative bid)	BULK		DRY.LB.
37	FERRIC CHLORIDE- FOREIGN: 32% - 38% (alternative bid)	55 GAL.DRUM		DRY.LB.
38	HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24%	BULK		WET LB.
39	HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24%	55 GAL. DRUM		WET LB.
40	HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24%	270 gallon totes		WET LB.
41	LIME (HYDRATED)	50 LB BAGS		DRY LB.
42	LIQUID OXYGEN	BULK		GAL.
43 8 84 8	LIQUID POLYMER FS Labeled ACT 6801	275 GAL TOTE	11.29	GAL.
44	LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS 8500 OR EQUAL)	BULK		WET LB.
45	MANGANESE GREENSAND	BULK		CU FT.
46	MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS (alternate bid)	BULK		CU FT.
47	METHANOL (100%)	55 GAL DRUM		GAL.
48	MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUMÉ	BULK (1,000 – 3,000) gallon delivered		GAL.
49	MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUMÉ INHIBITED - NSF Certified	55 GAL DRUM		GAL.

current Supplier

50	MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUMÉ	520 LB. DRUM	LB.
51	MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUMÉ	4, 1-gallon jugs per box	GAL
52	MURIATIC ACID- 10° BAUMÉ	BULK (1,000 to 3,000 gallon deliveries)	GAL.
53	MURIATIC ACID - 15%	TOTE BULK (300-350 gal)	GAL.
54	MURIATIC ACID – 20%	45 GAL CARBOYS	GAL.
55	MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUMÉ	PUMPTED TOTE (300-350 gal)	GAL.
56	ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE (AQUAMAG OR EQUAL)	BULK (300-500 GAL)	LB.
57	ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE (50%-50% Blend)	30 GALLON DRUM	LB.
58	ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE (30%-70% BLEND)	30 GALLON DRUM	LB.
59	PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) (SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS 8100)	30 GALLON DRUMS	GAL.
60	PHOSPHORIC ACID 75% SOLUTION	15 GAL. DRUM	WET LB.
61	POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE (HOLLAND PC-H180 or EQUAL)	BULK	GAL
62	POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE (HOLLAND PC-H180 or EQUAL)	275 GAL TOTE	GAL
63	POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE (HOLLAND EPIC-WW58 or EQUAL)	BULK	GAL.
64	POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE (HOLLAND PCH-182 OR EQUAL)	BULK	GAL.
65	POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45%	BULK (400–5,000 gal. Deliveries)	WET LB.
66	POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45%	TOTE	WET LB.
67	POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45%	55 GAL. DRUM	WET LB.
68	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE (U.S. ONLY)	55 LB. DRUM	LB.

69	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE (U.S. ONLY)	330 LB. DRUM	LB.
70	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE (U.S. ONLY)	5 LB. PAILS	LB.
71	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE (FOREIGN- Alternative Bid)	55 LB. DRUM	LB.
72	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE (FOREIGN - Alternative Bid)	330 LB. DRUM	LB.
73	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE (FOREIGN - Alternative Bid)	5 LB. PAILS	LB.
74	SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% (AWWA B405 – LATEST)	BULK	WET LB.
75	SODIUM BICARBONATE (AWWA/NSF 60)	BULK	DRY LB.
76	SODIUM BICARBONATE (AWWA/NSF 60)	50 LBS. BAG Full Truckload Release	DRY LB.
77	SODIUM BICARBONATE (WASTEWATER)	50 LBS. BAG Full Truckload Release	DRY LB.
78	SODIUM BICARBONATE (WASTEWATER)	50 LBS. BAG Per Pallet	DRY LB.
79	SODIUM BISULFITE- 38% SOLUTION	BULK 1,000 GAL+	WET LB.
80	SODIUM BISULFITE- 38% SOLUTION	MINI-BULK ≤ 800 GAL	WET LB.
81	SODIUM BISULFITE- 38% SOLUTION	55 GAL. DRUM	WET LB.
82	SODIUM METABISULFITE (GRANULAR)	50 LBS BAGS	DRY LB.
83	SODIUM CARBONATE SODA ASH- DENSE	50 LB. BAG	DRY LB.
84	SODIUM CARBONATE SODA ASH -DENSE	SUPER SACKS	DRY LB.
85	SODIUM CARBONATE SODA ASH- DENSE	BULK	DRY LB.
86	SODIUM CHLORIDE	50 LB. BAG	DRY LB.
87	SODIUM CHLORITE – 25% SOLUTION – U.S. ONLY	BULK	WET LB.
88	SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% SOLUTION – U.S. ONLY	55 GAL DRUM	WET LB.

89	SODIUM CHLORITE – 25% FOREIGN (alternate bid)	BULK	WET LB.
90	SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% FOREIGN (alternate bid)	55 GAL DRUM	WET LB.
91	SODIUM CHLORITE – 25% SOLUTION – non-AWWA for wastewater use only	BULK	WET LB.
92	SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% SOLUTION – non-AWWA for wastewater use only	55 GAL DRUM	WET LB.
93	SODIUM CHLORITE – (SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID)	55 GAL. DRUM	DRY LB.
95	SODIUM FLUORIDE U.S. ONLY	LESS THAN FULL 40 BAG PALLETS OF 50 LB. BAGS	DRY LB.
96	SODIUM FLUORIDE U.S ONLY	FULL 40 BAG PALLETS OF 50 LB. BAGS	DRY LB.
97	SODIUM FLUORIDE FOREIGN (alternative bid)	LESS THAN FULL 40 BAG PALLETS OF 50 LB. BAGS	DRY LB.
98	SODIUM FLUORIDE FOREIGN (alternative bid)	FULL 40 BAG PALLETS OF 50 LB. BAGS	DRY LB.
99	SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE	50 LB. BAG	DRY LB.
100	Sodium Hexametaphosphate PRISTINE SK-7641	55 GAL DRUM	WET LB.
101	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5%	250 GAL TOTE	WET LB.
102	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5%	5 GAL CARBOYS	WET LB.
103	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5%	500-2,000 gal. BULK	WET LB.
104	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	BULK (400-5,000 gal. deliveries)	WET LB.
105	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% Certified Refrigerated Storage and Delivery (Alternative Bid)	BULK (400-5,000 gal. deliveries)	WET LB.

106	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	55 GAL. DRUMS	WET LB.
107	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	30 GAL. CONTAINER	WET LB.
108	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	15 GAL. CONTAINER	WET LB.
109	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	5 GAL. CONTAINER	WET LB.
110	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	1 GAL. CONTAINER	WET LB.
111	SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE	50 LB. BAG	DRY LB.
112	SODIUM THIOSULFATE (penta- hydrate)	25 KG BAGS	DRY KG.
113	ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE (V-937 OR EQUAL)	50 LB. BAG	DRY LB.
114	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (V-970 OR EQUAL)	BULK	WET LB.
115	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE	55 GAL. DRUM	WET LB.
116	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL)	50 LB. PAIL	DRY LB.
117	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS 3180)	30 GAL. DRUMS	GAL.
118	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS 3180)	275 GAL. TOTE	GAL.
119	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (SLI-932 OR EQUAL)	BULK	WET LB.
120	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (V-939 OR EQUAL)	BULK	WET LB.
121	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (UPZ-511 OR EQUAL)	BULK	WET LB.
122	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (SLI-939 OR EQUAL)	BULK	WET LB.
122A	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (CARUS 3300 OR EQUAL)	BULK	WET LB.
123	Emergency Pumping and Storage Tanker to support temporary on- site storage for utility that needs to repair containment vessel.	Daily Fee:	Chemicals that bulk pumping and storage will support:

PROPOSAL FROM:	ATLANTIC COAST POLYM 6207 Bee Caves Ro Suite 180 Austin, Texas 787 Phone: (512) 732-006	746
to furnish Liquid Polymunderstood that the Town re	in accordance v	with specifications attached, it being further ward on the basis of quotations received for any which quotations received.
The Bidder acknowledges re	eceipt of the following Adden	nda: 1
Signature:	f l	
Sir:	0	,
proposals for furnishing Ch that I am/we are, the only p collusion with any person, f	nemicals in conformity with the person (s) interested in this prim, or corporation, that an expension is the conformation in the conformation in the conformation is the conformation in t	Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting the attached specifications, I/we hereby certify proposal as principal(s); that it is made without examination has been made of the specifications; the time specified, at the following prices.
<u>SIGNATURES</u>		
(If an Individual)		
Date, 2018		
Signature of Bidder:	(Owner and Proprietor)	(SEAL)
Business Address: (if a co-partnership)		

Page 8 of 10.

Official Bid Form and Signature Pages (Fiscal Year 2019-2020)

Date	, 2019			
Firm Name:		(SEAL	Danielle.	
By:		(SEAI	.)	
Business Address:				
Names and Add (if a corporation)	lresses of all Membe	ers of Firm		
Date 5/14	, 201 8			
Corporate Name:	Atlantiv	c Coast 1	Polymer.	JAC POR
By:	16	thorized Agent* Siegele		
Business Address: * Statement of auth	orization, duly sign	,		l hereto.
Attest: La	1-			_
I certify under the pand paid all state ta	penalty of perjury th xes required under l	at I, to the best of raw.	ny knowledge, hav	ve filed all state tax returns
*Signature of Indiv	idual or Corporate N	Name (Mandatory)	OHENTIL	Conit Polymens In
By: Corporate Office	cer (Mandatory, if A	applicable):	10	
				certification clause is signed

Page 9 of 10.

Official Bid Form and Signature Pages (Fiscal Year 2019-2020)

CERTIFIED RESOLUTION

I, Frederick H. Siegele, Board of Director of Atlantic Coast Polymers, Inc., a Delaware corporation, DO HEREBY certify that the following is a true and correct copy of a resolution duly adopted at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the Company duly held and convened on October 24, 1992 at which meeting a duly constituted quorum of the Board of Directors was present and acting throughout and that such resolution has not been modified, rescinded or revoked and is at present in full force and effect:

FURTHER RESOLVED: That any of the following offices, to wit, President, Secretary, is hereby authorized to make, execute and deliver for and on behalf of this corporation, any contract arising in the ordinary course of the business of this corporation.

Frederick H. Siegele Board of Director

6207 Bee Caves Road. Suite 180, Austin. TX 78746 (512) 732-0007 • Fax (512) 732-0008

NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM FISCAL YEAR 2019-2020

	OFFICIAL BID FORM	– (revised A	pril 25, 2019)	•
DATE:	May 21, 2019			
VENDOR:	Borden & Remington Corp.			
NOTE:	BID PRICES MUST BE	PER UNIT SPECIFI	ED ON THIS BID FO	DRM
ITEM NO.	CHEMICAL	UNIT TYPE	UNIT BID	PER
1	ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE (ACH)	1,000 GAL. BULK	NO BID	GAL.
2	ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% SOLUTION Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric Acid Preparation NSF 60/ANSI	BULK (1,000 – 5,000 gallon deliveries)	NO BID	GALLON
3	ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% SOLUTION Other Prep Method Alternative Bid NSF 60/ANSI	BULK (1,000 – 5,000 gallon deliveries)	NO BID	GALLON
4	AMMONIA GAS	150 LB. CYLINDER	NO BID	LB.
5	AMMONIUM SULFATE	50 LB. BAG	NO BID	DRY LB.
6	AMMONIIUM SULFATE (40% SOLUTION)	GAL.	NO BID	GAL.
7	ANTHRACITE	60 <u>+</u> LBS. BAGS	NO BID	CU.FT.
8	AQUEOUS AMMONIA MUST BE 26° BAUMÉ (29%)	GAL.	\$1.6134	GAL.
9	CALCIQUEST ORTHO (PHOSPHORIC ACID)	30 GAL. DRUM	NO BID	GAL.
10	CALCIQUEST ORTHO (PHOSPHORIC ACID)	15 GAL. DRUM	NO BID	GAL.
11	CALCIUM CHLORIDE	50 LB. BAG	\$.3050	DRY LB.

12	CALCIUIM CHLORIDE	SUPERSACK	NO BID	DRY LB.
13	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE	PALLET/50 – 50 LBS BAGS	NO BID	LBS
14	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE	LESS THAN PALLET - 50 LBS BAGS	NO BID	LBS
15	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE (Accu-Tab Blue SI by Fillion Associates)	55 LBS PAILS	NO BID	LBS
16	CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE (Accu-Tab SI by Axiall LLC)	55 LBS. PAILS	NO BID	LBS.
17	CALCIUM NITRATE	50 LB. BAG	NO BID	DRY LB.
18	CARBON DIOXIDE	BULK	NO BID	LB.
19	CARBON DIOXIDE	50 LBS BOTTLES	NO BID	LB.
20	CARBON POWDERED	BULK	NO BID	TON
21	CARBON POWDERED	SUPERSACK	NO BID	DRY LB.
22	CAUSTIC SODA- 25% SOLUTION	BULK (500 – 5,000 gallon deliveries)	\$.0817	WET LB.
23	CAUSTIC SODA- 25% SOLUTION	55 GAL. DRUM	\$.1544	WET LB.
24	CAUSTIC SODA - 25 % SOLUTION	275 GAL. TOTE	\$.1460	WET LB.
25	CAUSTIC SODA- 50% SOLUTION	BULK (500 – 5,000 gallon deliveries)	\$.1291	WET LB.
26	CAUSTIC SODA- 50% SOLUTION	275 GAL. TOTE	\$.1981	WET. LB.
27	CHLORINE- DRY (HTH)	50 LB. PAILS	NO BID	DRY LB.
28	CHLORINE	1 TON CYLINDER	NO BID	LB.
29	CHLORINE	150 LB. CYLINDER	NO BID	LB.

30	CITRIC ACID 50%	250 GAL TOTE	NO BID	WET LB.
31	CITRIC ACID 50%	55 GAL.DRUM	\$.9479	WET LB.
32	CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER	50 LB BAGS/PALLET	NO BID	DRY LB.
33	COPPER SULFATE	50 LB. BAG	NO BID	DRY LB.
34	FERRIC CHLORIDE - U.S. ONLY 32%-38%	BULK	\$.3398	DRY LB.
35	FERRIC CHLORIDE - U.S. ONLY 32%-38%	55 GAL. DRUM	\$.9288	DRY LB.
36	FERRIC CHLORIDE - FOREIGN: 32%-38% (alternative bid)	BULK	NO BID	DRY.LB.
37	FERRIC CHLORIDE- FOREIGN: 32% - 38% (alternative bid)	55 GAL.DRUM	NO BID	DRY.LB.
38	HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24%	BULK	\$.2185	WET LB.
39	HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24%	55 GAL. DRUM	\$.2972	WET LB.
40	HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24%	270 gallon totes	NO BID	WET LB.
41	LIME (HYDRATED)	50 LB BAGS	\$.2052	DRY LB.
42	LIQUID OXYGEN	BULK	NO BID	GAL.
43	LIQUID POLYMER	275 GAL TOTE	NO BID	GAL.
44	LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS 8500 OR EQUAL)	BULK	NO BID	WET LB.
45	MANGANESE GREENSAND	BULK	NO BID	CU FT.
46	MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS (alternate bid)	BULK	NO BID	CU FT.
47	METHANOL (100%)	55 GAL DRUM	NO BID	GAL.
48	MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUMÉ	BULK (1,000 – 3,000) gallon delivered	NO BID	GAL.
49	MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUMÉ INHIBITED - NSF Certified	55 GAL DRUM	no bid	GAL.

50	MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUMÉ	520 LB. DRUM	NO BID	LB.
51	MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUMÉ	4, 1-gallon jugs per box	NO BID	GAL
52	MURIATIC ACID- 10° BAUMÉ	BULK (1,000 to 3,000 gallon deliveries)	NO BID	GAL.
53	MURIATIC ACID - 15%	TOTE BULK (300-350 gal)	NO BID	GAL.
54	MURIATIC ACID – 20%	45 GAL CARBOYS	NO BID	GAL.
55	MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUMÉ	PUMPTED TOTE (300-350 gal)	NO BID	GAL.
56	ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE (AQUAMAG OR EQUAL)	BULK (300-500 GAL)	NO BID	LB.
57	ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE (50%-50% Blend)	30 GALLON DRUM	NO BID	LB.
58	ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE (30%-70% BLEND)	30 GALLON DRUM	NO BID	LB.
59	PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) (SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS 8100)	30 GALLON DRUMS	NO BID	GAL.
60	PHOSPHORIC ACID 75% SOLUTION	15 GAL. DRUM	\$.7068	WET LB.
61	POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE (HOLLAND PC-H180 or EQUAL)	BULK	NO BID	GAL
62	POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE (HOLLAND PC-H180 or EQUAL)	275 GAL TOTE	NO BID	GAL
63	POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE (HOLLAND EPIC-WW58 or EQUAL)	BULK	NO BID	GAL.
64	POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE (HOLLAND PCH-182 OR EQUAL)	BULK	NO BID	GAL.
65	POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45%	BULK (400–5,000 gal. Deliveries)	\$.2527	WET LB.
66	POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45%	TOTE	\$.3708	WET LB.
67	POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45%	55 GAL. DRUM	\$.3734	WET LB.
68	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE (U.S. ONLY)	55 LB. DRUM	\$4.3403	LB.

69	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE	330 LB. DRUM	NO DID	LB.
70	(U.S. ONLY) POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE	5 LB. PAILS	NO BID	LB.
70	(U.S. ONLY)	5 LB. PAILS	NO BID	LD.
71	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE (FOREIGN- Alternative Bid)	55 LB. DRUM	\$2.0027	LB.
72	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE (FOREIGN - Alternative Bid)	330 LB. DRUM	NO BID	LB.
73	POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE (FOREIGN - Alternative Bid)	5 LB. PAILS	NO BID	LB.
74	SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% (AWWA B405 – LATEST)	BULK	NO BID	WET LB.
75	SODIUM BICARBONATE (AWWA/NSF 60)	BULK	NO BID	DRY LB.
76	SODIUM BICARBONATE (AWWA/NSF 60)	50 LBS. BAG Full Truckload Release	NO BID	DRY LB.
77	SODIUM BICARBONATE (WASTEWATER)	50 LBS. BAG Full Truckload Release	NO BID	DRY LB.
78	SODIUM BICARBONATE (WASTEWATER)	50 LBS. BAG Per Pallet	\$.4072	DRY LB.
79	SODIUM BISULFITE- 38% SOLUTION	BULK 1,000 GAL+	NO BID	WET LB.
80	SODIUM BISULFITE- 38% SOLUTION	MINI-BULK ≤ 800 GAL	NO BID	WET LB.
81	SODIUM BISULFITE- 38% SOLUTION	55 GAL. DRUM	\$.2833	WET LB.
82	SODIUM METABISULFITE (GRANULAR)	50 LBS BAGS	NO BID	DRY LB.
83	SODIUM CARBONATE SODA ASH- DENSE	50 LB. BAG	\$.3072	DRY LB.
84	SODIUM CARBONATE SODA ASH -DENSE	SUPER SACKS	NO BID	DRY LB.
85	SODIUM CARBONATE SODA ASH- DENSE	BULK	\$.1964	DRY LB.
86	SODIUM CHLORIDE	50 LB. BAG	NO BID	DRY LB.
87	SODIUM CHLORITE – 25% SOLUTION – U.S. ONLY	BULK	NO BID	WET LB.
88	SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% SOLUTION – U.S. ONLY	55 GAL DRUM	NO BID	WET LB.

89	SODIUM CHLORITE – 25% FOREIGN (alternate bid)	BULK	NO BID	WET LB.
90	SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% FOREIGN (alternate bid)	55 GAL DRUM	NO BID	WET LB.
91	SODIUM CHLORITE – 25% SOLUTION – non-AWWA for wastewater use only	BULK	NO BID	WET LB.
92	SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% SOLUTION – non-AWWA for wastewater use only	55 GAL DRUM	NO BID	WET LB.
93	SODIUM CHLORITE – (SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID)	55 GAL. DRUM	NO BID	DRY LB.
95	SODIUM FLUORIDE U.S. ONLY	LESS THAN FULL 40 BAG PALLETS OF 50 LB. BAGS	NO BID	DRY LB.
96	SODIUM FLUORIDE U.S ONLY	FULL 40 BAG PALLETS OF 50 LB. BAGS	NO BID	DRY LB.
97	SODIUM FLUORIDE FOREIGN (alternative bid)	LESS THAN FULL 40 BAG PALLETS OF 50 LB. BAGS	\$1.1180	DRY LB.
98	SODIUM FLUORIDE FOREIGN (alternative bid)	FULL 40 BAG PALLETS OF 50 LB. BAGS	\$1.0513	DRY LB.
99	SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE	50 LB. BAG	NO BID	DRY LB.
100	Sodium Hexametaphosphate PRISTINE SK-7641	55 GAL DRUM	NO BID	WET LB.
101	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5%	250 GAL TOTE	NO BID	WET LB.
102	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5%	5 GAL CARBOYS	\$.6816	WET LB.
103	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5%	500-2,000 gal. BULK	\$.0855	WET LB.
104	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	BULK (400-5,000 gal. deliveries)	\$.0855	WET LB.
105	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% Certified Refrigerated Storage and Delivery (Alternative Bid)	BULK (400-5,000 gal. deliveries)	NO BID	WET LB.

106	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	55 GAL. DRUMS	\$.2052	WET LB.
107	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	30 GAL. CONTAINER	NO BID	WET LB.
108	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	15 GAL. CONTAINER	\$.2616	WET LB.
109	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	5 GAL. CONTAINER	\$.6816	WET LB.
110	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15%	1 GAL. CONTAINER	NO BID	WET LB.
111	SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE	50 LB. BAG	NO BID	DRY LB.
112	SODIUM THIOSULFATE (penta- hydrate)	25 KG BAGS	NO BID	DRY KG.
113	ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE (V-937 OR EQUAL)	50 LB. BAG	NO BID	DRY LB.
114	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (V-970 OR EQUAL)	BULK	NO BID	WET LB.
115	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE	55 GAL. DRUM	NO BID	WET LB.
116	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL)	50 LB. PAIL	NO BID	DRY LB.
117	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS 3180)	30 GAL. DRUMS	NO BID	GAL.
118	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS 3180)	275 GAL. TOTE	NO BID	GAL.
119	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (SLI-932 OR EQUAL)	BULK	NO BID	WET LB.
120	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (V-939 OR EQUAL)	BULK	NO BID	WET LB.
121	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (UPZ-511 OR EQUAL)	BULK	NO BID	WET LB.
122	ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE (SLI-939 OR EQUAL)	BULK	NO BID	WET LB.
123	Emergency Pumping and Storage Tanker to support temporary on- site storage for utility that needs to repair containment vessel.	Daily Fee:	NO BID	Chemicals that bulk pumping and storage will support:

PROPOSAL FROM:			
	Borden & Remington Con	p.	
	63 Water Street, P.O.	Box 2573	
	Fall River, MA 02722		
Telephone: 508-675- to furnish Chemicals	in accordance	ail: <u>tresendes@boremco</u> with specifications attached	d, it being further
	serves the right to make an a gregate total for all items on		
The Bidder acknowledges pe	eccipt of the following Adde	nda:	
Signature:	The state of the s		
Sir:	\bigvee		
proposals for furnishing Ch that I am/we are, the only p collusion with any person, f	ertisement of the Northeast/Northeas	the attached specifications proposal as principal(s); the xamination has been made	s, I/we hereby certify at it is made without of the specifications;
SIGNATURES			
(If an Individual)			
Date, 2018			
Signature of Bidder:	(Owner and Proprietor)	(SEAL)	
Business Name D/B/A:			
Business Address: (if a co-partnership)			
Date, 2018			

		w.
Firm Name:	(SEAL)	
Ву:	(SEAL)	
Business Address:		
Names and Addresses of all Members o (if a corporation)	of Firm	State Of Sta
Robert F. Bogan, President	Fall River, MA	
Sharon L. Quinn VP	Fall River, MA	
Daniel E. Bogan, CEO Date May 21 , 20 XX19	Fall River, MA	1 1 0 6 0 6 mm
By: President of Authority		_
Business Address: Fall Rive	er, MA 02721	
* Statement of authorization, duly signed by Attest:	y proper authority, to be attached	hereto.
I certify under the penalty of perjury that I, and paid all state taxes required under law.	to the best of my knowledge, hav	ve filed all state tax returns
*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name	e (Mandatory): Borden & Re	emington Corp.
By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Appli	cable):	Dogm
*Approval of a contract or other agreement by the applicant.	t will not be granted unless this	certification clause is signed

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must make arrangements to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be assigned to the owner. The owner's intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or guarantees as part of the awarding procedure.

CERTIFICATE OF VOTE

At a duly authorized meeting of the Board of Directors of "BORDEN & REMINGTON CORP." held on August 28, 2018 it was voted that ROBERT F.

BOGAN, PRESIDENT of this company, be herby authorized to execute bids, contracts and bonds in the name and on behalf of said company, and affix its corporate seal hereto; and such execution of any contract or obligation in this company's name on its behalf by such officer under seal of the company, shall be valid and binding upon this company.

I hereby certify that I am the clerk of the above named corporation and that ROBERT F. BOGAN is the duly elected officer as above of said company, and that the above vote has not been amended or rescinded and remains in full force and effect as the date of this contract.

E/21/2010	
5/21/2019	
Date	

Corporate Seal

Sharon L. Quinn, Clerk