NORTHEAST/ MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM
FISCAL YEAR 2026-2027
OFFICIAL BID FORM - ADDENDUM |
DATE: 03/19/2026
VENDOR: | Calgon Carbon Corporation
3000 GSK Drive, Moon Township, PA 15108
NOTE: BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS BID EORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PE
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15-GAL. GAL.
(ACH) PAILS
9 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE |  1,000-GAL. GAL.
(ACH) BULK
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION (500 — 5,000 GALLON
NSF 60/ANSI GAL. deliveries)
A4 AMMONIA GAS 150-LBS. LB.
CYLINDER
5 AMMONIUM SULEATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS
6 AMMONIUM SULFATE 500 -1,000 GAL.
(40% SOLUTION) GAL. deliveries
7 ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. CU.FT.
BAGS
Q AQUEOQUS AMMONIA 1,000-GAL. GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries
9 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30-GAL. GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15-GAL. GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM
11 CALCIUM CHLORIDE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS
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12 CALCIUM-CHLORIDE SHRERSALK DRY-LB-
13 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/50 — 50 LBS
LBS. BAGS
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE LESS THAN LBS
PALLET - 50 LBS
BAGS
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. LBS
(Accu-Tab Blue Sl by Fillion PAILS
Associates)
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. LBS.
(Accu-Tab SI by Axiall LLC) PAILS
17 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery DRY LB.
(40/50 LBS.
bags)
18 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK LB.
19 CARBON POWDERED BULK $2.320/ TON TON
*15 TON per order*
20 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK DRY LB.
21 CAUSTIC SODA - SMALL BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 500 - 1,000
GAL. deliveries
22 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001 - 5,000
GAL. deliveries
23 CAUSTIC SODA - 55-GAL. WET LB.
25% SOLUTION DRUM
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 275-GAL. WET LB.
25 % SOLUTION TOTES
25 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK WET LB.
50% SOLUTION 500 -1,500
GAL. deliveries
26 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK
50% SOLUTION 1,501 -6,000 WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
27 CHLORINE- DRY (HTH) 50-LBS. DRY LB.
PAILS
8 CHLORINE 1 TON LB.
CYLINDER
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ple CHLORINE 150-LBS. LB.
CYLINDER
30 CITRIC ACID 50% 250-GAL. WET LB.
TOTES
31 CITRIC ACID 50% 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUM
29 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS/PALLET
33 COPPER SULFATE 50-1BS. DRY LB.
FINE # 30 BAGS
34 COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 32%-38%
36 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38%
_ (Alternative Bid)
-3 7
.3,8 CARBON-
REGENERATED
39 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK WET LB.
40 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUM
41 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 270-GAL. WET LB.
TOTES
42 HYDROGEN PEROXIDE — 27% BULK GALS.
43 LIME (HYDRATED) 50-LBS. BAGS DRY LB.
2-ton min.
44 LIME SLURRY BULK PER TON
A5 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
(<15 PPM THC)
46 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
(<40 PPM THC)
47 LIQUID POLYMER 275-GAL. GAL.
CLARIFLOC 2427 OR EQUAL TOTES
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A8 LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS BULK WET LB.
8500 OR EQUAL)
49 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275-GAL. GAL.
TOTES
50 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK CU FT.
51 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK CU FT.
(alternate bid)
9 METHANOL (100%) 55-GAL. GAL.
DRUM
53 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME BULK GAL.
(1,000 - 3,000)
GAL. delivered
54 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55-GAL. GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified DRUM
55 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 520-LBS. LB.
DRUM
e MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 4, 1-GAL. jugs GAL
per box
57 MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK GAL.
(300-350 GAL.)
58 MURIATIC ACID — 20% 15-GAL. GAL.
CARBOY
59 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME PUMPTED TOTE GAL.
(300-350 GAL.)
60 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50-LBS. LB.
(CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL) PAILS
61 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. GAL.
(CARUS 4500) DRUM
62 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 300-GAL.TOTE GAL.
i (CARUS 4500) OR BULK
(300-500 GAL)
63 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK LB.
(AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) (300-500 GAL.)
64 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. LB.
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM
65 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55-GAL.
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM LB.
(Aquamag or equal)
66 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. LB.
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM
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57 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55-GAL. LB.
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM
68 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55-GAL. LB.
(10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM
69 POLYPHOSPHATE 340-1BS. LB.
(STERLING CP-33) DRUM
70 PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) 30-GAL. GAL.
(SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS DRUM
8100)
71 POLYMER 275 GAL GAL
SNF POLYDYNECLARIELOC TOTES
C-379
77 POLYMER (MANNICH) BULK LB.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321
73 POLYMER (ANIONIC) 275-GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTES
74 POLYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTES
75 POYMER (CATIONIC) 275-GAL. GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTES
76 POLYMER 55-GAL. GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIELOC C6287 DRUM
77 POLYMER 450 LBS. GAL
POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC — C 6227 DRUMS
78 POLYMER 275-GAL, GAL
SNF NE-1922 TOTES
79 POLYMER 55- GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC GAC
C6287
79A POLYMER 55-LBS. LBS.
NEW FTEKA CLARIFLOC NE-2008 BAG
0 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15-GAL. WET LB.
75% SOLUTION DRUM
81 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL)
29 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275-GAL . GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) TOTES
23 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL.

(HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL)
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4 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE
(HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK GAL.
FQUAL)
5 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE
(EPIC 58) BULK GAL.
OR EQUAL
86 SMALL BULK WET LB.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 400 —-1,000
GAL.
Deliveries
7 LARGE BULK WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 1,001 - 5,000
GAL. Deliveries
38 BULK
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 800 - 1,500 WET LB
GAL.- shorter
wheelbase
delivery
89 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTES WET LB.
90 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUM
01 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE —45% 15-GAL. WET LB.
PAILS
9?7 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55-1BS. LB.
(U.S. ONLY) DRUM
g3 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. LB,
(U.S. ONLY) DRUM
94 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55-LBS. LB.
(FOREIGN- Alternative Bid) DRUM
05 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. LB.
(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) DRUM
96 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK WET LB.
(AWWA B405 — LATEST)
97 SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60)
g8 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) Full Truckload
Release
Qg SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER ) Full Truckload
Release

e T T NS
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100 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER) Per Pallet
101 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL.+
102 SODIUM BISULFITE- MINI-BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION < 800 GAL.
103 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55-GAL. WET LB.
38% SOLUTION DRUM
104 SOBIUM 50-LBS-BAGS DRY-LB.
METFABISULFITE{GRANULAR) 2 pallet
105 SODIUM CARBONATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE BAGS
106 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE
107 SODIUM CARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE
108 SODIUM CHLORIDE 50 -LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS
109 SODIUM CHLORITE ~ BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY
110 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55-GAL. WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY DRUM
111 SODIUM CHLORITE — 25% BULK WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid)
112 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL. WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) DRUM
113 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% BULK WET LB.
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for
Wastewater Use Only
114 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL. WET LB.
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for DRUM
Wastewater Use Only
115 SODIUM CHLORITE — 55-GAL. DRY LB.
(SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID) DRUM
116 SODIUM FLUQRIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 40 BAG
PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS
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117 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
U.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS
118 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG
(Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS
119 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50-
(Alternative Bid) LBS. BAGS
120 SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS
121 Sodium Hexametaphosphate 275-GAL WET LB.
PRISTINE SK-7641 TOTES
122 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 250-GAL. WET LB.
S% TOTES
123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 5-GAL. WET LB.
12.5% PAILS
123A SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15-GAL. WET.LB.
12.5% PAILS
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 300-2,000 GAL. WET LB.
BULK
125 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - SMALL BULK
15% 400 - 1,000 WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
176 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - LARGE BULK
15% 1,001 — 7,000 WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
127 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK
Certified Refrigerated Storage | (400-5,000 GAL.
and Delivery {Alternative Bid) deliveries) WET LB.
128 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUMS
129 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% 275-GAL, WET.LB.
TOTES
130 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30-GAL. WET LB.
| CONTAINER
131 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15-GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER
132 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 5-GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER
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(SLI-939 OR EQUAL)

133 SODIUM PERMANGANATE 55-GAL. GAL.
NEW ITEM DRUM
134 SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS
135 SODIUM THIOSULFATE 2-KG. DRY KG.
(penta-hydrate) BAGS
136 SODIUM THIOSULFATE 55 - GAL. GAL
(30% SOLUTION) DRUM
137 SULFUR DIOXIDE BULK PER TON
138 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275-GAL. PER GAL.
(30%) TOTES
139 ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
(V-S937 OR EQUAL BAGS
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL. WET. LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL) TOTES
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL)
142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUM
143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
(CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL) PAILS
144 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS DRUM
3180)
145 ZINC ORTHOPHQSPHATE 275-GAL. GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTES
3180)
146 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 15-GAL. GAL
(CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL) PAILS
147 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(SLI-932 OR EQUAL)
148 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(V-939 OR EQUAL)
149 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(UPZ-511 OR EQUAL)
150 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB,
(CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL)
151 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK GALLON
(CARUS 3300 OR EQUAL)
152 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
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NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2026-2027)

e o T T TR TS — .

§ of 12 pages




153 Emergency Pumping and Daily Fee: Chemicals that

Storage Tanker to support bulk pumping
temporary on-site storage for and storage
utility that needs to repair will support:

containment vessel.

PROPOSAL FROM:
Calgon Carbon Corporation
3000 GSK Drive, Moon Township, PA 15108
Telephone: 412-787-6700 email: drinkingwater.ccc@kuraray.com

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium (NEMVCC) and our Host Community

reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda: {

Signature:

The addendum could state that if tariffs are implemented and a contract adjustment is needed,
vendors must provide documentation (e.g., import/export data, supplier invoices, or government
taritf schedules) to prove the actual impact. We should also clarify that only verified increases
due to new tariffs, not general inflation or other factors will be considered.

To Whom it May Concern:

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, |/we hereby certify
that | am/we are, the only person (s) interested in this proposal as principal(s); that it is made without
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collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications:
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the following prices.

SIGNATURES

m@
Jeremy J. Jones - DWS Project Manager

Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

03/19/2026
Date

| certify under the penalty of perjury that [, to the best of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns
and paid all state taxes required under law.

*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name (Mandatory):

By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable): Jeremy J. Jones - DWS Project Manager

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this certification clause is signed
by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must plan to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be assigned to the
owner. The owner’s intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or guarantees as part
of the awarding procedure.
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If tariffs are implemented and a contract adjustment is needed, vendors must

pmvi_d-e documentation (e.g., import/export data, supplier invoices, or government
tariff schedules) to prove the actual impact. Only verified increases due to new
tariffs, not general inflation or other factors—will be considered.

Date 03/19/2026
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D
CalgonCarbon

A Kuraray Company

Corporate Resolution

, Jessica Underwood, Associate General Counsel, hereby certify that Jeremy J. Jones, DWS Project
Manager, is authorized to execute the attached contract/bid under the bylaws and delegations of the

authority of Calgon Carbon Corporation. | fully certify that this delegation is in full force and effect, and as

the person named in said delegation holds the office so designated.

Calgon Carbon Corporation
3000 GSK Drive

Moon Township, PA 15108
State of Incorporation: Delaware
Date: November 27, 1967

By: TC& f Liveal o

Jessica Underwood
Associate General Counsel

pate:  VLAM S2028

Attest:

'0N expires
prit 15
SSlon number 141 98-&3 -

Syl
Yivanig Assuciatiun of Notarieg

My Commission Expires: A/ [S/202.(

(date)

3000 GSK Drive » Moon Township, PA 15108 » 412.787.6700 e www.calgoncarbon.com



1 | ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE
| {ACH)

(ACH)
ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50%
{ SOLUTION
NSF 60/ANSI

: AMMONIA GAS 150-LBS. ! L8, |
| cvumper ~ _
AMMONIUM SULFATE . S048BS. ’ h
| maes
AMMONHUM SULFATE | 5001000
{409 SOLUTION) - GAL. deliveries |

!EAUST E£ 25‘ WME {2‘9‘%} Wers

CALCIQUEST ORTHO
{PHOSPHORIC ACID)

CALCIQUEST ORTHO
{PHOSPHORIC AQID)

11 | CALCIUM CHLORIDE

S R v




25% mﬁﬂﬁﬁ

~ CAUSTIC SODA -
25 % SOLUTION

- CAUSTIC SODA-
50% SOLUTION

-
50% SOLUTION

CHLORINE- DRY (HTH)

CHLORINE




' “CHLORINE

30 | CITRIC ACID 50%

31 | CITRICACID 50%

CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER

COPPER SULFATE
FINE # 30

 COPPER SULFATE - LARGE

b= Pyt T

g | * FERRIC CHLORIDE -
| FOREIGN: 32%-38%

. | . {A!gmm Bid}

:.-__.H' ! '“ ) ._ { * “ s : I_.-:-*_: 1 .

e ERITTI A"

it MaE T st B AT W

HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 2% |

HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% |

" HYDROGEN PEROXIDE =

 LIME [HYDRATED)

44 | UME SLURRY

. i s e

46 LIQUID OXYGEN

47 | LIQUID POLYMER
* CLARIFLOC 2427 OR EQUAL

T =
-8
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48 | LQUIDPOLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS |  BULK | Ny “] e

* | 85000R EQUAL)
49 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275GAL. | N | AL

G1 | MANGANESE GREENSANDPLUS |  BULK | _ —
| {atternate bid) | %

- - | DRUM L

MURIATIC ACID-20" BAUME | BULK .- ———
| {1,000 ~3,000} | NG |
— .a | GAL delivered
MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME SSGAL |

INHIBITED - NSF Certified DRUM N

MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME |  S2048S. [ < ’ —

———

MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME | 4, 1-GAL jugs

A i i, . e

MURIATIC ACID - 15%

58 |  MURIATICACID-20%

59 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME

mus 855& m;_}
| !{Mw 4500)
ORTHOPHOSPHATE
(CARUS 4500}

ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE
EA&UM OR mumg

| NEW ITEM |

0w




o ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE
. (30%-70% BLEND]
62 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE

| {10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND |

R

69 | POLYPHOSPHATE
[STERLING CP-23)

70 |  PHOSPHATE (LU} |
(SHANNON SU1 5225 OR CARUS
- " 8100} -

o T POLYMER
SNF POLYDYNECLARIFLOC

P C-379
7z | POLYMER (MANNICH] |
SHP POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 |

73 POLYMER Emmm
74 | POLYMER iﬁﬁmmq"
S SNF ?ﬂm:ma NE1921
75 POYMER [CATIONIC)
__ | SNFPOYOYNE NE-1922
76 | POLYMER

77 POLYMER
POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC ~C 6227 |
e 4 A e i et |
78 POLYMER

| SNF NE-1922
79 POLYMER |
| SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC GAC |

80

‘81 | POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE

: | {HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL)} |

82 | POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE |
(HOLLAND PCH 130 ar EQUAL) |

83 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE |
{HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL}

T TRTTE TS
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mymummm CHLORIDE

A e

OR EQUAL

A fm—-
e -t H a . P

| SMALL BULK | T WETLB,
z POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE-45% | 400 -1,000 \
' GAL. |

P T 1 Deliveries
87 LARGEBULK | . WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE-45% | 1,001-5000 | - '
e GAL. Deliveries

88 | I
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE -45% |  800—1.500 WET LB

GAL - shorter \ |

[—'—'-'_‘!"‘ e am— R delfve | ;1 |
89 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTES . Y e

s

90 | POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE-45% |  SS.-GAL | T WET LB,

. g TR |  DRUM
91 | POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE-45% |  15:GAL WET LB,
. - PAlls N\
97 mmsaaw Pmamm | ssaBS. | BET)

93
g4 | SANATE | sm ~ 1B.
{EOREIGN- Alternative Bid) | DRUM | 2l 2L o

95 | POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-8S. |
{FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) prum | 2 3T

QF | SODIUM ALUMINATE-38% BULK
{AWWA BADS — LATEST} |

| 97 |  SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK N 1 orvis.
N

{AWWA/NSF 60}
SODIUM BICARBONATE
[AWWA/NSF 60)

" SODIUM BICARBONATE |
(WASTEWATER )

o

el
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| ' SODIUM BICARBONATE
(WASTEWATER) \
SODIUM BISULFITE-
38% SOLUTION ™
.
kY
e T s
o o0 .
SODIUM CARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
~ SODA ASH- DENSE S |
SODIUM CHLORIDE 50 -LBS. DRY LB,
109 SODIUMCHLORITE~ |  BUL
| 25% SOLUTION - U.S. ONLY
110 | SODIUM CHLORITE-
SOLUTION — 1.5, ONLY
FOREIGN tam bid) N
112 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL. " WET LB,
FOREIGN (alternate bid) DRUM \,
113 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% BULK . WET LB,
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for N |
| _ Wastewater Use Only .= |
114 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25%
'l SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for | N
| Wastewater Use Oaly |
| 1E SODIUM CHUORITE — 55.GAL.
| (SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID] DRUM N\
116 | SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL |
E | US. ONLY | 40 BAG .
| PALLETS OF 50-
N B5.BAGS |

Ol
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M AN TN

 SODIUM FLUORIDE
U.S ONLY

| rultageas | " DRYLB.
| mmmw— \

LESS THAN FUI FULL | DRY LB.
40 BAG
MHS OF Sﬁv
SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG

FOREIGN | PALLETS OF 50-

imermtw Bid) | LBS BAGS

| S@Bmm ‘_.-' ISP 2

SODIUM FLUORIDE

FOREIGN
{Alternative Bid)

e e

| 121 | Sodiu 56
_E PRISTINE $K-?M1 | TOTES

| 122 | “SODIUM HWW | 250-GAL
133 SOOI R g —t
|  12.5% | PAILS ]

123A

124

125 | SODIUMHYPOCHLORME— | SMALL BULK

\
N
\
\
\
N
N\
N
15% | 400-1,000 | \ . WET LB. :
\
A\
\
\
\
N
A

126 | SODIUMHYPOCHIORE— | LARGE BULK
15% 1,001-7,000

WET LB.

'. mmmmmm_zm

WET LB,
WET LB.

WET.LB.

i £ 8
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133

NEW [TEM DRUM
134 | SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE 50-LBS
G BAGS
I 135 |  SODIUM THIOSULFATE 2.X6.
| (penta-hydrate} BAGS
136 SODIUM THIOSULFATE 55 - GAL.
B (30% SOLUTION) DRUM
| 137 SULFUR DIOXIDE
138 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275-GAL.
B _ {30%) ~ TOTES
139 ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE SO-LBS.
| [V-937 OR EQUAL BAGS
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL.
(V-970 OR EQUAL) TOTES
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE T BULK
(V-970 OR EQUAL
| 142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55-GAL.
| _BeUw
ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 50-LBS.
(CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL) PAILS
ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS DRUM
3180) '
ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL.
[SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTES
_ ngo) | ..
146 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE
L [CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL) PAILS
147 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK
{SL1-932 OR EQUAL)
148 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK {
_— ___{v-939 OR EQUAL} . |
146 ZINC ORTHOPHOQSPHATE BULK
| | {UPZ-511 OR EQUAL}
150 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK |
{CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL)
151 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK
{CARUS 3300 OR EQUAL}
ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE

. LT B e

NEMVYCC Official 8id Form and Signature Miﬁmm?)
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CAF Fmﬂmw LL£L..

Telephone: ?;gﬁ >C g Q Wﬁﬁgﬁ{ﬂﬁmswﬁﬁ

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium {NEMVCC) and our Host Community
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMYCC.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda: AA

SIgnature:

The addendum could state that if tariffs are implemented and g contract adjustment is needed.
vendaors must provide documentation (e.g.. importiexport data, supplier invoices, or government
larifY schedules) to prove the aciual impact. We should also clarify that only vérified increases
due to new tanf{ls, not general inflation or ether factors will be considered.

To Whom it May Concern:

in accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium mviting
propesals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, 1/we her eby certify
that | am/we are, the only person {s) interested in this proposal as principal{s); that it is made without

e 1 - 7 T T e f Bl e —
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collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the following prices.

Authorizing Signature

f -
?;'mt Name 3{1& Title of :ﬁu‘thﬂnzm E!Mre

| certify under the penalty of perjury that 1, to the best of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns
and paid all state taxes required under law.

*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name {Mandatary): —E&' . @

By: Corporate Officer (Mandatary, if Applicable):

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this i:ﬂﬂ:i ﬁmﬂn clause is signed
by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must plan to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be assigned to the

owner. The owner’s intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or guarantees as part
of the awarding procedure.

e Em r- s B e e T
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NORTHEAST/M ERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM
FISCAL YEAR 2026-2027
OFFICIAL BID FORM
DATE: 3/18/2026
VENDOR: Carbon Activated Corporation
NOTE: BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS BID FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PER
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15-GAL. _ GAL.
(ACH) PAILS No Bid
9 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000-GAL. No Bid GAL.
(ACH) BULK @ bl
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION (500 — 5,000 GALLON
NSF 60/ANSI GAL. deliveries) No Bid
A AMMONIA GAS 150-LBS. _ |B.
CYLINDER No Bid
5 AMMONIUM SULFATE 50-LBS. . DRY LB.
BAGS No Bid
6 AMMONIIUM SULFATE 500 —1,000 _ GAL.
(40% SOLUTION) GAL. deliveries No Bid
7 ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. _ CU.FT.
B AGE No Bid
Q AQUEOUS AMMONIA 1,000-GAL. No Bid GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries
9 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30-GAL. No Bid GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15-GAL. —_ GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM
BAGS

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2026-2027)
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1o CALCIUIM CHLORIDE SUPERSACK DRY LB.
No Bid
13 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/50 — 50 _ LBS
LBS. BAGS No Eid
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE LESS THAN _ LBS
PALLET - 50 LBS No Bid
BAGS
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. LBS
(Accu-Tab Blue S by Fillion PAILS No Bid
Associates)
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. _ LBS.
(Accu-Tab SI by Axiall LLC) PAILS No Bid
17 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery _ DRY LB.
(40/50 LBS. No Bid
bags)
18 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK NG Bid LB.
19 CARBON POWDERED BULK $ 2100 TON
20 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK ¢ 1.32 DRY LB.
Minimum 3x 1100 b
71 CAUSTIC SODA - SMALL BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 500 — 1,000 No Bid
GAL. deliveries
545 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001 — 5,000 No Bid
GAL. deliveries
e CAUSTIC SODA - 55-GAL. WET LB.
25% SOLUTION DRUM No Bid
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 275-GAL. _ WET LB.
25 % SOLUTION TOTES No Bid
75 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK WET LB.
50% SOLUTION 500 —-1,500 No Bid
GAL. deliveries
26 CAUSTIC SODA — LARGE BULK
50% SOLUTION 1,501 — 6,000 No Bid WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
27 CHLORINE- DRY (HTH) 50-LBS. _ DRY LB.
PAILS No Bid
CHLORINE 1 TON LB.
28 CYLINDER No Bid

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2026-2027)
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79 CHLORINE 150-LBS. | LB.
CYLINDER No Bid
30 CITRIC ACID 50% 250-GAL. _ WET LB.
TOTES o Bid
31 CITRIC ACID 50% 55-GAL. , WET LB.
DRUM No Bid
37 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 50-LBS. No Rid DRY LB.
BAGS/PALLET O bl
33 COPPER SULFATE 50-LBS. . DRY LB.
FINE # 30 BAGS No Bid
COPPER SULFATE - LBS. . .
34 UL LARGE SEALGBSS No Bid DRY LB
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK " DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 32%-38% No Bi
36 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK , DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38% No Bid
(Alternative Bid)
NEWATEM | GRANULARACTIVATED CARBON BULK DRY-LB.
e b
-29 CARBON-
REGENERATED
39 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK i i WET LB.
40 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 55-GAL. . WET LB.
DRUM No Bid
a1 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 270-GAL. | WET LB.
TOTES No Bld
— 0
49 HYDROGEN PEROXIDE — 27% BULK o B GALS.
43 LIME (HYDRATED) 50-LBS. BAGS | DRY LB.
2-ton min. No Bid
A4 LIME SLURRY BULK No Bid PER TON
45 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK No Bid GAL.
(<15 PPM THCQ)
46 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK i GAL.
(<40 PPM THC) No Bid
47 LIQUID POLYMER 275-GAL. No Bid GAL.
CLARIFLOC 2427 OR EQUAL TOTES

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Sighature Pages ( FY 2026-2027)
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48 LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS BULK _ WET LB.
8500 OR EQUAL) No Bid
49 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275-GAL. _ GAL.
TOTES No Bid
50 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK CU FT.
No Bid
51 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK , CU FT.
(alternate bid) No Bid
59 METHANOL (100%) 55-GAL. GAL.
DRUM No Bid
53 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME BULK GAL.
(1,000 - 3,000) No Bid
GAL. delivered
54 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55-GAL. NG B GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified DRUM o Bid
55 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 520-LBS. _ LB.
DRUM No Bid
56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 4, 1-GAL. jugs ‘ GAL
per box No Bid
=5, MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK GAL.
(300-350 GAL.) No Bid
58 MURIATIC ACID — 20% 15-GAL. . GAL.
CARBOY No Bid
59 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME | PUMPTED TOTE No Bid GAL.
(300-350 GAL.)
60 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50-LBS. No Bid LB.
(CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL) PAILS
£ ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. _ GAL.
(CARUS 4500) DRUM No Bid
=5, ORTHOPHOSPHATE 300-GAL.TOTE | GAL.
A (CARUS 4500) OR BULK No Bid
(300-500 GAL)
e ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK y LB.
(AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) (300-500 GAL.) No Bi
64 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. No Bid L B.
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM
65 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55-GAL.
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM No Bid LB.
(Aquamag or equal)
66 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. No Bid LB.
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2026-2027)
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67 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55-GAL. _ LB.
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM No Bid
68 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55-GAL. LB.
(10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM No Bid
69 POLYPHOSPHATE 340-LBS. No Bid LB.
(STERLING CP-33) DRUM
70 PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) 30-GAL. GAL.
(SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS DRUM No Bid
8100)
71 POLYMER 775 GAL GAL
SNF POLYDYNECLARIFLOC TOTES No Bid
C-379
79 POLYMER (MANNICH) BULK LB.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 No Bid
73 POLYMER (ANIONIC) 275-GAL. | GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTES No Bid
74 POLYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL. | GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTES No Bid
75 POYMER (CATIONIC) 275-GAL. | GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTES No Bid
76 POLYMER 55-GAL. GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM No Bid
77 POLYMER 450 LBS. GAL
POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC = C 6227 DRUMS No Bid
78 POLYMER 275-GAL. | GAL
SNF NE-1922 TOTES No Bid
79 POLYMER 55- GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIELOC GAC No Bid
C6287
30 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15-GAL. | WET LB.
0 NC} Bld
75% SOLUTION DRUM
21 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK _ GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) No Bid
37 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 375-GAL _ | GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) TOTES No Bid
Q3 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK | GAL.
No Bid

(HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL)

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2026-2027)
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4 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE
(HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK No Bid GAL.
EQUAL)
85 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE
(EPIC 58) BULK No Bid GAL.
OR EQUAL
26 SMALL BULK WET LB.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 400 —1,000 _
GAL No Bid
Deliveries
Q7 LARGE BULK WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE —45% | 1,001 — 5,000 No Bid
GAL. Deliveries
38 BULK
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 800 ~ 1,500 | WET LB
GAL.- shorter No Bid
wheelbase
delivery
89 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTES , WET LB.
No Bid
90 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 55-GAL. | WET LB.
DRUM No Bid
91 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 15-GAL. _ WET LB.
PAILS No Bid
97 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55-LBS. LB.
(U.S. ONLY) DRUM No Bid
03 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. . LB.
(U.S. ONLY) DRUM No Bid
94 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55-LBS. _ LB.
(FOREIGN- Alternative Bid) DRUM No Bid
05 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. LB.
(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) DRUM No Bid
96 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK _ WET LB.
(AWWA B405 — LATEST) No Bid
97 SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK _ DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) No Bid
98 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) Full Truckload No Bid
Release
99 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG _ DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER ) Full Truckload No Bid
Release

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2026-2027)
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100 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG . DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER) Per Pallet No Bid
101 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK . WET LB.
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL.+ No Bid
102 SODIUM BISULFITE- MINI-BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION < 800 GAL. No Bid
103 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55-GAL. WET LB
38% SOLUTION DRUM No Bid
104 SODIUM 50-LBS. BAGS DRY LB.
METABISULFITE (GRANULAR) 2 pallet No Bid
delivery.
105 SODIUM CARBONATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE BAGS No Bid
106 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE No Bid
107 SODIUM CARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE No Bid
108 SODIUM CHLORIDE | 50 -LBS. _ DRY | B.
109 SODIUM CHLORITE - BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY No Bid
110 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55-GAL. WET LB.
25% SOLUTION = U.S. ONLY DRUM No Bid
111 SODIUM CHLORITE - 25% BULK WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) No Bid
112 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL. WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) DRUM No Bid
113 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% BULK WET LB.
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for No Bid
Wastewater Use Only
114 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL. WET LB.
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for DRUM No Bid
Wastewater Use Only
115 SODIUM CHLORITE - 55-GAL. _ DRY LB.
(SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID) DRUM No Bid
116 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 40 BAG No Bid
PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2026-2027)
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117 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
U.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50- ;
LBS. BAGS No Bid
118 SODIUM ELUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG No Bid
(Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50- OBl
LBS. BAGS
119 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50- No Bid
(Alternative Bid) LBS. BAGS
120 SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. _ DRY LB.
No Bid
BAGS
121 Sodium Hexametaphosphate 275-GAL _ WET LB.
PRISTINE SK-7641 TOTES No Bid
122 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 250-GAL. WET LB.
5% TOTES No Bid
123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 5-GAL. WET LB.
12.5% PAILS No Bid
123A SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15-GAL. WET.LB.
12.5% PAILS No Bid
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 300-2,000 GAL. WET LB.
BULK No Bid
19K SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - SMALL BULK
15% 400 — 1,000 No Bid WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
176 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — LARGE BULK
15% 1,001 - 7,000 No Bid WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
127 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK
Certified Refrigerated Storage | (400-5,000 GAL. No Bid
and Delivery (Alternative Bid) deliveries) WET LB.
128 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 55-GAL. Bid WET LB.
DRUMS No Bi
129 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% 275-GAL. . WET.LB.
TOTES No Bid
130 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30-GAL. , WET LB.
CONTAINER No Bid
131 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15-GAL. | WET LB.
CONTAINER No Bid
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 5-GAL. . WET LB.
132 : No Bid
CONTAINER

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2026-2027)
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133 SODIUM PERMANGANATE 55-GAL. _ GAL.
NEW ITEM DRUM No Bia
134 SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE 50-LBS. | DRY LB.
BAGS No Bid
135 SODIUM THIOSULFATE 2-KG. | DRY KG.
(penta-hydrate) BAGS No Bid
136 SODIUM THIOSULFATE 55 - GAL _ GAL
(30% SOLUTION}) DRUM No Bid
137 SULFUR DIOXIDE BULK _ PER TON
No Bid
138 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275-GAL, _ PER GAL.
(30%) TOTES No Bid
139 ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. _ DRY LB.
(V-937 OR EQUAL BAGS No Bid
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL. No B WET. LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL) TOTES o Bid
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK No Bid WET LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL)
142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55-GAL. . WET LB.
DRUM No B|d
143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. _ DRY LB.
(CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL) PAILS No Bid
144 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS DRUM No Bid
3180)
145 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL. GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTES No Bid
3180)
146 ZINC ORTHOPHOQSPHATE 15-GAL. No Bid GAL
(CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL) PAILS o P
147 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK _ WET LB.
(SLI-932 OR EQUAL) No Bid
148 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK _ WET LB.
(V-939 OR EQUAL) No Bid
149 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK _ WET LB.
(UPZ-511 OR EQUAL} No Bid
150 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK No Bid WET LB.
(CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL) 05
151 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK No Bid GALLON
(CARUS 3300 OR EQUAL)
152 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK No Bid WET LB.
(SLI-939 OR EQUAL)
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| | Storage Tanker to support | | | A | bulk pumping
| , NO R |
; temporary on-site storage for | ~ and storage |
| utility that needs to repair | will support:
L | containmentvessel. | N S
PROPOSAL FROM:
. LCarbon Activated Corporation
2250 S. Central Ave.
Compton, CA 90220
Telephone: 310—885-45552 email: ISHAN@ACTIVATEDCARBON.COM

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium (NEMVCC) and our Host Community
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the fﬂ“? Addenda: C |

Sighature: u M

T'he addendum could state that if tariffs are implemented and a contract adjustment is needed,
vendors must provide documentation (e.g.. import/export data, supplier invoices. or government
tariff schedules) to prove the actual impact. We should also clarity that only verified increases
duc to new tariffs, not general inflation or other factors will be considered.

e,

To Whom it May Concern:

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, |/we hereby certify

that | am/we are, the only person (s} interested in this proposal as principal(s); that it is made without

T T TR TRy .~ i
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collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the following prices.

)
SIGNATURES /
M
i ¥

Authorizing Signature

I TR TESE e L - ool

Lionel Perera- President

I s SR - ] - —n -
T (= HE S an il S PTELER - ——rr A e LTS v T

Print Name and Title of Autﬁ;riziﬁg Signature

3/18/2026

L TP T W ARET s L o e T e R e i o B e ol e - (BT - - EEE— T

{);te

| certify under the penalty of perjury that |, to the best of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns
and paid all state taxes required under law.

*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name (Mandatm Carhgn Activated Corporation
»
By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable): , M - . |

i

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this certification clause is signed
by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must plan to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be assigned to the
owher. The owner’s intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or guarantees as part

of the awarding procedure.

. dra—— L e A S e Ty T e D LA S
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If tariffs are implemented and a contract adjustment is needed, vendors must
provide documentation (e.g., import/export data, supplier invoices, or government
tariff schedules) to prove the actual impact, Qnly verified increases due to new
tariffs, not general inflagion actors—will be considered.

Signature

—_ L T T T A

Date

SR PR —

3/18/2026
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NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM

FISCAL YEAR 2026-2027
OFFICIAL BID FORM - ADDENDUM |

DATE: March 18, 2026
VENDOR: |Carus LLC
NOTE: BiD PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS BID FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PER
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15-GAL. GAL.
(ACH) PAILS NO BID
2 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000-GAL. GAL.
(ACH) BULK NO BID
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK NO BID
SOLUTION (500 — 5,000 GALLON
NSF 60/ANSI GAL. deliveries)
4 AMMONIA GAS 150-LBS. LB.
CYLINDER  [NO BID
5 AMMONIUM SULFATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS NO BID
6 AMMONIUM SULFATE 500 -1,000 GAL.
(40% SOLUTION) GAL. deliveries (NO BID
7 ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. CU.FT.
BAGS NO BID
8 AQUEOUS AMMONIA 1,000-GAL. GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries NO BID
g CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30-GAL. GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM NO BID
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15-GAL. GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM NO BID
11 CALCIUM CHLORIDE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS NO BID
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12 SALCIUM-CHLORIDE SHRERSALK BRY-LB-
NO BID
13 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/S0 - 50 LBS
LBS. BAGS
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE LESS THAN NO BID LBS
PALLET - 50 LBS
BAGS
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. NO BID LBS
(Accu-Tab Blue Sl by Fillion PAILS
Associates)
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. LBS.
(Accu-Tab Sl by Axiall LLC) PAILS NO BID
17 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery | NO BID DRY LB.
(40/50 LBS.
bags)
18 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK LB.
_ NO BID
19 CARBON POWDERED BULK TON
NO BID
20 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK DRY LB.
NO BID
21 CAUSTIC SODA - SMALLBULK |NO BID WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 500 -1,000
GAL. deliveries
29 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK | NO BID WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001 -5,000
GAL. deliveries
23 CAUSTIC SODA - 55-GAL. WET LB.
25% SOLUTION DRUM NO BID
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 275-GAL. WET LB.
25 % SOLUTION TOTES NO BID
25 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALLBULK | NO BID WET LB.
50% SOLUTION 500 -1,500
GAL. deliveries
26 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK | NO BID
50% SOLUTION 1,501 - 6,000 WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
27 CHLORINE- DRY (HTH) 50-LBS. DRY LB.
PAILS NO BID
28 CHLORINE 1 TON LB.
CYLINDER NO BID
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29 CHLORINE 150-LBS. LB.
CYLINDER NO BID
30 CITRIC ACID 50% 250-GAL. WET LB.
TOTES NO BID
31 CITRIC ACID 50% 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUM NO BID
32 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS/PALLET |NO BID
33 COPPER SULFATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
FINE # 30 BAGS NO BID
34 COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS NO BID
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 32%-38% NO BID
26 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK NO BID DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38%
(Alternative Bid)
NEWLTEM | GRANULARACTIVATED CARBON BULK BB
~Df NO BID
ANERLITEM GRANUARACHVMATED BiHA NO BID BRY-LB-
-32 SARBOR-
REGENERATED
39 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK WET LB.
NO BID
40 HYDROFLUQSILICIC ACID- 24% 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUM NO BID
41 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 270-GAL. WET LB.
TOTES NO BID
42 HYDROGEN PEROXIDE - 27% BULK GALS.
NO BID
43 LIME (HYDRATED) 50-LBS. BAGS DRY LB.
2-ton min. NO BID
44 LIME SLURRY BULK PER TON
NO BID
45 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
(<15 PPM THC) |NO BID
46 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
(<40 PPM THC) |NO BID
47 LIQUID POLYMER 275-GAL. GAL
CLARIFLOC 2427 OR EQUAL TOTES NO BID
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LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS BULK WET LB.
43 ( 0.87/b
8500 OR EQUAL)
49 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275-GAL. GAL.
TOTES NO BID
50 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK CU FT.
NO BID
51 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK CU FT.
(alternate bid) NO BID
£S5 METHANOL (100%) 55-GAL. GAL.
DRUM NO BID
53 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME BULK GAL.
(1,000 - 3,000)
GAL. delivered [NO BID
54 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55-GAL. GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified DRUM NO BID
55 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 520-LBS. LB.
DRUM NO BID
75 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 4, 1-GAL. jugs GAL
per box NO BID
57 MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK GAL.
(300-350 GAL.) |NO BID
58 MURIATIC ACID - 20% 15-GAL. GAL.
CARBOY NO BID
59 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME | PUMPTED TOTE GAL.
(300-350 GAL.) |NO BID
60 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50-LBS. LB.
(CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL) PAILS NO BID
61 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. GAL.
(CARUS 4500) DRUM NO BID
62 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 300-GAL.TOTE | 10.12/qal GAL.
iR e (CARUS 4500) OR BULK
(300-500 GAL)
53 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK LB.
(AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) (300-500 GAL.) |0.87/Ib
64 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. LB.
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM $1.03/Ib
65 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55-GAL. $1.66/1b
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM LB.
(Aquamag or equal)
66 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. LB.
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM $1.06/Ib
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LB.

67 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55-GAL.
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM $1.06/Ib
68 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55-GAL. NO BID LB.
(10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM
69 POLYPHOSPHATE 340-LBS. LB.
(STERLING CP-33) DRUM NO BID
70 PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) 30-GAL. NO BID GAL.
(SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS DRUM
8100)
71 POLYMER 275 GAL NO BID GAL
SNF POLYDYNECLARIFLOC TOTES
C-379
79 POLYMER (MANNICH) BULK LB.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 NO BID
93 POLYMER (ANIONIC) 275-GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTES NO BID
74 POLYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTES NO BID
75 POYMER (CATIONIC) 275-GAL. GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTES NO BID
76 POLYMER 55-GAL. NO BID GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM
77 POLYMER 450 LBS. GAL
POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC - C6227 DRUMS NO BID
78 POLYMER 275-GAL. GAL
SNF NE-1922 TOTES NO BID
70 POLYMER 55- GAL. NO BID GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC GAC
(6287
70A POLYMER 55-LBS. LBS.
NEW ITEM CLARIFLOC NE-2008 BAG NO BID
0 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15-GAL. WET LB.
75% SOLUTION DRUM NO BID
{1 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) NO BID
Q9 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275-GAL . GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) TOTES NO BID
Q3 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK NO BID GAL.
(HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL)
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4 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE NO BID
(HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK GAL.
EQUAL)
q5 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE NO BID
(EPIC 58) BULK GAL.
OR EQUAL
86 SMALLBULK | NO BID WET LB.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 400 -1,000
GAL.
Deliveries
Q7 LARGE BULK | NO BID WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 1,001 - 5,000
GAL. Deliveries
S8 BULK NO BID
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 800 - 1,500 WET LB
GAL.- shorter
wheelbase
delivery
89 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTES WET LB.
NO BID
S0 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUM NO BID
01 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 15-GAL. WET LB.
PAILS NO BID
9?2 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55-LBS. LB.
(U.S. ONLY) DRUM NO BID
03 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. LB.
(U.S. ONLY) DRUM NO BID
94 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55-LBS. LB.
(FOREIGN- Alternative Bid) DRUM NO BID
05 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. LB.
(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) DRUM NO BID
06 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK WET LB.
(AWWA B405 — LATEST) NO BID
Q7 SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) NO BID
08 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG | NO BID DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) Full Truckload
Release
0g SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG | NO BID Dﬁ“f LB.
" (WASTEWATER ) Full Truckload
Release
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100 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER) Per Pallet NO BID
101 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL+ |NO BID
102 SODIUM BISULFITE- MINI-BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION < 800 GAL. NO BID
103 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55-GAL. WET LB.
38% SOLUTION DRUM NO BID
184 SODHIM 36-HS—BAGS | NO BID DRY LB.
METABISULRITE(GRANULAR) 2 pallet
delm‘. r
105 SODIUM CARBONATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE BAGS NO BID
106 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE NO BID
107 SODIUM CARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE NO BID
108 SODIUM CHLORIDE 50 -LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS NO BID
109 SODIUM CHLORITE - BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY NO BID
110 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55-GAL. WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY DRUM NO BID
111 SODIUM CHLORITE = 25% BULK WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) NO BID
112 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL. NO BID WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) DRUM
113 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% BULK NO BID WETLB.
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for
Wastewater Use Only
114 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% C5-GAL. NO BID WET LB.
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for DRUM
Wastewater Use Only
115 SODIUM CHLORITE — 55-GAL. DRY LB.
(SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID) DRUM NO BID
116 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL | NO BID DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 40 BAG
PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS
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117 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG NO BID DRY LB
U.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS
118 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL | NO BID DRY LB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG
(Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS
119 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL40BAG | NO BID DRY LB.
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50-
(Alternative Bid) LBS. BAGS
120 SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. DRY I B.
BAGS NO BID
121 Sodium Hexametaphosphate 275-GAL WET LB.
PRISTINE SK-7641 TOTES $0.99/Ib
122 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 250-GAL. WET LB.
5% TIES NO RBID
123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 5-GAL. WET LB.
12.5% PAILS NO BID
123A SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15-GAL. WET.LB.
12.5% PAILS NO BID
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 300-2,000 GAL. WET LB.
BULK NO BID
125 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - SMALLBULK | NO BID
15% 400 - 1,000 WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
126 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — LARGE BULK [ NO BID
15% 1,001 - 7,000 WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
127 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK NO BID
Certified Refrigerated Storage | (400-5,000 GAL.
and Delivery (Alternative Bid) deliveries) WET LB.
128 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUMS NO BID
129 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% 275-GAL. WET.LB.
TOTES NO BID
130 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30-GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER  |NO RID
131 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15-GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER  |NO BID
139 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 5-GAL. ' WET LB.
CONTAINER  [NO BID
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133 SODIUM PERMANGANATE 55-GAL. GAL.
NEW ITEM DRUM NO BID
134 SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS NO BID
135 SODIUM THIOSULFATE 2-KG. DRY KG.
(penta-hydrate) BAGS NO BID
136 SODIUM THIOSULFATE 55 - GAL GAL
(30% SOLUTION) DRUM NO BID
137 SULFUR DIOXIDE BULK PER TON
NO BID
138 THIOSULPHATE ~ CALCIUM 275-GAL. PER GAL.
(30%) TOTES NO BID
139 ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
(V-S37 OR EQUAL BAGS NO BID
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL. WET. LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL) TOTES $1.14/lb
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL) $1.14/Ib
142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55-GAL, WET LB.
DRUM NO BID
143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
(CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL) PAILS NO BID
144 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. NO BID GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS DRUM
3180)
145 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL. NO BID GAL,
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTES
3180)
146 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 15-GAL. GAL
(CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL) PAILS NO BID
147 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(SLI-532 OR EQUAL) $0.60/1b
148 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB,
(V-939 OR EQUAL) $0.68/Ib
149 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(UPZ-511 OR EQUAL) $0.69/1b
150 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL) $2.39/Ib
151 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK GALLON
(CARUS 3300 OR EQUAL) $7.70/gal
159 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(SLI-939 OR EQUAL) $0.81/Ib
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153 Emergency Pumping and Daily Fee: No BID Chemicals that
Storage Tanker to support bulk pumping
temporary on-site storage for and storage
utility that needs to repair will support:
containment vessel.

PROPOSAL FROM:
Carus LLC
315 Fifth Street
Peru, IL 61354
Telephone: 800-435-6856 email: bids@caruslic.com

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium (NEMVCC) and our Host Community

reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda: Addendum 1

7o . Cocntan

Todd H. Courter /CCO Chief Commercial Officer

Signature:

The addendum could state that if tariffs are implemented and a contract adjustment is needed,

vendors must provide documentation (e.g., import/export data, supplier invoices, or government
tarifl schedules) to prove the actual impact. We should also clarify that only verified increases
due to new tariffs, not general inflation or other factors will be considered.

To Whom it May Concern:

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, |/we hereby certify
that | am/we are, the only person (s) interested in this proposal as principal(s); that it is made without

S e s
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collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the following prices.

SIGNATURES
7oA }?3/ Corntan

Authorizing Signature

Todd H. Courter /CCO Chief Commercial Officer
Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

March 18, 2026
Date

| certity under the penalty of perjury that I, to the best of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns

and paid all state taxes required under law.
7?54{%/ Corntan

*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name (Mandatory):

By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable): Todd H. Courter /CCO Chief Commercial Officer

“Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this certification clause is sighed
by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the

warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must plan to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be assigned to the
owner. The owner’s intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or guarantees as part

of the awarding procedure.
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If tariffs are implemented and a contract adjustment is needed, vendors must
provide documentation (e.g., import/export data, su pplier invoices, or government

tariff schedules) to prove the actual impact. Only verified increases due to new
tariffs, not general inflation or other factors—will be considered.

Signature 7;54%(?’/}( Contan

T{:.'E:! H. Courter /CCO Chief Commercial Officer
Date March 18, 2026

z - B 8 e e s i 1 = il e e i i s Er—
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EXHIBIT 1

CONDY HOLDINGS LL.C
AUTHORIZATION LEVELS — 10 December 2025 #%*

REVENUE
TITLE CONTRACTS*
*

Chairman $35,000,000
Chief Executive Officer & President * $5,000,000
Sr. Vice President, CFO * $3,000,000
Vice President, Operations -

CHRO, Chief Human Resources Officer ~
CCO, Chief Commercial Officer $1,500,000

VP, Mergers & Acquisitions & Product -
Management
VP, Finance -
Director, Global Strategic Sourcing -

Supply Chain Director -
M.B. Carus Fellow, Technology -

Project Manager
LaSalle Plant Manager -

Bus. Director, Manganese Specialties -
IT Director -
Director of Sales $1,000,000
Product Management Director $500,000
Product Marketing Manager $500,000
Director of EHSS -
Inside Sales Manager $200,000

NOTES:

*ANY COMMITMENT FOR THE PURCHASE OR LEASE OF GOODS OR SERVICES IN EXCESS OF
A 12-MONTH PERIOD MUST BE APPROVED BY THE CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICER & PRESIDENT

OR CFO OF CONDY HOLDINGS LLC.

**ANY CONTRACT OR BID THAT IS EFFECTIVE FOR LONGER THAN ONE YEAR, REGARDLESS
OF REVENUE VOLUME, REQUIRES THE SIGNATURE OF THE CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICER &

PRESIDENT OR CFO OF CONDY HOLDINGS LLC.

ANY CONTRACT OR BID THAT IS EFFECTIVE FOR MORE THAN ONE YEAR IS SUBJECT TO AN
ANNUAL PRICE REVIEW, REGARDLESS OF ESCALATION CLAUSES.

***THE APPROVALS AUTHORIZED HEREIN SHALL APPLY WITH EQUAL EFFECT TO ALL

AFFILIATE COMPANIES OF CONDY HOLDINGS LLC (i.e., CARUS LLC, ALLIANCE TRANSPORT
LLC, CARUS EFTB, CARUS CHEMICAL COMPANY, CARUS EUROPE SOCIEDAD LIMITADA,

CARUS BV, LTD.).




‘ C_ ARILIS®

Carus LLC
315 5th Street
Peru, IL 61354

CARUS PRODUCT WARRANTY STATEMENT

NO MATERIAL SHALL BE RETURNED WITHOUT PRIOR WRITTEN

INSTRUCTIONS FROM CARUS LLC CUSTOMER SERVICE
DEPARTMENT.

We hereby certify that these goods were produced in compliance with all
applicable requirements of Section 6, 7, and 12 of the Fair Labor Standards
Act, as amended, and of regulations and orders of the United States

Department of Labor under Section 14 thereof and to meet specifications.

Carus warrants that products delivered meet our standard specification for the
material. If the product is not compliant with our specifications, the product
will be replaced. It is the responsibility of the buyer to ensure that product

storage and handling is in compliance with product specification sheets.

7o 7. Cowntan

Todd H. Courter /CCQO Chief Commercial Officer
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OFFICERS

Carus LLC
OFFICERS

Inga Carus — Chairman, Assistant Secretary
Andy Johnston — President, CEO

M. Chryss Crockett — SR Vice President, Chief Financial Officer, Treasurer
Amy Berggren — Assistant Secretary
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I, Amy Berggren, do hereby certify that I am a duly elected, qualified and acting Assistant

Secretary of Condy Holdings LLC, a Delaware LLC, and as such have custody of the corporate
records and seal.

I hereby further certify that the following resolutions were duly adopted by Unanimous
Consent of the Board of Managers of Condy Holdings LLC effective 10 December 2025 and are

still 1n full force and effect as of the date below pertaining to persons authorized to act for Condy
Holdings LLC and its member companies, including Carus LLC.

WHEREAS, the Board desires to grant to certain Company officers and managers specific

spending authority necessary to the day-to-day performance of their respective functions (Exhibit
] attached hereto; and

IT IS RESOLVED, that the Board hereby approves, for the purpose of signing sales
contracts, municipal bids, purchase requisitions, capital expenditures, raw material supply
contracts, and other day-to-day contracts and obligations of the Company, the officer and

manager spending authorizations included in the “CONDY HOLDINGS LLC
AUTHORIZATION LEVELS — 10 December 2025.” attached hereto as Exhibit 1.

In witness whereof I have hereunto set my hand as Assistant Secretary of Condy Holdings
LLConthis__ /%™ _dayof __ [V )/Cj _ 2026.
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